
 

 

 
    Created: 2022-02-07 11:52:33 [EST] 

(Supp. No. 2, Update 1) 

 
Page 1 of 3 

APPENDIX G 

Greeley Municipal Code Chapter Sec. 22-306 is amended as follows (additions indicated by 

underline; deletions indicated by strikethrough): 

 

Sec. 22-306. International Plumbing Code adopted. 

 

The International Plumbing Code, 2018 2021 edition, is hereby adopted by reference for the city, except 
as amended in this chapter, and is hereinafter referred to as the "plumbing code." The building code is 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, CA 90601-2298. 
The plumbing code provides the standards for erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, 

replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems within this jurisdiction. The 

provisions of this code shall apply to the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, 

replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems within this jurisdiction. This 

code shall regulate nonflammable medical gas, inhalation anesthetic, vacuum piping, nonmedical 

oxygen systems and sanitary and condensate vacuum collection systems. The installation of fuel gas 

distribution piping and equipment, fuel-gas-fired water heaters and water heater venting systems 

shall be regulated by the International Fuel Gas Code. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply 

unless specifically adopted. 

Sec. 22-307. Additions, deletions and amendments to plumbing code designated. 

Sections 106.6.3 109.5, 108.4 115.4, 108.5, 109 114, 305.4, 405.3.1, 405.6, 406.2, 414.2 417.2, 

417.4 421.4 417.4 421.4 Exception, 712.4.2, 712.4.3, Table 906.1, Table 909.1, 914.1, 915.3, 918.3, 

1003.3.4.1  1003.3.5.1, 1103.1, 1113.1.2, and 1113.1.3 of the plumbing code are hereby enacted as 

amended, added or deleted to read as set out in sections 22-308 through 22-329.  

Sec. 22-308. Section 106.6.3 109.5 amended; fee refunds. 

Sec. 106.6.3 109.5 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

106.6.3 109.5 Fee refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows:  

a. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.  

b. Not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a 

permit issued in accordance with this code.  

c. Not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for 

which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review 

effort has been expended.  

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid more than 180 days from the date 

of fee payment.  

Sec. 22-309. Section 108.4 115.4 amended; violation penalties. 

Sec. 108.4 115.4 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

108.4 115.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 

fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair 

plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, 

or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be punishable pursuant to 



 

 

 
    Created: 2022-02-07 11:52:33 [EST] 

(Supp. No. 2, Update 1) 

 
Page 2 of 3 

chapter 10 of title 1 of this Code. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been 

served shall be deemed a separate offense.  

 

 



 

 

 
    Created: 2022-02-07 11:52:33 [EST] 

(Supp. No. 2, Update 1) 

 
Page 3 of 3 

Sec. 22-310. Section 108.5 amended; stop-work orders. 

Sec. 108.5 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official, work on any plumbing system that 

is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall 

immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, or 

to the owner's agent or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under 

which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be 

required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.  

Sec. 22-311. Section 109 114 amended; means of appeal. 

Sec. 109 114 of the plumbing code shall be as described in sections 22-40 and 22-41.  

Sec. 22-316. Section 414.2 417.2 amended; waste connection. 

Sec. 417.2 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

417.2 Waste connection. Garbage can washers shall be located only in weather-tight enclosures 

and shall be trapped separately. The receptacle receiving the waste from the washer shall have a 

removable basket or strainer to prevent the discharge of large particles into the drainage system.  

Sec. 22-317. Section 417.4 421.4 amended; shower compartments. 

Sec. 421.4 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

421.4 Shower compartments. All shower compartments shall have a minimum of 1,024 square 

inches (0.66 m2 ) of interior cross-sectional area. Shower compartments shall not be less than 32 

inches (813 mm) in minimum dimension measured from the finished interior dimension of the 

compartment, exclusive of fixture valves, showerheads, soap dishes, and safety grab bars or rails. 

Except as required in section 404, the minimum required area and dimension shall be measured from 

the finished interior dimension at a height equal to the top of the threshold and at a point tangent to 

its centerline and shall be continued to a height not less than 70 inches (1,778 mm) of this section 

the shower drain outlet.  

Sec. 22-318. Section 417.4 421.4 deleted; exception, shower compartments. 

Sec. 421.4, Exception, of the plumbing code is deleted in its entirety.  

Sec. 22-326. Section 1003.3.4.1 1003.3.5.1 amended; grease interceptor capacity. 

Sec. 1003.3.4.1 1003.3.5.1 of the plumbing code shall be amended to read as follows:  

1003.3.4.1 1003.3.5.1 Grease interceptor capacity. Grease interceptors shall be sized as per Table 

1003.3.4.1. 1003.3.5.1 

Sec. 22-329. Section 1113.1.3 amended; electrical. 

Sec. 1113.1.3 of the plumbing code is amended to read as follows:  

1113.1.3 Electrical. A 125-volt, 15-ampere, GFCI-protected, electrical receptacle outlet shall be 

installed within five feet 18 inches (457 mm) of the sump pit location. The branch circuit feeding this 

outlet shall be a dedicated circuit. 

 


