
APPENDIX B 

Greeley Municipal Code Chapter Sec. 22-76 is amended as follows (additions indicated by 

underline; deletions indicated by strikethrough): 

 

Sec. 22-76. International Residential Code adopted. 

 

The International Residential Code, 2018 2021  edition, is hereby adopted by reference for the city, 

except as amended in this chapter, and is hereinafter referred to as the "residential code." The residential 

code is published by the International Code Council, Inc., 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, CA 

90601-2298. The residential code provides the standards for the design, erection, construction, 

enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment, use, 

height, area and maintenance of one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses. The provisions of this 

code shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, 

equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of detached one- and two-family 

dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate 

means of egress and their accessory structures not more than three stories above grade plane in 

height. 

Sec. 22-77. Additions, deletions and amendments to residential code designated. 

Sections R105.2 (1), R108.3, R108.5, R108.6, R108.7, R109.4, R112, R113.1, R113.4, Table 

R301.2(1), R302.3, R302.3(2), Table R302.6, R302.7, R302.11(3), R310.1, R310.5, R311.3.2, R328 

R331, R405.2.3.1, R506.3, M1801.1, G2412.9, G2412.10, G2415.9, G2415.12, G2417.4.1, G2417.4.2, 

G2425.8(7), G2445, P2603.5, P2705.1(5), P2708.1, P2708.1(2), P2718.1, P2904.3.1, P2904.8.1, 

P2904.8.1(6), Table 3005.4.1, P3005.4.2, Table 3005.4.2, 3007.6, Table P3105.1, P3107.3, Table 

P3107.3, P3108.3, Table P3108.3, P3109.4, Table P3109.4, P3110.1, P3114.3, Table P3201.7 and Part 

VIII of the residential code are hereby enacted as amended, added or deleted to read as set out in sections 

22-78 through 22-131.  

Sec. 22-83. Section R109.4 amended; approval required. 

Sec. R109.4 of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

R109.4 Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each 

successive inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building 

official, upon notification, shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate the portion 

of the construction that is satisfactory as completed, or notify the permit holder or his agent wherein 

the same fails to comply with this code. Any portions that do not comply shall be corrected and such 

portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the building official. There shall be a 

final inspection and approval of all systems, buildings, and structures, when completed and ready for 

occupancy and/or use. When applicable, final occupancy shall not occur until a Certificate of 

Occupancy has been released. 

Sec. 22-87.5 Section R302.3 amended; two-family dwellings. 

Sec. R302.3 of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

R302.3 Two-family dwellings. Dwelling units in two-family dwellings shall be separated from each 

other by wall and floor assemblies having not less than a 1-hour fire-resistance rating where tested in 

accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.2.2 of the International Building Code. Such 

separation shall be provided regardless of whether a lot line exists between the two dwelling units or 

not. Fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight against the 



exterior wall, and wall assemblies shall extend from the foundation to the underside of the roof 

sheathing. Each dwelling unit shall be structurally independent 

Sec. 22-88. - Section R302.3 exception (2) deleted; two-family dwellings. 

Sec. R302.3 Exception (2) of the residential code is deleted in its entirety. 

Sec. 22-91. Section R302.11(3) amended; fireblocking. 

Sec. R302.11(3) of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

(13) In concealed spaces between stair stringers at the top and bottom of the run, and between studs 

along, and in line with the run of stairs. Enclosed spaces under stairs shall comply with section 

R302.7.  

Sec. 22-93. Section R310.5 amended; emergency escape windows under decks and porches. 

Sec. R310.5 of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

R310.5 Emergency escape windows under decks, porches and cantilevers. Emergency escape 

windows are allowed to be installed under decks, porches and cantilevers provided the location 

allows the emergency escape window to be fully opened and provides a path not less than 36 inches 

(914 mm) in height to a yard or court.  

Sec. 22-96. Section R327 R331 added; electric fences. 

Sec. R328 R331 of the residential code is added in its entirety to read as follows:  

Sec. R328 R331 Electric fences. 

R328.1 R331.1 Definition. For the purposes of this section, any fence using, carrying or 

transmitting an electrical current for any purpose is considered an electric fence.  

R328.2 R331.2 Permit required. In all cases, electric fences will require approval, and a 

building permit. All electrical components must be listed and labeled, by a nationally 

recognized independent testing agency, and installations must be made per the manufacturer's 

specifications, and the listing requirements.  

R328.3 R331.3 Signs. Permanent signs stating "DANGER, ELECTRIC FENCE" must be 

installed on or around the fence, as deemed necessary by the building inspection division.  

R328.4 R331.4  Location. All electric fences must be installed inside a non-electric fence, 

placed so as to prevent accidental contact from the outside. This subsection does not apply to 

approved agricultural uses.  

R328.5  R331.5 Existing fences. Any existing electric fence identified after the adoption 

of this code that does not conform to these requirements, shall have 60 days from the date of 

identification of the fence to come into compliance with these requirements, or the electric 

fence shall be removed.  

Sec. 22-98. Section R405.2.3.1 added; electrical. 

Sec. R405.2.3.1 of the residential code is added to read as follows:  

R405.2.3.1 Electrical. A 125-volt, 15-ampere, GFCI-protected, electrical receptacle outlet shall 

be installed within five feet 18 inches (457 mm) of the sump pit location. The branch circuit feeding 

this outlet shall be a dedicated circuit.  



Sec. 22-100. Section M1801.1 amended; venting required. 

Sec. M1801.1 of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

M1801.1 Venting required. Fuel-burning appliances shall be vented to the outside in 

accordance with their listing and label and manufacturer's installation instructions. Venting systems 

shall consist of approved chimneys or vents, or venting assemblies that are integral parts of labeled 

appliances. Gas-fired appliances shall be vented in accordance with title Chapter 24 of this Code. 

Sec. 22-110. Section P2705.1(5) amended; general. 

Sec. P2705.1(5) of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

P2705.1 General. 

a. 5 Water closets, lavatories and bidets. A water closet, lavatory or bidet shall not be set closer 

than 15 inches (381 mm) from its center to any side wall, partition or vanity or closet, or not 

less than 15 inches (381 mm) from the centerline of a bidet to the outermost rim of an 

adjacent water closet, or closer than 30 inches (762 mm) center-to-center between adjacent 

fixtures. There shall be at least a 24 inch (610 mm) clearance in front of the water closet, 

lavatory or bidet to any wall, fixture or door.  

Sec. 22-116. P2904.8.1 amended; preconcealment inspection. 

Sec. P2708.1 of the residential code is amended to read as follows:  

P2904.8.1 Preconcealment inspection. 

a. 1 Piping is supported in accordance with the pipe manufacturers and sprinkler manufacturers 

installation instructions.  

b. 2 The piping system is tested in accordance with section P2503.7.  

 

 


