APPENDIX C

Greeley Municipal Code Chapter Sec. 22-161 is amended as follows (additions indicated by
underline; deletions indicated by strikethrough):

Sec. 22-161. International Mechanical Code adopted.

The International Mechanical Code, 2618 2021 edition, is hereby adopted by reference for the city,
except as amended in this chapter, and is hereinafter referred to as the "mechanical code.” The mechanical
code is published by the Internatlonal Code CounC|I Inc 5360 Workman M|II Road Whlttler CA
90601-2298. , ,
mspeeﬂonof—meeh&meal—s&stems%w{—hm%ﬂ%dw&oﬁ Thls code shaII requlate the de5|qn
installation, maintenance, alteration and inspection of mechanical systems that are permanently
installed and utilized to provide control of environmental conditions and related processes within
buildings. This code shall also requlate those mechanical systems, system components, equipment
and appliances specifically addressed herein. The installation of fuel gas distribution piping and
eguipment, fuel gas-fired appliances and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems shall be requlated
by the International Fuel Gas Code.

Sec. 22-162. Additions, deletions and amendments to mechanical code designated.

Sections 406.5.3 109.6, 468:4 115.4, 1685, 109 114, 202, 312.1, and 506.3.11 Exception, of the
mechanical code are hereby enacted as amended, added or deleted to read as set out in sections 22-163
through 22-169.

Sec. 22-163. Section 106-5-3 109.6 amended; fee refunds.

Sec. 106.5.3 109.6 of the mechanical code is amended to read as follows:
106.5:3 109.6 Fee refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows:
a.  The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

b.  Not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a
permit issued in accordance with this code.

c.  Not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for
which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan review
effort has been expended.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid more than 180 days from the
date of fee payment.

Sec. 22-164. Section 1084 115.4 amended; violation penalties.

Sec. 1084 115.4 of the mechanical code is amended to read as follows:

108-4 115.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be punishable
pursuant to chapter 10 of title 1 of this Code. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Created: 2022-02-07 11:52:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 2, Update 1)

Page 1 of 2



Sec. 22-166. Section 109 114 amended; means of appeals.
Sec. 109 114 of the mechanical code shall be as described in sections 22-40 and 22-41.

Created: 2022-82-87 11:52:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 2, Update 1)

Page 2 of 2



