Tom Pagel

From: Tom Pagel

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 3:23 PM
To: Chad Sterle; Matt Wegwerth, PE
Subject: RE: Roberts Property Purchase
Chad/Matt;

Please see below. | found the email.

Tom Pagel | City Administrator

City of Grand Rapids
tpagel@grandrapidsmn.gov
cityofgrandrapidsmn.com

Office: 218-326-7626 * Fax: 218-326-7608

From: Tom Pagel

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2024 10:37 AM

To: Chad Sterle <csterle@sterlelaw.com>; Matt Wegwerth, PE <mwegwerth@grandrapidsmn.gov>
Subject: Roberts Property Purchase

Chad/Matt;

| have agreed to pay for an appraisal as part of the closing costs with Mr. Roberts. He needs this appraisal to get
his mortgage company to agree.

Tom Pagel | City Administrator

City of Grand Rapids
tpagel@grandrapidsmn.gov
cityofgrandrapidsmn.com

Office: 218-326-7626 * Fax: 218-326-7608




