City of Grand Prairie, TX

RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles

Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford

Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC

Rockdale, TX

Stephenville, TX

Estimated Estimated
Line# Description Qty UOM List Price Dls;;):;’tlon Price after Discount D?:;[‘;:g c[’;p]f)?:h List Price Dlsl\c/;):;letlon P];;Z:ﬂf:letr Dfi;[‘;:z; :jfplz:Ch
Receipt of PO Receipt of PO
Escape FWD, UOF
1
1 EA $ 28,150.00 0.02 $27,587.00 180
Escape AWD, U9F
2
1 EA $ 29,550.00 0.02 $28,959.00 180
Escape PHEV
3 |(Hybrid) FWD, UOE
1 EA $ 38,400.00 0.02 $37,632.00 180
Edge SE AWD, K4G
4
1 EA $ - 0.00 $0.00{NO BID
Explorer RWD, K7D
5
1 EA $  39,855.00 0.02 $39,057.90 180
Explorer 4WD, K8D
6 NON RESPONSIVE
1 EA $ 41,855.00 0.02 $41,017.90 180
Expedition 2WD,
7 |UIH
1 EA $  59,695.00 0.02 $58,501.10 180
Expedition 4WD, U1J
8
1 EA $  62,695.00 0.02 $61,441.10 180
Expedition Max 2WD,
9 |KIH
1 EA $  62,695.00 0.02 $61,441.10 180
Expedition Max 4WD,
10 |K1J
1 EA $  65,695.00 0.02 $64,381.10 180
Mustang Mach-E
11 |RWD, KIR
1 EA $  39,995.00 0.02 $39,195.10 180
Mustang Mach-E
12 |AWD, K1S
1 EA $ 43,495.00 0.02 $42,625.10 180
Mustand Mach-E
13 |AWD, K4S
1 EA $  54,995.00 0.02 $53,895.10 180
F-150 Lightning Pro,
14 |WIB
1 EA $ 47,780.00 0.02 $46,824.40 180
Ranger 2WD
15 [SuperCrew 5' Box,
R4B 1 |EA $  32,980.00 0.02 $32,320.40 180
Ranger 4WD
16 |SuperCrew 5' Box,
R4P 1 [EA $  36,625.00 0.02 $35,892.50 180
Maverick FWD
17 |SuperCrew, W8A
1 EA $  26,395.00 0.02 $25,867.10 180
Maverick AWD
18 |SuperCrew, W8B NON RESPONSIVE
1 EA $  26,395.00 0.02 $25,867.10 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC
Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX
T350 148" Low Roof
19 [XLRWD, X2Y
1 |EA $  58,495.00 0.02 $57,325.10 180,
T-350 148" Med Roof
20 |XLRWD, X2C
1 |EA $  60,295.00 0.02 $59,089.10 180,
T-350 148" High Roof
21 |XLRWD, X2X
1 |EA $  61,295.00 0.02 $60,069.10 180,

T-350 HD 148" EL
22 |High Roof XL DRW

RWD, U4X 1 EA $  62,245.00 0.02 $61,000.10 180

T-350 148" Low Roof
23 |XL AWD, X9Y
1 EA $  62,695.00 0.01 $62,068.05 180

T-350 148" Med Roof
24 |XL AWD, X9C
1 EA $  64,495.00 0.01 $63,850.05 180

T-350 148" High Roof
25 |XL AWD, X9X

1 EA $  65,495.00 0.01 $64,840.05 180

T-350 HD 148" EL
26 |High Roof XL DRW

AWD, U5X 1 EA $ 68,495.00 0.01 $67,810.05 180

T-350 130" Low Rf
27 19500 GVWR RWD,
w1y 1 |EA $ 51,695.00 0.01 $51,178.05 180

T-350 148" Low Rf
28 9500 GVWR RWD,

Wiy 1 |EA $  53,095.00 0.01 $52,564.05 180

T-350 148" Med Rf
29 19500 GVWR RWD,
woc 1 |EA $  54,095.00 0.01 $53,554.05 180

T-350 148" Hi Rf
30 9500 GVWR RWD,

WiIX 1 |EA $ 55,095.00 0.01 $54,544.05 180
T-350 148" EL Hi Rf

31 |9500 GVWR RWD, NON RESPONSIVE
W3X 1 |EA $  56,295.00 0.01 $55,732.05 180

T-150 130" Low Rf
32 |8670 GVWR RWD,

ETY 1 |EA $  49,495.00 0.01 $49,000.05 180

T-150 148" Low Rf
33 |8670 GVWR RWD,
ElY 1 |EA $ 50,895.00 0.01 $50,386.05 180

T-150 148" Med Rf
34 8670 GVWR RWD,

EIC 1 |EA $ 51,895.00 0.01 $51,376.05 180

T-250 130" Low Rf
35 |9070 GVWR RWD,
R1Y 1 |EA $  50,495.00 0.01 $49,990.05 180

T-250 148" low Rf
36 |9070 GVWR RWD,

R1Y 1 |EA $ 51,895.00 0.01 $51,376.05 180

T-250 148" Med Rf
37 19070 GVWR RWD,
RIC 1 EA $ 52,895.00 0.01 $52,366.05 180

T-250 148" Hi Rf
38 9070 GVWR RWD,

RIX 1 |EA $ 53,895.00 0.01 $53,356.05 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC

Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX

T-250 148" EL Hi Rf
39 |9070 GVWR RWD,
R3X 1 |EA $ 55,095.00 0.01 $54,544.05 180

T-350 130" Low Rf
40 [9500 GVWR RWD,

Wiy 1 |EA $ 51,695.00 0.01 $51,178.05 180

T-350 148" Low Rf
41 (9500 GVWR RWD,
w1y 1 |EA $ 53,095.00 0.01 $52,564.05 180

T-350 148" Low Rf
42 19950 GVWR RWD,

F1Y 1 |EA $  53,095.00 0.01 $52,564.05 180

T-350 148" Med Rf
43 [9500 GVWR RWD,

woc 1 |EA $  54,095.00 0.01 $53,554.05 180
T-350 148" Med Rf

44 19950 GVWR RWD, NoN RESPONSIVE
Fi1C 1 |EA $  54,095.00 0.01 $53,554.05 180

T-350 148" Hi Rf
45 (9500 GVWR RWD,
WiX 1 |EA $ 55,095.00 0.01 $54,544.05 180

T-350 148" Hi Rf
46 (9950 GVWR RWD,

F5X 1 |EA $  55,095.00 0.01 $54,544.05 180

T-350 148" EL Hi Rf
47 (9500 GVWR RWD,
W3X 1 |EA $  56,295.00 0.01 $55,732.05 180

T-350 148" EL Hi Rf
48 [9950 GVWR RWD,

F7X 1 |EA $ 56,295.00 0.01 $55,732.05 180

T-350 HD 148" EL Hi
49 |Rf9950 GVWR DRW
RWD, F4X 1 |Ea $  56,895.00 0.01 $56,326.05 180!

T-350 HD 148" EL Hi
50 |Rf11000 GVWR
DRW RWD, U8X 1 EA $ 59,195.00 0.01 $58,603.05 180

T-150 130" Low Rf
51 |8670 GYWR AWD,
E2Y 1 |EA $ 53,395.00 0.01 $52,861.05 180

T-150 148" Low Rf
52 |8670 GVWR AWD,

E2Y 1 |EA $  54,795.00 0.01 $54,247.05 180

T-150 148" Med Rf
53 [8670 GVWR AWD,
E2C 1 EA $ 55,745.00 0.01 $55,187.55 180

T-250 130" Low Rf
54 [9070 GVWR AWD,

R2Y 1 |EA $  54,395.00 0.01 $53,851.05 180

T-250 148" low Rf
55 9070 GYWR AWD,
R2Y 1 |EA $ 55,795.00 0.01 $55,237.05 180

T-250 148" Med Rf
56 [9070 GVWR AWD,

R2C 1 |EA $ 56,795.00 0.01 $56,227.05 180
T-250 148" Hi Rf

57 9070 GYWR AWD, NoN RESPONSIVE
R2X 1 |EA $ 57,795.00 0.01 $57,217.05 180

T-250 148" EL Hi Rf
58 [9070 GVWR AWD,

R3U 1 |EA $  58,995.00 0.01 $58,405.05 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC

Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX

T-350 130" Low Rf
59 9500 GVWR AWD,
w2y 1 |EA $ 55,595.00 0.01 $55,039.05 180

T-350 148" Low Rf
60 9500 GVWR AWD,

w2y 1 |EA $ 55,595.00 0.01 $55,039.05 180

T-350 148" Low Rf
61 9950 GVWR AWD,
F2Y 1 EA $ 56,995.00 0.01 $56,425.05 180

T-350 148" Med Rf
62 9500 GVWR AWD,

w2C 1 |EA $  57,995.00 0.01 $57,415.05 180

T-350 148" Med Rf
63 19950 GVWR AWD,
F8C 1 EA $ 57,995.00 0.01 $57,415.05 180

T-350 148" Hi Rf
64 9500 GVWR AWD,

W2X 1 |EA $  58,995.00 0.01 $58,405.05 180

T-350 148" Hi Rf
65 9950 GVWR AWD,
F6X 1 |EA $  58,995.00 0.01 $58,405.05 180

T-350 148" EL Hi Rf
66 9500 GVWR AWD,

W3u 1 |EA $  60,195.00 0.01 $59,593.05 180

T-350 148" EL Hi Rf
67 9950 GVWR AWD,
F8X 1 |EA $ 50,195.00 0.01 $49,693.05 180

T-350 HD 148" EL Hi
68 |Rf9950 GVWR DRW

AWD, F4U 1 EA $ 61,195.00 0.01 $60,583.05 180

T-350 HD 148" EL Hi
69 |Rf 11000 GVWR

DRW AWD, U8U 1 |EA $  63,995.00 0.01 $63,355.05 180
E-350 SRW 138" WB,
70 |E3F NoN RESPONSIVE
1 |EA $ 39,785.00 0.01 $39,387.15 180
E-350 DRW 138"
71 |WB, E3F
1 |EA $  40,040.00 0.01 $39,639.60 180
E-350 DRW 158"
72 |WB, E3F
1 |EA $  40,290.00 0.01 $39,887.10 180
E-350 DRW 176"
73 |WB, E3F
1 |EA $  40,785.00 0.01 $40,377.15 180
E-350 SRW 158" WB,
74 |E3F
1 |EA $  40,040.00 0.01 $39,639.60 180
E-450 DRW 158"
75 |WB, E4F
1 |EA $  42,260.00 0.01 $41,837.40 180
E-450 DRW 176"
76 |WB, E4F
1 |EA $  42,990.00 0.01 $42,560.10 180

T-350 RWD SRW
77 178" WB 9500
GVWR, W5Z 1 |Ea $  48,295.00 0.01 $47,812.05 180!

T-350 RWD SRW
78 178" WB 9500

GVWR, W5P 1 EA $ 47,995.00 0.01 $47,515.05 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC
Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX
F-150 2WD Reg Cab
79 16.5'Box, FIK
1 EA $ 38,710.00 0.02 $37,935.80 180
F-150 2WD Reg Cab
80 |8 Box, F1K
1 EA $ 37,350.00 0.02 $36,603.00 180
F-150 2WD SuperCab
81 |6.5'Box, X1K
1 EA $ 41,660.00 0.02 $40,826.80 180
F-150 4WD
82 |SuperCrew 5.5' Box,
WIL 1 |EA $  47,880.00 0.02 $46,922.40 180,
F-150 4WD
83 |SuperCrew 6.5' Box, NoN RESPONSIVE
WIL 1 |EA $  49,975.00 0.02 $48,975.50 180
F-250 2WD Reg Cab
84 |8 Box, F2A
1 EA $  45,300.00 0.02 $44,394.00 180
F-250 2WD SuperCab
85 |6.75' Box, X2A
1 EA $ - 0.00 $0.00|NO BID
F-250 2WD SuperCab
36 |8 Box, X2A
1 EA $  47,835.00 0.02 $46,878.30 180
F-250 2WD Crew Cab
87 |6.75' Box, W2A
1 EA $ 49,090.00 0.02 $48,108.20 180
F-250 2WD Crew Cab
38 |8 Box, W2A
1 EA $ 49,290.00 0.02 $48,304.20 180
F-250 4WD Reg Cab
89 |8' Box, F2B
1 EA $  48,090.00 0.02 $47,128.20 180
F-250 4WD SuperCab
90 |6.75'Box, X2B
1 EA $ = 0.02 $0.00{NO BID
F-250 4WD SuperCab
91 |8'Box, X2B
1 EA $ 51,295.00 0.02 $50,269.10 180
F-250, 4WD Crew
92 |Cab 6.75' Box, W2B
1 EA $  51,890.00 0.02 $50,852.20 180
F-250 4WD Crew Cab
93 |8'Box, W2B
1 EA $ 52,100.00 0.02 $51,058.00 180
F-350 2WD Reg Cab
94 |8'Box DRW, F3C
1 EA $  48,085.00 0.02 $47,123.30 180
F-350 2WD SuperCab
95 |8'Box DRW, X3C
1 EA $ - 0.00 $0.00|NO BID
F-350 2WD Crew Cab
96 |8 Box DRW, W3C NoN RESPONSIVE
1 EA $  62,075.00 0.02 $60,833.50 180
F-350 4WD Reg Cab
97 |8'Box DRW, F3D
1 EA $ 54,085.00 0.02 $53,003.30 180
F-350 4WD SuperCab
98 |8'Box DRW, X3D
1 EA $ = 0.00 $0.00{NO BID
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford

Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC

Rockdale, TX

Stephenville, TX

F-350 4WD Crew Cab

99 [8'Box DRW, W3D
1 |EA 54,880.00 0.02 $53,782.40 180
F-350 2WD Reg Cab
100 |8'Box SRW, F3A
1 |EA 46,595.00 0.02 $45,663.10 180
F-350 2WD Supercab
101 |6.75'Box SRW, X3A
1 |EA . 0.00 $0.00{NO BID
F-350 2WD Supercab
102 |8'Box SRW, X3A
1 |EA 49,135.00 0.02 $48,152.30 180
F-350 2WD Crew Cab
103 |6.75' Box SRW, W3A
1 |EA 50,395.00 0.02 $49,387.10 180
F-350 2WD Crew Cab
104 |8'Box SRW, W3A
1 |EA 50,595.00 0.02 $49,583.10 180
F-350 4WD Reg Cab
105 |8'Box SRW, F3B
1 |EA 49,395.00 0.02 $48,407.10 180
F-350 4WD SuperCab
106 |6.75' Box SRW, X3B
1 |EA = 0.00 $0.00[NO BID
F-350 4WD SuperCab
107 |8'Box SRW, X3B
1 |EA 51,925.00 0.02 $50,886.50 180
F-350 4WD Crew Cab
108 |6.75' Box SRW, W3B
1 |EA 53,200.00 0.02 $52,136.00 180
F-350 4WD Crew Cab
109 |8'Box SRW, W3B NoN RESPONSIVE
1 |EA 53,395.00 0.02 $52,327.10 180
F-450 2WD Reg Cab
110 |8'Box DRW, F4C
1 |EA 59,955.00 0.02 $58,755.90 180
F-450 2WD Crew Cab
111 (8 Box DRW, W4C
1 |EA 64,955.00 0.02 $63,655.90 180
F-450 4WD Reg Cab
112 |8'Box DRW, F4D
1 |EA 63,265.00 0.02 $61,999.70 180
F-450 4WD Crew Cab
113 |8'Box DRW, W4D
1 |EA 68,425.00 0.02 $67,056.50 180
F-350 CC 2WD Reg
114 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA
DRW, F3G 1 |EA 51,655.00 0.02 $50,621.90 180
F-350 CC 2WD Reg
115 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, F3G 1 |EA 51,545.00 0.02 $50,514.10 180
F-350 CC 2WD
116 |SuperCab 168" WB
60" CADRW,X3G |1 [EA 53,435.00 0.02 $52,366.30 180
F-350 CC 2WD Crew
117 |Cab 179' WB 60" CA
DRW, W3G 1 |EA 54,505.00 0.02 $53,414.90 180
F-350 CC 4WD Reg
118 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA
DRW, F3H 1 |EA 55,155.00 0.02 $54,051.90 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC
Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX
F-350 CC 4WD Reg
119 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, F3H 1 |EA $ 55,025.00 0.02 $53,924.50 180
F-350 CC 4WD
120 |SuperCab 168" WB
60"CADRW,X3H |1 |EA $  56,940.00 0.02 $55,801.20 180
F-350 CC 4WD Crew
121 |Cab 179" WB 60" CA
DRW, W3H 1 |EA $ 58,005.00 0.02 $56,844.90 180
F-350 CC 2WD Reg
122 |Cab 145" WB 60 CA NoN RESPONSIVE
SRW, F3E 1 |EA $ 51,295.00 0.02 $50,269.10 180
F-350 CC 2WD
123 |SuperCab 168 WB 60"
CA SRW, X3E 1 |EA $  51,850.00 0.02 $50,813.00 180

F-350 CC 2WD Crew
124 [Cab 179" WB 60" CA

SRW, W3E 1 |EA $ 52,375.00 0.02 $51,327.50 180

F-350 CC 4WD Reg
125 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA
SRW, F3F 1 |[ea $  55,660.00 0.02 $54,546.80 180

F-350 CC 4WD
126 |SuperCab 168" WB
60" CA SRW, X3F

—

EA $ 57,445.00 0.02 $56,296.10 180

F-350 CC 4WD Crew
127 |Cab 179" WB 60" CA
SRW, W3F 1 |Ea $  58,510.00 0.02 $57,339.80 180!

F-450 CC 2WD Reg
128 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA
DRW, FAG 1 EA $ 57,990.00 0.02 $56,830.20 180

F-450 CC 2WD Reg
129 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, F4G 1 [ea $  58,170.00 0.02 $57,006.60 180!

F-450 CC 2WD Reg
130 |Cab 193" WB 108"

CA DRW, FAG 1 |EA $ 58,340.00 0.02 $57,173.20 180

F-450 CC 2WD Reg
131 |Cab 205" WB 120"
CA DRW, F4G 1 |Ea $  58,515.00 0.02 $57,344.70 180!

F-450 CC 2WD
132 |SuperCab 168" WB

60" CADRW, X4G |1 [EA $  59,280.00 0.02 $58,094.40 180

F-450 CC 2WD
133 |SuperCab 192" WB
84"CADRW, X4G |1 |EA $  69,450.00 0.02 $68,061.00 180!

F-450 CC 2WD Crew
134 [Cab 179" WB 60" CA

DRW, W4G 1 |EA $  60,335.00 0.02 $59,128.30 180
F-450 CC 2WD Crew

135 [Cab 203" WB 84" CA NON RESPONSIVE
DRW, W4G 1 |EA $ 60,515.00 0.02 $59,304.70 180

F-450 CC 4WD Reg
136 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA

DRW, F4H 1 |EA $ 60,890.00 0.02 $59,672.20 180

F-450 CC 4WD Reg
137 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, F4H 1 |Ea $  61,065.00 0.02 $59,843.70 180!

F-450 CC 4WD Reg
138 |Cab 193" WB 108"

CA DRW, F4H 1 |EA $  61,235.00 0.02 $60,010.30 180
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RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC
Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX
F-450 CC 4WD Reg
139 [Cab 205" WB 120"
CA DRW, F4H 1 [EA $  61,410.00 0.02 $60,181.80 180
F-450 CC 4WD
140 |SuperCab 168" WB
60"CADRW,X4H |1 |EA $  62,780.00 0.02 $61,524.40 180,
F-450 CC 4WD
141 |[SuperCab 192" WB
84"CADRW,X4H |1 [EA $  62,950.00 0.02 $61,691.00 180

F-450 CC 4WD Crew
142 [Cab 179" WB 60 CA

DRW, X4H 1 |EA $ 63,840.00 0.02 $62,563.20 180

F-450 CC 4WD Crew
143 |Cab 203" WB 84" CA
DRW, X4H 1 |[ea $  64,010.00 0.02 $62,729.80 180

F-550 CC 2WD Reg
144 [Cab 145" WB 60" CA

DRW, F5G 1 EA $ 58,340.00 0.02 $57,173.20 180

F-550 CC 2WD Reg
145 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, F5G 1 [ea $  58,575.00 0.02 $57,403.50 180!

F-550 CC 2WD Reg
146 |Cab 193" WB 108"

CA DRW, F5G 1 |EA $  58,690.00 0.02 $57,516.20 180

F-550 CC 2WD Reg
147 |Cab 205" WB 120"
CA DRW, F5G 1 |Ea $  58,860.00 0.02 $57,682.80 180!

F-550 CC 2WD
148 |SuperCab 168" WB NON RESPONSIVE
60" CADRW, X5G |1 [EA $  59,630.00 0.02 $58,437.40 180

F-550 CC 2WD
149 |SuperCab 192" WB
84"CADRW, X5G |1 |EA $ 69,795.00 0.02 $68,399.10 180!

F-550 CC 2WD Crew
150 [Cab 179" WB 60" CA

DRW, W5G 1 EA $ 60,685.00 0.02 $59,471.30 180

F-550 CC 2WD Crew
151 |Cab 203" WB 84" CA
DRW, W5G 1 [ea $  60,860.00 0.02 $59,642.80 180!

F-550 CC 4WD Reg
152 |Cab 145" WB 60" CA

DRW, F5H 1 |EA $ 51,245.00 0.02 $50,220.10 180

F-550 CC 4WD Reg
153 |Cab 169" WB 84" CA
DRW, FSH 1 |Ea $  61,415.00 0.02 $60,186.70 180!

F-550 CC 4WD Reg
154 |Cab 193" WB 108"
CA DRW, F5H 1 EA $ 61,515.00 0.02 $60,284.70 180

F-550 CC 4WD Reg
155 |Cab 205" WB 120"
CA DRW, FSH 1 |Ea $  61,760.00 0.02 $60,524.80 180!

F-550 CC 4WD
156 |SuperCab 168" WB

60"CADRW,X5H |1 [EA $  63,125.00 0.02 $61,862.50 180

F-550 CC 4WD
157 |SuperCab 192" WB
84"CADRW,XSH |1 |EA $ 63,300.00 0.02 $62,034.00 180!

F-550 CC 4WD Crew
158 [Cab 179" WB 60 CA

DRW, X5H 1 |EA $ 64,185.00 0.02 $62,901.30 180
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City of Grand Prairie, TX
RFP No. 24217 Purchase of Ford Light and Medium Duty Vehicles
Closing Date: 11/6/24

Rockdale Country Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln, LLC

Rockdale, TX Stephenville, TX

F-550 CC 4WD Crew
159 |Cab 203" WB 84" CA
DRW, X5H 1 |Ea $  64,365.00 0.02 $63,077.70 180!

F-600 CC 2WD Reg
160 [Cab 145" WB 60" CA

DRW, F6K 1 |EA $  60,000.00 0.02 $58,800.00 180
F-600 CC 2WD Reg

161 [Cab 169" WB 84" CA NON RESPONSIVE
DRW, F6K 1 |EA $  60,175.00 0.02 $58,971.50 180

F-600 CC 2WD Reg
162 |Cab 193" WB 108"

CA DRW, F6K 1 |EA $  60,350.00 0.02 $59,143.00 180

F-600 CC 2WD Reg
163 |Cab 205"WB 120" CA
DRW, F6K 1 |Ea $  60,525.00 0.02 $59,314.50 180!

F-600 CC 4WD Reg
164 [Cab 145" WB 60" CA

DRW, F6L 1 |EA $ 62,405.00 0.02 $61,156.90 180

F-600 CC 4WD Reg
165 |Cab 169" WB 60" CA
DRW, F6L 1 |Ea $  63,080.00 0.02 $61,818.40 180!

F-600 CC 4WD Reg
166 |Cab 193" WB 108"

CA DRW, F6L 1 |EA $  63,250.00 0.02 $61,985.00 180

F-600 CC 4WD Reg
167 |Cab 205" WB 120"

CA DRW, F6L 1 EA $  63,425.00 0.02 $62,156.50 180
Police PPV F -150,
168 |WIP
1 EA $ 53,885.00 0.03 $52,268.45 180
Police PPV Sedan
169
1 EA $ - 0.00 $0.00{NO BID
Police PPV SUV,
170 |K8A
1 EA $ 51,110.00 0.05 $48,554.50 180
% Discount on
171 |models - Not Listed
in the RFP. 0.00%
Van & Truck Body
172 |Installation
1 Percent Off 0%
Equipment & Accessor]
173 NON RESPONSIVE
1 Percent Off 0%
Vehicle Upfitting
174
1 Percent Off 0%
Delivery charge to
175 |Utility Body Vendor Mile 4
(GSA Rate) 1
Original Equipment M
176 1 Percent Off 0.00%

Third-Party (non-OEM

177 1 Percent Off 0.00%

Delivery charge on
178 |New Vehicle $400.00
Purchased to Grand
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