City of Grand Prairie, TX: RFB # 23060 - Heavy Duty Tire Repair Service

TEXAS COMMERCIAL

TIRE

WARE GIANT TIRE
SERVICE

CAR CONCEPTS LLC

Bidder's
Comments

Bidder's
Comments

Bidder's
Comments

A. Service Charge

Flat Service Charge - Service Call

$70.00

$45.00

$70.00

If afterhours

emergency,

holiday etc,
fees increase

Flat Service Call Charge -
Commercial/Light Truck

$70.00

$45.00

$70.00

If afterhours

emergency,

holiday etc,
fees increase

OTR Service Call

$115.00

$135.00

$70.00

Per bid specs
no boom or
addl
equipment
required

Labor Hourly Rate

$70.00

$150.00

$100.00

we normally
charge by the
call and don’t
use hourly
rates, only in
special
circumstances

Mileage

$1.25

(first 20
no

charge)

$2.50 over
36 miles

$1 over
15 miles

over 15 miles

Fuel Surcharge

$75.00

$0.00

If gas prices
increase,
$3.50 add|
fees

. REPAIRS & SERVICES

Flat Repair Per Tire - Agg Tractor

$65.00

$4.00 pie
rim size

$50.00

Depending
upon size

varies from
$50-100

Flat Repair Per Tire - Trucks

$38.00

$40.00

$45.00

Flat Repair Per Tire - Bus

$38.00

$40.00

$45.00

Flat Repair Per Tire - Construction
Equipment

$65.00

$85 per
hour; 2
hour min

$50.00

Depending
upon size

varies from
$50-100

Flat Repair Per Tire - Heavy
Construction Equipment

$110.00

$150 per
hour 2
hour min

$100.00

Depending
upon size
varies from
$100-200

Industrial Press Service Per Tire -
Service Solid Tires

NA

$50.00

NO BID

No bid, but
could
subcontract
guote

Industrial Press Service Per Tire -
New Solid Tire

NA

$50.00

NO BID

No bid, but
could
subcontract
quote

Foam Filling - Off Road Tire

See
Attached

$0.00

NO BID

No bid, but
could
subcontract
guote

Foam Filling - OTR/ Construction Tire

See
Attached

$0.00

NO BID

No bid, but
could
subcontract
guote




Vulcanizing- Heavy Construction
Equipment

Yes,
Price
Varies

Price per
size of tire

No bid, but
could
subcontract
guote

C. NEW TIRE INSTALLATION

Radial Boot/Patch Included $15.50 $25.00 | varies bytype
in Repair and size
Boot/Patch Included $15.50 $25.00 | Vanesbytype
in Repair and size
Depending on
Double Lock Ring Loaders Call $0.00 $100.00 size varies
from $100-200
Depending on
Lock Ring/Split Rim Tires Call $50.00 $70.00 size varies
from $70-$150
$2,2295
. GY; $1,275.00,
New Tire - 17.5 R25 $1.385 Westlake $110.00
GAL E3
$%¢7_0 $2,498.00,
New Tire - 23.5R25 ’ Dynamax $170.00
$2,550 E3
GAL
%2810 $1,765.00
New Tire - 20.5R25 ’ DeeStone $140.00
$2,151 E3
GAL
] $771.00
New Tire - 14.00 - 24 $542.50 BKT E3 $90.00
D. VALVE STEM REPLACEMENT
Valve Stem Replacement - > 18" No
Rubber $5.00 $3 TRY15 Response Quote
Valve Stem Replacement - > 18" $12.50 No
Metal $7.50 Trucksten Response Quote
Valve Stem Replacement -> 19.5" $8.50 No
Metal $9.00 =29187 Response Quote
We are
Buyboard
member along
with other
. : state contracts
E. Miscellaneous ltem - Discount ;
on new tires (%) 5% 0 and will work
within those

contracts. We
currently sell
Grand Prairie
Pursuit Tires




SCENARIO PRICING

Commercial Car
Light Truck TCT Ware Concent
Service Call P
. $ $
Service Call | ¢7000 | 45.00 | 70.00
Fuel $ $
Surcharge $ - 75.00 -
Supply Fee
Radial
Boot/Patch $ $
$ - 15.50 25.00
Labor Rate (1 $
hour) $70.00 | $150.00 | 100.00
Total
otal $140.00 | $285.50 | $195.00

OTR Job Car
TCT Ware Concept
OTRCSaTIN'Ce $115.00 | $135.00 | $70.00
OTR Fuel
Surcharge $0.00 $75.00 $0.00
OTR Supply
Fee
Labor Hours (1
hour) $70.00 $150.00 $100.00
Boot/Patch $0.00 $15.50 $25.00
Total
otal $185.00 | $375.50 $195.00




