1st Responder Award & Payment Listing

Fire #1

Fire #2
Volunteer Fire
Sheriff #1
Sheriff #2
Sheriff #3
Sheriff CID
Sheriff Communications
Sheriff SRO
Jail #1

Jail #2

EMS #1

EMS #2
Prison #1
Prison #2
Probation
E911

amount

25,836.00
24,759.50

4,200.00
20,453.50
29,065.50
13,994.50
15,071.00
10,765.00

8,612.00
17,224.00
19,377.00
18,300.50
18,300.50
17,224.00
17,224.00

2,153.00
13,994.50

276,554.50

submittal
date
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/10/2021
12/21/2021
12/21/2021
12/21/2021
12/21/2021
12/21/2021
12/21/2021
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/22/2021
12/13/2021
12/10/2021

resubmittal

date
n/a
n/a
2/9/2022
n/a
n/a
2/14/2022
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
REJECTED
n/a

resubmittal
amount
4,200.00
11,841.50

16,041.50

approval date
3/2/2022
3/7/2022
3/9/2022
3/9/2022
3/16/2022
3/18/2022
3/9/2022
2/14/2022
3/8/2022
3/8/2022
3/8/2022
3/9/2022
3/14/2022
3/9/2022
3/8/2022
REJECTED

2/28/2022

7 S IRV R ¥ A VR R V. S VS ¥ S ¥ A Y R R SRV SRV SRV, S V8

amount
approved

25,836.00
24,759.50

4,200.00
20,453.50
29,065.50
11,841.50
15,071.00
10,765.00

8,612.00
17,224.00
19,377.00
18,300.50
18,300.50
17,224.00
17,224.00

13,994.50

272,248.50

payment rec’d payment amount

date

3/4/2022
3/10/2022
3/11/2022
3/11/2022
3/18/2022
3/22/2022
3/11/2022
2/16/2022
3/11/2022
3/11/2022
3/11/2022
3/11/2022
3/16/2022
3/11/2022
3/11/2022

REJECTED
3/2/2022

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

rec'd

25,836.00
24,759.50

4,200.00
20,453.50
29,065.50
11,841.50
15,071.00
10,765.00

8,612.00
17,224.00
19,377.00
18,300.50
18,300.50
17,224.00
17,224.00

13,994.50

272,248.50



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Wednesday, March 2, 2022 11:00 AM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011144)

Fire” Rescue |

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $25,836.00 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014856  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $25,836.00 2021-12-22
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.qgeorgia.qov.

*#%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *#****



APYROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Monday, March 7, 2022 3:00 PM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011146)

Importance: Low _F‘ (6 % S (Ul _#; 9_,

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $24,759.50 and details are listed
below.

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $24,759.50 2021-12-22
0014858  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

**%* This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *****



B

PPROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, March 9, 2022 2:18 PM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0010816)

\[olurHeer Fire "Rescua

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $4,200.00 and details are listed
below.

Importance: Low

Expense Available Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Expense Status Expenses Date
DEXP-  2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved $4,200.00 2022-02-09
0014483 Economic Economic
Impacts Support
DEXP-  2-Negative 2.13-Other Unknown $4,200.00 2022-02-09
0014484 Economic Economic [948160001]
Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

#kkk This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, *¥*¥**



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Wednesday, March 9, 2022 4:45 PM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011103)

Sheri & # |

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $20,453.50 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014816  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

9

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $20,453.50 2021-12-21
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor's Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

*kk This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, *¥¥**



APPROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2022 11:54 AM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011104)

Sheriff Ha-

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $29,065.50 and details are listed
below.

Importance: Low

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $29,065.50 2021-12-21
0014817  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

|
a1 )

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor's Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

##%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. ***#*



APPROVED

Sharon Simmons

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Friday, March 18, 2022 7:58 AM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011105)

Sheri £ +#3

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $11,841.50 and details are listed
below.

Importance: Low

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $11,841.50 2022-02-14
0014818  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

\ l

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY )

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

**¥%* This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *****



Sharon Simmons

APPRDVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Wednesday, March 9, 2022 4:50 PM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011106)

Sheriff CI1D

Low

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $15,071.00 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014819  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $15,071.00 2021-12-21
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

##%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, **¥¥*



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Monday, February 14, 2022 4:16 PM

Christy Carpenter; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan; Stephanie Johnson;
Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011110)

“ Shertf  (ommuniceding

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $10,765.00 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014823  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $10,765.00 2021-12-21
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor's Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.qgov.

##%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a



AYPROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 11:08 AM

To: ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011108)

Importance: Low

Sheri@ Schoo| Resource

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $8,612.00 and details are listed
below.

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
1D Category Activity Status Expenses Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $8,612.00 2021-12-21
0014821  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

|
LS

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor's Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.qov.

#kx* This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. ¥****



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Tuesday, March 8, 2022 12:54 PM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011153)

Jou | #)

Low

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $17,224.00 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014865  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $17,224.00 2021-12-22
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georagia.gov.

#4%* This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *****



=)

APPRDVE]

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 1:47 PM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011154)

—— ® \

) ou = 9—-

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $19,377.00 and details are listed
below.

Importance: Low

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
1D Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $19,377.00 2021-12-22
0014867  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

##%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, **%**



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Wednesday, March 9, 2022 12:40 PM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011142)

EMS 4|

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $18,300.50 and details are listed

below.

Expense

ID Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014854  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved  $18,300.50 2021-12-22
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

**%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *¥¥%*



APPROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2022 11:27 AM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011143)

EMS #

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $18,300.50 and details are listed
below.

Importance: Low

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $18,300.50 2021-12-22
0014855  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

#%#% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a

trusted source and you are expecting this email. *¥¥¥*



Sharon Simmons K>W_D\/ ED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, March 9, 2022 9:52 AM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011151)

- o Prison =]

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $17,224.00 and details are listed
below.

Subject:

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $17,224.00 2021-12-22
0014863  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

#EE% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, *****



Sharon Simmons

APPROVED

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Tuesday, March 8, 2022 10:16 AM

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0011152)

“Yeison -

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $17,224.00 and details are listed

below.

Expense

1D Category

DEXP- 2-Negative

0014864  Economic
Impacts

Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Available Expense  Total Submitted
Activity Status Expenses  Date
2.13-Other Approved $17,224.00 2021-12-22
Economic

Support

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

###% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *¥****



Sharon Simmons

Reyected

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 4, 2022 3:12 PM

To: Christy Carpenter; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan; Stephanie Johnson;
Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Rejected Payment Request (Payment: PA-0010800)

Importance: Low

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been rejected and details are listed below.

Reject Reason:
Per email from Sharon Simmons, the employees do not have POST LE certification and are not eligible.

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
D Category Activity Status Expenses Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Rejected  $2,153.00  2022-02-04
0014462  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

|

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

*#%%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email. *****



APPROVED

From: Manager, GrantCare <grantcare_mgr@opb.georgia.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 28, 2022 4:20 PM
To:

ccarpenter@effinghamcounty.org; Sharon Simmons; Mark Barnes; Timothy Callanan;
Stephanie Johnson; Wesley Corbitt

Subject: EXTERNAL:Notification of Approved Payment Request (Payment: PA-0010815)

Importance: Low E q \ \

This notification is to inform you that your payment request has been approved for $13,994.50 and details are listed
below.

Expense Available Expense  Total Submitted
ID Category Activity Status Expenses  Date
DEXP- 2-Negative 2.13-Other Approved  $13,994.50 2021-12-10
0014482  Economic Economic

Impacts Support
Thanks,

GeorgiaCARES Administrator

Support: If you need assistance, you can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.gov.

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY

Disclaimer: This is official correspondence from the State of Georgia Governor’s Office of Planning and Budget. If you need assistance, you
can email us at CARES@opb.georgia.qgov.

#¥%% This is an EXTERNAL email. Please do not click on a link or open ANY attachments unless you are confident it is from a
trusted source and you are expecting this email, ***%*



