

#### **Reimbursement Summary**

To:

Town Council

From:

Former TOECRA Chairwoman Gardner

Date:

July 2, 2024

Re:

Reimbursement of Fees

**Comments:** For your review, please find a summary of the legal fees, hotel stay, and travel expenses associated with Ethics Complaint Number 23-195. \$2,513.71

TOTAL REQUESTED FOR REIMBURSEMENT TO A GARDNER: \$1,733.71

**CURRENT BALANCE DUE TO ATTORNEY HERRON:** 

\$780.00

LEGAL FEES:

Sep 1 -2 '23

\$120.00

PAID 9/13/23

Sep 6, '23- Nov 17, '23

\$150.00

PAID 12/18/23

Dec 3, '23 - Feb 10, '24

Mar 29, '24 - June 12, '24

\$900.00

PAID 3/13/24

Reimbursement

TAID 3/13/2

Kennborsennem

\$780.00

**DUE NOW** 

**HOTEL STAY REIMBURSEMENT:** 

Towneplace Suites

\$212.63

\$1,170.00

Feb 7 - Feb 8, '24

TRAVEL REIMBURSEMENT:

\$351.08

Feb 7 - Feb 8, '24

(262 miles from Eatonville to Tallahassee @ .67/mile)

ANGIE GARDNER 307 EAST KENNEDY BLVD. EATONVILLE FL 32751 Page: 1 09/07/2023 Account No: 6371-27679

Invoice No: 496979

**ETHICS 23-056** 

## **Fees**

09/01/2023	МН	Received telephone call from Clift potential representation; received / Ethics Commission complaint pr	telephone from Angie	•	Hours	
09/02/2023	МН	Reviewed Ethics Complaint 23-19 Gardner re same / legal sufficient memorandum to Angie Gardner re For Current Services Rendered	95; prepared email men by / representation; revi		0.40 0.40	120.00
		<u>keeper</u> K HERRON	Recapitulation Hours 0.40	<u>Rate</u> \$300.00	<u>Total</u> \$120.00	
		Total Current Work				120.00
		Balance Due				\$120.00
		Please Remit				\$120.00

ANGIE GARDNER 307 EAST KENNEDY BLVD. EATONVILLE FL 32751

12 Count No: 63

Account No: Invoice No:

12/11/2023 6371-27679 497804

Page: 1

**ETHICS 23-056** 

## Fees

09/06/2023	мн	Prepared letter to Kerrie Stillman (Ethics) re	representati	on;	Hours 0.20	
11/17/2023	МН	Prepared for and conferred by telephone wi status / developments / strategy (public reco			0.30	
		For Current Services Rendered			0.50	150.00
		Recapitulatio	n			
	mekeepe ARK HE		<u>Hours</u> 0.50	<u>Rate</u> \$300.00	<u>Total</u> \$150.00	
		Total Current Work				150.00
		Previous Balance				\$120.00
		Payments				
09/13/2023		Payment Received, Thank You.				-120.00
		Balance Due				\$150.00
		Please Remit				\$150.00

ALL INVOICES DUE UPON RECEIPT.
TO PAY ONLINE USE THE FOLLOWING LINK:
https://messercaparello.securepayments.cardpointe.com/pay?total=0.00
THANK YOU FOR YOUR PROMPT PAYMENT.

ANGIE GARDNER 307 EAST KENNEDY BLVD. EATONVILLE FL 32751 Page: 1 03/11/2024 Account No: 6371-27679

Invoice No: 498729

# **ETHICS 23-056**

# Fees

12/03/2023	мн	Prepared email memoranda to Angie Gardner re draft public	Hours
12/00/2020	1416 1	records requests; reviewed email memoranda from Angie Gardner re same;	0.10
01/19/2024	МН	Returned telephone call to Bob Malone (Ethics) re scheduling investigative interview; prepared email memorandum to Angie Gardner re same;	0.20
01/26/2024	МН	Conferred with Bob Malone (Ethics) re status investigative interview;	0.10
02/01/2024	МН	Received telephone call from Bob Malone (Ethics) re status of Angie Gardner / investigative interview;	0.10
02/02/2024	MH MH	Prepared email memorandum to Angie Gardner re investigative interview; Prepared email memoranda to Angie Gardner re scheduling	0.10
		investigative interview; reviewed email memoranda from Angie Gardner re same;	0.30
02/03/2024	МН	Reviewed email memoranda from Angie Gardner re scheduling investigative interview; prepared email memoranda to Angie Gardner re same; prepared email memorandum to Bob Malone (Ethics) re same / February 8, 2024 @10:00 a.m.;	0.30
02/05/2024	МН	Received email memorandum from Bob Malone (Ethics) confirming time of February 8, 2024 @10:00 a.m. investigative interview; reviewed email memorandum from Angie Gardner re same / place to stay; prepared email memorandum to Angie Gardner re same / confirming time of February 8, 2024 @10:00 a.m. investigative interview;	0.30
02/08/2024	МН	Prepared for and attended investigative interview; conferred with	0.00
·		Angie Gardner re same;	1.40
02/10/2024	MH	Reviewed email memoranda / text message from Angie Gardner re circumstances of termination of Michael Johnson / draft	

ANGIE GARDNER

Page: 2 03/11/2024

Account No:

6371-27679 498729

Invoice No:

**ETHICS 23-056** 

	Hours	
termination letter - review by CRA attorney; prepared email		
memorandum to Bob Malone (Ethics) re same;	0.50	
For Current Services Rendered	3.40	900.00

Recapitulation

Timekeeper	<u>Hours</u>	Rate	Total
MARK HERRON	0.40	\$0.00	\$0.00
MARK HERRON	3.00	300.00	900.00

Total Current Work	900.00

Previous Balance \$150.00

**Payments** 

12/18/2023 Payment Received, Thank You. -150.00

Balance Due \$900.00

Please Remit \$900.00

ANGIE GARDNER 307 EAST KENNEDY BLVD. EATONVILLE FL 32751 Page: 1 06/11/2024

Account No: Invoice No:

6371-27679 499637

# **ETHICS 23-056**

# **Fees**

					Hours	
03/29/2024	MH	Reviewed correspondence from Millie Fulford Investigation / probable cause hearing; review		port of		
		Investigation; prepared email memorandum to Report of Investigation / probable cause hear		er re	0.40	
04/01/2024	МН	Reviewed email memoranda from Angie Gard Report of Investigation; prepared email memoral Gardner re same;			0.10	
05/03/2024	MH	Reviewed correspondence from Millie Fulford Advocate's Recommendation / probable caus Advocate's Recommendation; prepared emai	se hearing; revi			
		Angie Gardner re same / probable cause hea	ring;		0.40	
05/07/2024	МН	Prepared Response to Advocate's Recomme email memorandum to Millie Fulford (Ethics)	• •	red	0.20	
05/22/2024	МН	Reviewed email memoranda from Millie Fulfo rescheduling start of June 7, 2024 probable of 10 a.m. to 9 a.m.; conferred by telephone with same; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared emanded and the conferred email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared emanded and the conferred email memorandum to Millie reviewed email memorandum to Millie Fulfo rescheduling start of June 7, 2024 probable of 10 a.m. to 9 a.m.; conferred by telephone with same; prepared email memorandum to Millie Fulfo rescheduling start of June 7, 2024 probable of 10 a.m. to 9 a.m.; conferred by telephone with same; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed email memorandum to Millie reviewed revised hearing notice; prepared email memorandum to Millie reviewed email memo	ause hearing for Millie Fulford Fulford re sam Tail memorand	re e; a to		
		Gardner re same;		<b></b>	0.30	
06/07/2024	МН	Prepared for and attended probable cause he email memorandum to Angie Gardner re sam		d	1.00	
		For Current Services Rendered			2.40	720.00
		Recapitulation				
	Timekeep MARK HE		Hours 2.40	<u>Rate</u> \$300.00	<u>Total</u> \$720.00	

Total Current Work 720.00

ANGIE GARDNER 307 EAST KENNEDY BLVD. EATONVILLE FL 32751

Account No:

Page: 1 06/12/2024

Invoice No:

6371-27679 499658

**ETHICS 23-056** 

## Fees

06/12/2024	МН	Prepared email memoranda Final Order dismissing com from Millie Fulford re same; Gardner re same/final billing For Current Services Rende	nplaint; reviewed ; prepared email g;	email memo	randum	0.20 0.20	60.00	
			Recapitulation	n				
	mekeep			Hours 0.20	<u>Rate</u> \$300.00	<u>Total</u> \$60.00		
	/ (( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ ( \ (			0.20	4000.00	Ψ00.00		
		Total Current Work					60.00	
		Previous Balance					\$720.00	
		Balance Due					\$780.00	
		Please Remit					\$780.00	

ALL INVOICES DUE UPON RECEIPT.
TO PAY ONLINE USE THE FOLLOWING LINK:
https://messercaparello.securepayments.cardpointe.com/pay?total=0.00
THANK YOU FOR YOUR PROMPT PAYMENT.



TownePlace Suites® Tallahassee North Capital Circle 1876 Capital Circle NE, Tallahassee FL 32308 P 850.219.0122 Marrioti.com/TLHTS

Angie Gardner

535 Berthann Ln

Eatonville FL 32751

Work

Room: 318

Room Type: TOBT

Number of Guests: 1

Clerk: COL

Arrive: 07Feb24

Time: 06:09PM

Depart: 08Feb24

Time: 09:07AM

Rate: \$189.00

Folio Number: 99445

DATE	DESCRIPTION	CHARGES	CREDITS
07Feb24	Room Charge	189.00	
07Feb24	State Occupancy Tax	11.34	
07Feb24	County Tax	2.84	
07Feb24	Bed Tax	9.45	
08Feb24	Master Card	0.10	212.63
	CARD #: MCXXXX	00000000X41430000X	
		AMOUNT: 212.63	
		Auth: 07459b	

Balance:

0.00

Marriott Bonvoy Account # XXXXXI1563. Your Marriott Bonvoy points/miles earned on your eligible earnings will be credited to your account. Check your Marriott Bonvoy account statement or your online statement for updated activity.

Thank you for choosing the TownePlace Suites by Marriott, "Your Home Away From Home." We appreciate all of your comments and suggestions, so please feel free to contact us at the following number, 850-219-0122. Thank You and we hope you have enjoyed your stay in Tallahassee. -The Staff at TownePlace Suites Tallahassee

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com.



# **535 Berthann Ln, Eatonville, FL 32751 to 1876** Drive 262 miles, 3 hr 46 min **Capital Cir NE, Tallahassee, FL 32308**

262 x 2 = 524 x .67= \$351.08

1,

