& Outlook

Re: Preparing for 2026! - Founders Day inquiry

From Your Day <yourdaycharters@gmail.com>
Date Wed 6/18/2025 3:09 PM
To Johnna Krantz <jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com>

They are included in the total and if you find another vendor or don't need that type of vehicle then you can remove the amount
in parentheses from the quote amount for each day.

On Wed, Jun 18, 2025, 3:07 PM Johnna Krantz <jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com> wrote:
Thanks for putting all this together, Alee!

| appreciate you pulling out the ADA numbers for me. Can you clarify if that is part of the daily Quote total or if it is an estimated
additional? Just want to make sure | can explain correctly when | share this with the Committee.

Cheers,

Johnna Krantz

+ Community Events Coordinator
W jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com

512.894.2400 Parks Office

512-708-0457 Mobile
DRI PP|N|_G SPRINGS 1042 Event Center Drive - PO Box 384 CITY OF D Rarﬁal\é\ I\SAPLRJHI:I] gz
exas Dripping Springs, TX 78620
Open spaces, friendly faces. cityofdrippingsprings.com

FRAUD ALERT: Several applicants have reported receiving fraudulent payment requests from individuals posing as City employees. Any
invoice or request for payment from the City of Dripping Springs will not require a specific form of payment. If you receive a request for
payment or invoice from an unknown source, or a request for payment or invoice appears fraudulent, please call Shawn Cox at (512) 858-4725.
You can also reach out directly to the staff person who has been assisting you with your project or event. Payments are always accepted by
mail to P.O. Box 384, Dripping Springs, TX 78620.

From: yourdaycharters@gmail.com <yourdaycharters@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 18, 2025 2:43 PM

To: Johnna Krantz <jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com>

Subject: RE: Preparing for 2026! - Founders Day inquiry

Johnna,

Sorry for the delay as | was waiting for the ADA company to give me rough numbers. I'll try and put those outside of our quote in case there is
a way to use the Admin building for Handicapped parking on Saturday or Sunday since Friday it would be the staging area for the parade.

Here are the numbers for this year that were higher than 2024 and I've added some padding to add extra seats as Founder’s Day continues to
grow.

2025:

Times Seats Needed



mailto:jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com
mailto:yourdaycharters@gmail.com
mailto:yourdaycharters@gmail.com
mailto:jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com

930a— 10p 53
1la-3p 25
10p-12a 39
Actuals:
Time Seats Shuttles
930a - 1030a 53 2 | 39/14 passenger
1030a - 3p 104 4| 39/26/25/14 passenger
330p-7p 90 3 | 39/26/25 passenger
7p—10p 51 2 | 26/25 passenger
10-12a 39 1 | 39 passenger

For the 2026 numbers, I’'m going to base them on the actuals from Saturday and do my best to estimate the pricing and hopefully we are able
to align. The ADA vehicle is not in the shuttle count as it has limited seating for passengers and will be in a certain spot for just people that

need that bus.

Friday —
330p-7p 90 3 | 39/26/25 passenger
7p—10p 51 2 | 26/25 passenger
10-12a 39 1 | 39 passenger

Quote - $4100 ($950 — ADA vehicle)

Saturday
Time Seats Shuttles
930a - 1030a 53 2 | 39/14 passenger
1030a - 3p 104 4| 39/26/25/14 passenger




330p-7p 90 3 | 39/26/25 passenger

7p—10p 51 2 | 26/25 passenger

10-12a 39 1 | 39 passenger

Quote - $7500 ($1500 — ADA vehicle)

Sunday

Time Seats Shuttles

9a - 530p 78 3 | 39/25/14 passenger

Quote - $3500 ($750 — ADA vehicle)

Total - $15,100

Let me know if you have any questions and if this makes sense!

Alee

From: Johnna Krantz <jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com>
Sent: Friday, June 13, 2025 4:35 PM
To: Your Day <yourdaycharters@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Preparing for 2026! - Founders Day inquiry
Sounds good, thanks for the update!

Cheers,

Johnna Krantz

* Community Events Coordinator
’\(Jé—//‘ jkrantz@cityofdrippingsprings.com

512.894.2400 Parks Office

512-708-0457 Mobile
DRI PP”\_||_G S PRINGS 1042 Event Center Drive » PO Box 384 CITY OF D Rgl(gpﬁl\é I\S/\PLRJ |ILI gz
exas Dripping Springs, TX 78620
Open spaces, friendly faces. cityofdrippingsprings.com

FRAUD ALERT: Several applicants have reported receiving fraudulent payment requests from individuals posing as City employees. Any invoice
or request for payment from the City of Dripping Springs will not require a specific form of payment. If you receive a request for payment or
invoice from an unknown source, or a request for payment or invoice appears fraudulent, please call Shawn Cox at (512) 858-4725. You can also
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