
City of Douglas

425 10th Street, Douglas Arizona, 85607

Phone: 520-417-7300

Updated 7/11/2025

Item Spec Description Quantity Unit Unit Price

1 109 Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Base Bid Price) 1 LS $

2 N/A SWPPP 1 LS $

3 N/A Survey 1 LS $

4 N/A Quality Control 1 LS $

5 401 Traffic Control 1 LS $

6 611 CCTV 1 LS $

7 610
Furnish and Install 8-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 

350, Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-505
247 LF $

8 610
Furnish and Install 16-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 

250, Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-505
11016 LF $

9 610

Furnish and Install 2-inch Water Service Connection 

with Cap and Meter Box (No Meter) Per Detail 5, Sheet 

CD-506 and Marker Per Detail C-650, Sheet CD-510

1 EA $

10 630

Furnish and Install 8-inch Butterfly Valve Epoxy-Coated 

with Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type 

A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline 

Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

4 EA $

11 630

Furnish and Install 16-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve 

Epoxy-Coated with Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. 

Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-503. 

Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

17 EA $

12 630
Furnish and Install Combination Air Release Vacuum 

Valve Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-506
3 EA $

13 610
Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly with Tee and 

Valve Per MAG Std. Detail 360-1, Sheet CD-503
2 EA $

14 220
Remove and Replace Riprap Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-

510
55 SY $

15

ADOT 

303, 409, 

401

Residential Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT 

Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 3-inch AC 

over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per Detail 2, Sheet CD-

510 

329 SY $

16

ADOT 

303, 409, 

401

Commercial Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT 

Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 5-inch AC 

over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per Detail 2, Sheet CD-

510

425 SY $

17

ADOT 

303, 409, 

401

Intersecting Roadway Turnout Pavement Replacement 

Per ADOT Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508, 

Match Existing AC and AB Thickness. Turnout Limits 

Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-510 

2884 SY $

18 610
Furnish and Install 8-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 

350, Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-505
214 LF $

WATER SECTION - JAMES RANCH ROAD TO COPPER AVE - WELL 14 (INCLUDES PRV STATION)

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Form for Bid

WATER SECTION - COCHISE COLLEGE TO JAMES RANCH ROAD

Project Subtotal (Items 7 through 17)



City of Douglas

425 10th Street, Douglas Arizona, 85607

Phone: 520-417-7300

Updated 7/11/2025

19 610
Furnish and Install 12-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 

350, Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-505
19631 LF $

20 610

Furnish and Install 2-inch Water Service Connection 

with Cap and Meter Box (No Meter) Per Detail 5, Sheet 

CD-506 and Marker Per Detail C-650, Sheet CD-510

8 EA $

21 630

Furnish and Install 8-inch Butterfly Valve Epoxy-Coated 

with Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type 

A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline 

Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

4 EA $

22 630

Furnish and Install 12-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve 

Epoxy-Coated with Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. 

Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-503. 

Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

25 EA $

23 630
Furnish and Install Combination Air Release Vacuum 

Valve Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-506
7 EA $

24 Per Plan

Furnish and Install Pressure Reducing and Flow 

Monitoring VALVES AND APPURTANCES (SEE DTL 

1). Pre-Cast  10'x6'x8' (INSIDE DIMENSIONS) Vault with 

Custom Access Hatches (See Detail 1). Vault and 

Access Hatches Must Meet AASHTO H20 Loading 

Requirements

1 LS $

25 602
Furnish and Install Trenchless Crossing Per Detail 1, 

Sheet CD-502
122 LF $

26 610
Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly with Tee and 

Valve Per MAG Std. Detail 360-1, Sheet CD-503
5 EA $

27 220
Remove and Replace Riprap Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-

510
80 SY $

28

ADOT 

303, 409, 

401

Residential Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT 

Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 3-inch AC 

over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per Detail 2, Sheet CD-

510 

1094 SY $

29

ADOT 

303, 409, 

401

Intersecting Roadway Turnout Pavement Replacement 

Per ADOT Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508, 

Match Existing AC and AB Thickness. Turnout Limits 

Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-510

1768 SY $

30 N/A Remove and Relocate Fence in Kind 69 LF $

31 615
Furnish and Install 12-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, 

Per MAG Std. Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
5209 LF $

32 615
Furnish and Install 15-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, 

Per MAG Std. Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
7041 LF $

33 625

Furnish and Install 4-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole 

with 24-inch Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. 

Detail 420. Type A Frame and Cover Adjustment, 3-inch 

Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-1

6 EA $

Project Subtotal (Items 18 through 30)

SEWER SECTION - KINGS HIGHWAY TO COPPER AVE



City of Douglas

425 10th Street, Douglas Arizona, 85607

Phone: 520-417-7300

Updated 7/11/2025

34 625

Furnish and Install 5-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole 

with 30-inch Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. 

Detail 420. Type A Frame and Cover Adjustment, 3-inch 

Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-1

24 EA $

35 615

Furnish and Install 4-inch PVC Type B Connection and 

Cleanout Per MAG Std. Detail 440-2, Sheet CD-502. 

Slope Not To Exceed 1/8-inch Per Foot

7 EA $

36 615
Sewer Cleanout Per MAG Std. Detail 441, Sheet CD-

502
1 EA $

37 602
Furnish and Install Trenchless Crossing Per Detail 1, 

Sheet CD-502
170 LF $

Item Spec Description Quantity Unit Unit Price

38 109
Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Alternative 1 

Bid Price)
1 LS $

39 N/A SWPPP 1 LS $

40 N/A Survey 1 LS $

41 N/A Quality Control 1 LS $

42 401 Traffic Control 1 LS $

43 611 CCTV 1 LS $

44 615
Furnish and Install 8-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, 

Per MAG Std. Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
11240 LF $

45 615
Furnish and Install 12-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, 

Per MAG Std. Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
5469 LF $

46 625

Furnish and Install 4-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole 

with 24-inch Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. 

Detail 420. Type A Frame and Cover Adjustment, 3-inch 

Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-1

42 EA $

47 625

Furnish and Install 5-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole 

with 30-inch Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. 

Detail 420. Type A Frame and Cover Adjustment, 3-inch 

Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-1

5 EA $

48 615

Furnish and Install 4-inch PVC Type B Connection and 

Cleanout Per MAG Std. Detail 440-2, Sheet CD-502. 

Slope Not To Exceed 1/8-inch Per Foot

2 EA $

Project Subtotal (Items 31 through 37)

Project Base Bid Total

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Form for Bid

SEWER ALTERNATIVE 1 - COCHISE COLLEGE TO KINGS HIGHWAY (SEWER EXTENSION)

Project Alternative 1 Bid Total (Items 38 through 48)

BROADBAND ALTERNATIVE 2 - COCHISE COLLEGE TO HIGHWAY 919



City of Douglas

425 10th Street, Douglas Arizona, 85607

Phone: 520-417-7300

Updated 7/11/2025

49 109
Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Alternative 2 

Bid Price)
1 LS $

50 N/A SWPPP 1 LS $

51 N/A Survey 1 LS $

52 N/A Quality Control 1 LS $

53 401 Traffic Control 1 LS $

54 360
Furnish and Install 6 Conduit Duct Bank (Trench) Per 

Detail 2, Sheet CD-507
30944 LF $

55 360
Furnish and Install 6 Conduit Duct Bank (Bore) Per 

Detail 3, Sheet CD-507
560 LF $

56 360
Furnish and Install 8 Conduit Duct Bank (Bore) Per 

Detail 4, Sheet CD-507
728 LF $

57 360
Furnish and Install Broadband COD Handhole Per Detail 

4, 5, and 6, Sheet CD-507
12 EA $

58 360
Furnish and Install Broadband GSA Handhole Per Detail 

4, 5, and 6, Sheet CD-507
29 EA $

Project Base + Alternative 1 & 2 Bid Total

Project Alternative 2 Bid Total (Items 49 through 58)

The Bid Schedule items are inclusive of all work necessary to produce the 

complete and fully functioning 

project as indicated on the Drawings and in the Specifications. Work items not 

specifically identified in the Bid Schedule are incidental to Bid Items 1 

through 58 and included in the individual bid amounts and the 

Total Lump Sum Bid Amount.

TOTAL BASE BID SUM (In Written Form): 

______________________________Dollars and _________________Cents 

TOTAL BASE BID SUM + BID ALTERNATIVES 1 & 2 (In Written Form): 
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The Bid Schedule items are inclusive of all work necessary to produce the 

project as indicated on the Drawings and in the Specifications. Work items not 

specifically identified in the Bid Schedule are incidental to Bid Items 1 



Item Spec Description Quantity

1 109 Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Base Bid Price) 1

2 N/A SWPPP 1

3 N/A Survey 1

4 N/A Quality Control 1

5 401 Traffic Control 1

6 611 CCTV 1

WATER SECTION - COCHISE COLLEGE TO JAMES RANCH ROAD

7 610
Furnish and Install 8-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 350, Per Detail 2, 

Sheet CD-505
247

8 610
Furnish and Install 16-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 250, Per Detail 2, 

Sheet CD-505
11016

9 610

Furnish and Install 2-inch Water Service Connection with Cap and Meter 

Box (No Meter) Per Detail 5, Sheet CD-506 and Marker Per Detail C-650, 

Sheet CD-510

1

10 630

Furnish and Install 8-inch Butterfly Valve Epoxy-Coated with Valve Box 

Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-

503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

4

11 630

Furnish and Install 16-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve Epoxy-Coated with 

Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, 

Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

17

12 630
Furnish and Install Combination Air Release Vacuum Valve Per Detail 1, 

Sheet CD-506
3

13 610
Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly with Tee and Valve Per MAG 

Std. Detail 360-1, Sheet CD-503
2

14 220 Remove and Replace Riprap Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-510 55

15
ADOT 303, 

409, 401

Residential Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT Standard Detail C-

07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 3-inch AC over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per 

Detail 2, Sheet CD-510 

329

16
ADOT 303, 

409, 401

Commercial Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT Standard Detail 

C-07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 5-inch AC over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per 

Detail 2, Sheet CD-510

425

17
ADOT 303, 

409, 401

Intersecting Roadway Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT 

Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508, Match Existing AC and AB 

Thickness. Turnout Limits Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-510 

2884

WATER SECTION - JAMES RANCH ROAD TO COPPER AVE - WELL 14 (INCLUDES PRV STATION)

18 610
Furnish and Install 8-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 350, Per Detail 2, 

Sheet CD-505
214

19 610
Furnish and Install 12-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 350, Per Detail 2, 

Sheet CD-505
19631

20 610
Furnish and install 14-inch Ductile Iron Pipe (DIP) CL 250, Per Detail 2, 

Sheet CD-505
19

21 610

Furnish and Install 2-inch Water Service Connection with Cap and Meter 

Box (No Meter) Per Detail 5, Sheet CD-506 and Marker Per Detail C-650, 

Sheet CD-510

8

22 610

Furnish and Install 8-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve Epoxy-Coated with 

Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, 

Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

1

23 630

Furnish and Install 12-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve Epoxy-Coated with 

Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, 

Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

25

Project Subtotal (Items 7 through 17)

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Form for Bid - Updated 7/22/2025



24 630
Furnish and Install Combination Air Release Vacuum Valve Per Detail 1, 

Sheet CD-506
7

25 630

Furnish and Install 14-inch Resilient Seat Gate Valve Epoxy-Coated with 

Valve Box Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, 

Sheet CD-503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

2

26 Per Plan

Furnish and Install Pressure Reducing and Flow Monitoring VALVES AND 

APPURTANCES (SEE DTL 1). Pre-Cast  10'x6'x8' (INSIDE 

DIMENSIONS) Vault with Custom Access Hatches (See Detail 1). Vault 

and Access Hatches Must Meet AASHTO H20 Loading Requirements

1

27 630

Furnish and Install 8-inch Butterfly Valve Epoxy-Coated with Valve Box 

Installed Per MAG Std. Detail 391-2 Type A with Debris Cap, Sheet CD-

503. Include Pipeline Marker per DTL C-650, Sheet CD-510.

3

28 602 Furnish and Install Trenchless Crossing Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-502 170

29 610
Furnish and Install Fire Hydrant Assembly with Tee and Valve Per MAG 

Std. Detail 360-1, Sheet CD-503
5

30 220 Remove and Replace Riprap Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-510 80

31
ADOT 303, 

409, 401

Residential Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT Standard Detail C-

07.06 Sheet CD-508 with 3-inch AC over 6-inch AB. Turnout Limits per 

Detail 2, Sheet CD-510 

1094

32
ADOT 303, 

409, 401

Intersecting Roadway Turnout Pavement Replacement Per ADOT 

Standard Detail C-07.06 Sheet CD-508, Match Existing AC and AB 

Thickness. Turnout Limits Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-510

1768

33 N/A Remove and Relocate Fence in Kind 69

SEWER SECTION - KINGS HIGHWAY TO COPPER AVE

34 615
Furnish and Install 12-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, Per MAG Std. 

Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
5209

35 615
Furnish and Install 15-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, Per MAG Std. 

Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
7041

36 625

Furnish and Install 4-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole with 24-inch 

Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. Detail 420. Type A Frame and 

Cover Adjustment, 3-inch Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-

1

6

37 625

Furnish and Install 5-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole with 30-inch 

Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. Detail 420. Type A Frame and 

Cover Adjustment, 3-inch Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-

1

24

38 615
Furnish and Install 4-inch PVC Type B Connection and Cleanout Per MAG 

Std. Detail 440-2, Sheet CD-502. Slope Not To Exceed 1/8-inch Per Foot
7

39 615 Sewer Cleanout Per MAG Std. Detail 441, Sheet CD-502 1

40 602 Furnish and Install Trenchless Crossing Per Detail 1, Sheet CD-502 170

SEWER ALTERNATIVE 1 - COCHISE COLLEGE TO KINGS HIGHWAY (SEWER EXTENSION)

Item Spec Description Quantity

41 109 Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Alternative 1 Bid Price) 1

42 N/A SWPPP 1

43 N/A Survey 1

44 N/A Quality Control 1

45 401 Traffic Control 1

46 611 CCTV 1

Project Subtotal (Items 18 through 30)

Project Subtotal (Items 31 through 37)

Project Base Bid Total



47 615
Furnish and Install 8-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, Per MAG Std. 

Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
11240

48 615
Furnish and Install 12-inch PVC ASTM D3034 SPDR-35, Per MAG Std. 

Detail 200-3, Sheet CD-501
5469

49 625

Furnish and Install 4-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole with 24-inch 

Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. Detail 420. Type A Frame and 

Cover Adjustment, 3-inch Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-

1

42

50 625

Furnish and Install 5-foot Diameter Reinforced Manhole with 30-inch 

Cover and Pre-Cast Base Per MAG Std. Detail 420. Type A Frame and 

Cover Adjustment, 3-inch Above Finished Grade Per MAG Std. Detail 422-

1

5

51 615
Furnish and Install 4-inch PVC Type B Connection and Cleanout Per MAG 

Std. Detail 440-2, Sheet CD-502. Slope Not To Exceed 1/8-inch Per Foot
2

BROADBAND ALTERNATIVE 2 - COCHISE COLLEGE TO HIGHWAY 919

Item Spec Description Quantity

52 109 Mobilization/Demobilization (10% Max of Alternative 2 Bid Price) 1

53 N/A SWPPP 1

54 N/A Survey 1

55 N/A Quality Control 1

56 401 Traffic Control 1

57 360
Furnish and Install 6 Conduit Duct Bank (Trench) Per Detail 2, Sheet CD-

507
30944

58 360
Furnish and Install 6 Conduit Duct Bank (Bore) Per Detail 3, Sheet CD-

507
560

59 360
Furnish and Install 8 Conduit Duct Bank (Bore) Per Detail 4, Sheet CD-

507
728

60 360
Furnish and Install Broadband COD Handhole Per Detail 4, 5, and 6, 

Sheet CD-507
12

61 360
Furnish and Install Broadband GSA Handhole Per Detail 4, 5, and 6, 

Sheet CD-507
29

Project Alternative 2 Bid Total (Items 49 through 58)

Project Base + Alternative 1 & 2 Bid Total

Project Alternative 1 Bid Total (Items 38 through 48)



Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

LS $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $155,000.00 $155,000.00 $1,456,900.00

LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $68,930.00 $68,930.00 $318,000.00

LS $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $158,215.00 $158,215.00 $186,000.00

LS $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $326,530.00 $326,530.00 $207,000.00

LS $700,000.00 $700,000.00 $522,585.00 $522,585.00 $186,000.00

LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $70,710.00 $70,710.00 $29,130.00

LF $290.00 $71,630.00 $174.00 $42,978.00 $607.00

LF $400.00 $4,406,400.00 $206.00 $2,269,296.00 $212.00

EA $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $10,198.00 $10,198.00 $13,220.00

EA $6,500.00 $26,000.00 $4,638.00 $18,552.00 $5,430.00

EA $24,000.00 $408,000.00 $15,898.00 $270,266.00 $16,540.00

EA $29,000.00 $87,000.00 $20,358.00 $61,074.00 $28,270.00

EA $22,500.00 $45,000.00 $13,072.00 $26,144.00 $15,110.00

SY $200.00 $11,000.00 $413.00 $22,715.00 $320.00

SY $0.00 $182.00 $59,878.00 $94.00

SY $0.00 $214.00 $90,950.00 $139.00

SY $0.00 $261.00 $752,724.00 $155.00

$5,061,530.00 $3,624,775.00

WATER SECTION - JAMES RANCH ROAD TO COPPER AVE - WELL 14 (INCLUDES PRV STATION)

LF $280.00 $59,920.00 $178.00 $38,092.00 $319.00

LF $330.00 $6,478,230.00 $151.00 $2,964,281.00 $205.00

LF $1,400.00 $26,600.00 $1,079.00

EA $6,500.00 $52,000.00 $9,668.00 $77,344.00 $12,640.00

EA $5,120.00 $5,120.00 $4,577.00

EA $20,000.00 $500,000.00 $6,960.00 $174,000.00 $6,930.00

W.W. Clyde

Address

Project Subtotal (Items 7 through 17)

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Form for Bid - Updated 7/22/2025

Engineer's Estimate
Markham Contracting

Address



EA $25,000.00 $175,000.00 $19,340.00 $135,380.00 $11,970.00

EA $14,686.00 $29,372.00 $15,560.00

LS $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $97,315.00 $97,315.00 $102,000.00

EA $4,980.00 $14,940.00 $6,060.00

LF $4,000.00 $680,000.00 $6,390.00 $1,086,300.00 $2,730.00

EA $22,500.00 $112,500.00 $12,335.00 $61,675.00 $15,110.00

SY $200.00 $16,000.00 $427.00 $34,160.00 $188.00

SY $0.00 $242.00 $264,748.00 $136.00

SY $0.00 $215.00 $380,120.00 $104.00

LF $0.00 $179.00 $12,351.00 $73.00

$8,243,650.00 $5,401,798.00

LF $220.00 $1,145,980.00 $148.00 $770,932.00 $163.00

LF $295.00 $2,077,095.00 $149.00 $1,049,109.00 $182.00

EA $14,000.00 $84,000.00 $19,245.00 $115,470.00 $17,730.00

EA $16,000.00 $384,000.00 $21,790.00 $522,960.00 $20,260.00

EA $6,000.00 $42,000.00 $2,940.00 $20,580.00 $14,660.00

EA $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,690.00 $1,690.00 $3,413.00

LF $4,000.00 $680,000.00 $6,360.00 $1,081,200.00 $2,740.00

$3,736,575.00 $3,561,941.00

$20,271,755.00 $13,890,484.00

Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $15,857.00 $15,857.00 $387,000.00

LS $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $28,890.00 $28,890.00 $3,840.00

LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $80,124.00 $80,124.00 $23,890.00

LS $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $111,121.00 $111,121.00 $97,900.00

LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $380,268.00 $380,268.00 $24,200.00

LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $84,831.00 $84,831.00 $33,920.00

Project Subtotal (Items 18 through 30)

Project Subtotal (Items 31 through 37)

Project Base Bid Total



LF $125.00 $1,405,000.00 $113.00 $1,270,120.00 $139.00

LF $220.00 $1,203,180.00 $114.00 $623,466.00 $159.00

EA $12,000.00 $504,000.00 $18,856.00 $791,952.00 $17,450.00

EA $14,000.00 $70,000.00 $21,094.00 $105,470.00 $19,880.00

EA $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,246.00 $12,492.00 $16,050.00

$3,489,180.00 $3,504,591.00

Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

LS $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $113,290.00 $113,290.00 $106,000.00

LS $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $37,985.00 $37,985.00 $1,815.00

LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $65,160.00 $65,160.00 $41,085.00

LS $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $53,295.00 $53,295.00 $48,915.00

LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $130,072.00 $130,072.00 $18,340.00

LF $110.00 $3,403,840.00 $116.50 $3,604,976.00 $96.00

LF $110.00 $61,600.00 $139.00 $77,840.00 $112.25

LF $120.00 $87,360.00 $173.00 $125,944.00 $133.50

EA $5,000.00 $60,000.00 $5,525.00 $66,300.00 $5,870.00

EA $5,000.00 $145,000.00 $11,255.00 $326,395.00 $5,870.00

$4,307,800.00 $4,601,257.00

$28,068,735.00 $21,996,332.00

Project Alternative 2 Bid Total (Items 49 through 58)

Project Base + Alternative 1 & 2 Bid Total

Project Alternative 1 Bid Total (Items 38 through 48)



Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

$1,456,900.00 $413,203.00 $413,203.00

$318,000.00 $77,000.00 $77,000.00

$186,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

$207,000.00 $183,000.00 $183,000.00

$186,000.00 $191,000.00 $191,000.00

$29,130.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00

$149,929.00 $161.00 $39,767.00

$2,335,392.00 $210.00 $2,313,360.00

$13,220.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

$21,720.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00

$281,180.00 $15,500.00 $263,500.00

$84,810.00 $19,000.00 $57,000.00

$30,220.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00

$17,600.00 $143.00 $7,865.00

$30,926.00 $68.00 $22,372.00

$59,075.00 $104.00 $44,200.00

$447,020.00 $98.00 $282,632.00

$5,854,122.00 $4,076,899.00

$68,266.00 $150.00 $32,100.00

$4,024,355.00 $171.00 $3,356,901.00

$20,501.00 $1,100.00 $20,900.00

$101,120.00 $9,100.00 $72,800.00

$4,577.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00

$173,250.00 $7,200.00 $180,000.00

W.W. Clyde

Address

KE&G

Address



$83,790.00 $19,500.00 $136,500.00

$31,120.00 $15,300.00 $30,600.00

$102,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00

$18,180.00 $4,800.00 $14,400.00

$464,100.00 $2,200.00 $374,000.00

$75,550.00 $10,200.00 $51,000.00

$15,040.00 $180.00 $14,400.00

$148,784.00 $75.00 $82,050.00

$183,872.00 $110.00 $194,480.00

$5,037.00 $130.00 $8,970.00

$5,519,542.00 $4,615,401.00

$849,067.00 $96.00 $500,064.00

$1,281,462.00 $125.00 $880,125.00

$106,380.00 $20,400.00 $122,400.00

$486,240.00 $22,100.00 $530,400.00

$102,620.00 $1,850.00 $12,950.00

$3,413.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00

$465,800.00 $2,193.00 $372,810.00

$3,294,982.00 $2,419,799.00

$14,668,646.00 $11,112,099.00

Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

$387,000.00 $165,600.00 $165,600.00

$3,840.00 $12,700.00 $12,700.00

$23,890.00 $39,000.00 $39,000.00

$97,900.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00

$24,200.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

$33,920.00 $148,000.00 $148,000.00



$1,562,360.00 $79.00 $887,960.00

$869,571.00 $89.00 $486,741.00

$732,900.00 $19,500.00 $819,000.00

$99,400.00 $22,200.00 $111,000.00

$32,100.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00

$3,867,081.00 $2,749,801.00

Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

$106,000.00 $215,200.00 $215,200.00

$1,815.00 $12,600.00 $12,600.00

$41,085.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00

$48,915.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00

$18,340.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

$2,970,624.00 $114.00 $3,527,616.00

$62,860.00 $90.00 $50,400.00

$97,188.00 $95.00 $69,160.00

$70,440.00 $4,600.00 $55,200.00

$170,230.00 $8,200.00 $237,800.00

$3,587,497.00 $4,261,976.00

$22,123,224.00 $18,123,876.00



Contractor Name Bid Bond Received Addenda Acknowledged

Markham Contracting Yes Yes

Redpoint Contracting

W.W. Clyde & Co. Yes Yes

KE&G Yes Yes

iSX Construction

No Bid

No Bid

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Bid Opening - 8/22/2025



Total Base Bid Alternative 1 Alternative 1

$14,991,377.00 $3,504,591.00 $4,601,257.00

$14,668,646.00 $3,867,081.00 $3,587,497.00

$11,112,099.00 $2,749,801.00 $4,261,976.00

$13,861,900.00

No Bid

No Bid

Cochise County and City of Douglas, Arizona

West Douglas Utilities Expansion - State Route 80

Bid Opening - 8/22/2025



$23,097,225.00

$22,123,224.00

$18,123,876.00


