Qutlook

Re: Fw: Pool Plans

From Kyla Reamon <kyla@gerberleisure.com>
Date Wed 7/23/2025 2:15 PM

To Megan James <rec@dodgevillewi.gov>

i 2 attachments (3 MB)
Two-Post Hip Shade - Installed Images.pdf; Skyways Two-Post hip shade.pdf;

Hi Megan,

I'm writing to provide an update on the quotes for the pool shade structure. | apologize for the delay, but we're
thoroughly reviewing the concrete plans with both Skyways and our installers to ensure all aspects are covered.
Unfortunately, | won't be able to provide formal quotes with installation yet, but | do have some estimates for your
meeting:

* **Shade Structure w/Rapid Release:** $8,000.00 (includes a discount)

* **Freight:** $1,190.00

* »*EQTIMATED INSTALLATION (Direct Bury Option):** Approximately $9,000.00. This is our standard option, where
we bore into the concrete.

* »*EQTIMATED INSTALLATION (Surface Mount Option):** Approximately $5,800.00 (if this option is feasible). As
soon as | have more information from Aquatix for your engineer to review, | will send this over.

Here's some additional insight into these installation estimates:

1. *Direct Bury Option:** This option requires boring through the existing concrete and wire mesh we now know is
existing. Our installer is reviewing this in depth, as the wire mesh may pose a challenge in achieving the necessary
depth for the two post footers. It also includes a lift and mobilization fee required for all installations.

2. **Spread Footer Option:** We are also exploring a spread footer option, which would involve a wider, rather than
deeper, footer. The wire mesh might still be a factor, but we're investigating this alternative. This would be around the
same cost as the Direct Bury Option above.

3. **Surface Mount Option:** While this option wouldn't require digging through the concrete, the estimate still
accounts for time, assembly, mobilization, and the use of a lift for the tall structure.

In the meantime, | have attached some visuals of these shades installed to show the size of them!

Thanks,
Kyla

On Tue, Jul 22, 2025 at 10:16 AM Megan James <rec@dodgevillewi.gov> wrote:
" If you could have this to me before Thursday that would be best, but I can make it work if it's end of
 day Thursday as well.

~ Thank you!!

" Recreation Director | City of Dodgeville
rec@dodgevillewi.gov | 608.930.2452
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