Change Order No. g

Date of Issuance: June 27, 2022
Owner: City of Diamondhead
Contractor: Moran Hauling, Inc
Engineer:  Jason Chiniche, PE

Effective Date: June 27, 2022
Owner's Contract No.:

Contractor’s Project No.:
Engineer's Project No.:  17-057-00-08

Project: East Aloha Drive Improvements Phase 1 Contract Name: East Aloha Drive

Improvements Phase 1

The Contract is modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:

Description: Additional cost associated with requests from DSWD including ductile iron pipe and chlorination.
Attachments: Moran Hauling, Inc. Water Line Relocation Proposal, additional cost.

CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES

Original Contract Price:

$ 420,061.49

[note changes in Milestones if applicable]
Original Contract Times;
Substantial Completion: 75 Calendar Days

Ready for Final Payment: 105 Calendar Days

days or dates

Increase from previously approved Change Orders No. 1 | Increase from previously approved Change Orders No, 1

toNo._1 : toNo._1 :
Substantial Completion: 21 Days
) 45,378.31 Ready for Final Payment: 21 Days
days
Contract Price prior to this Change Order: Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial Completion: 96 Calendar Days
S 465,439.80 Ready for Final Payment: 126 Calendar Days

days or dates

Increase of this Change Order:

Increase of this Change Order:
Substantial Completion: N/A

S 6,335.30 Ready for Final Payment:
days or dates
Contract Price incorporating this Change Order: Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:
Substantial Completion: 96_Calendar Days
S 471,775.10 Ready for Final Payment: 126 Calendar Days
- days or dates
RECOMMENDED: // ACCEPTED: CCEPTED:
By: 2/'-\- oo _/é/f By: By: W\ﬂ
Engineer (if required) Owner (Authorized Signature) Contractor (Authorized Signature)
Title! (vt Gauensn Title Title  Prosfent
Date: (,7 -zﬂ’/z'z_u Date Date S /23]/zz
Approved by Funding Agency (if
applicable)
By: Date:
Title:

EJCDC® C-941, Change Order.

Prepared and published 2013 by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Committee.
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M Gma i| Nancy Hoelzel <nancyh@jjc-eng.com>

Re: East Aloha Water Line

1 message

Jason Chiniche <jason@jjc-eng.com> Fri, Jun 10, 2022 at 5:08 AM
To: Zach Anderson <zach@moranhaulinginc.com>
Cc: Donald Moran <donnymoran@moranhaulinginc.com>, Nancy Hoelzel <nancyh@jjc-eng.com>

Ok. We can submit another change order to the city to cover these costs.
Thank You,

Jason Chiniche, P.E., C.F.M, M.B.A
Principal Engineer

ENGINEERING & SURVEYING

407 HWY 90
Bay St. Louis, MS 39520
228-467-6755

On Wed, Jun 8, 2022 at 7:29 AM Zach Anderson <zach@moranhaulinginc.com> wrote:

Jason,

Per David’s instructions, we need to add ductile piping in between the hydrant valve and hydrant boot. Here are the
cost associated with this:

Materials - $821.36

Labor, Fuel, and Equipment - $762.50

In summary, the added cost for requested work by DWSD will add a total cost of $6,335.30 to the Water Line
Relocation Change Order.

From: Zach Anderson

Sent: Tuesday, June 7, 2022 1:58 PM

To: Jason Chiniche <jason@)jjc-eng.com>

Cc: Donald Moran <donnymoran@moranhaulinginc.com>
Subject: East Aloha Water Line


https://www.google.com/maps/search/407+HWY+90%C2%A0+Bay+St.+Louis,+MS+39520?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/407+HWY+90%C2%A0+Bay+St.+Louis,+MS+39520?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:zach@moranhaulinginc.com
mailto:jason@jjc-eng.com
mailto:donnymoran@moranhaulinginc.com

Jason,

Josh spoke with David from DWSD yesterday about scheduling the connections for the relocation on East Aloha. While
talking he stated that we needed to provide a insertion point and blowoff pipe. Along with that he said we needed to hire
Coast Chlorinator & Pump Co to come out and inject the line to sterilize it. This is added cost and workload that was not
present when we priced this work. We are happy to perform the work but we will need to be compensated. Prices are
as follows

Materials for injection and blowoff - $732.96
Labor, fuel, and Equipment - $1,525.00
Coast Chlorinator & Pump Co - $2,493.48

Coast Chlorinator & Pump expressed that there scope is a 3 day process. | don’t know if this means the water main
cannot be used during this period or not. Please let us know how to proceed.

Thank You

Zach Anderson

507-430-2115




