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September 29, 2025

Jon McCraw, City Manager
City of Diamondhead

5000 Diamondhead Circle
Diamondhead, MS 39525

RE: Generators for Public Works (Lease Purchase Financing)

A reverse auction was held for the purchase of a stationary generator and mobile generator with light
tower for the publics work department. Attached is the bid tabulation of the responses received. Itis
my recommendation to award the low bid received from Taylor Power Systems in the amount of
$41,313.00 for the 125kW standby generator and to award to Energy Systems Southeast, LLC (ESSE,
LLC) in the total amount of $88,221.00 for the purchase of one (1) 45kW trailer mounted generator
($74,605.50) with alternate integrated light tower ($13,615.50.)

Thank you in advance for your favorable consideration in this matter.

Sincerely,
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Jeannie Klein
City Clerk




Reverse Auction Bid Tabulation
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City of Diamondhead
Three (3) Generators

Reverse Auction Start Date/Time

July 11, 2025 at 11:00 AM Central Time

Reverse Auction End Date/Time

July 11, 2025 at 11:30 AM Central Time

aylor Power

Best Bid Summary
T Puckett Power ECB Solutions Nixon Power

T Systems Systems LLC RaBnLLG Services
45 kW Trailer
Mounted, Mobile
Prime Duty $126,720.00 $126,500.00 $134,200.00 $149,211.00 $163,570.00
Generator
(QTY:2)
125kWStandby | ¢4 31300 $46,400.00 $52,20000 | $53,300.00 | $61,805.00
Generator System
Total Bid Amount | $168,033.00 $172,900.00 $186,400.00 $202,511.00 $225,375.00
(Alternate)
Integrated Light
Towers for 45 kW , . . :
Mobile Prime Duty No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,231.00 No Bid
Generators
(QTY: 2)
The two mobile |6-8 weeks for the 150REQZJF
3-4 weeks on ; .
. units are currently towable Lead time: 17 -
the Mobile and ;
Delivery Time 20-22 weeks on in stock. The generators. 15- 12-22 Weeks 21 weeks ARO.
ry 125kW unit 18 weeks for the QAS70 Lead
the stand by o
dissel currently has a lead standby time: 4 -8
time of 24 weeks. generator weeks ARO
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Full Bid History

| . . 1 Taylor Power | Puckett Power | ECB Solutions Nixon Power
@ Time of bid Systems, Systems LLC ESSELLC Services
125kW Standby Generator System (Per Unit Price) (QTY:2)
Qualification Bids $ 66,00000]% 71,00000}% 7460550 |% 81,785.00
Auction Start $ 66,00000]$ 71,00000|$ 7460550]|% 8178500
2025-07-11 11:00:53| $ 79602001 % 66,000.00 | $ 71,000.00 | $ 7460550]1% 81,785.00
2025-07-11 11:01:15]| $  69,730.00 | $ 66,00000|$ 71,000.00|$ 7460550]% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:01:45|$ 66,695.00 | $ 66,000.00 | $ 71,00000|$ 7460550|% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:02.11|$ 6469500 | $ 66,000.00 | $ 71,000.00|$ 7460550[% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:02.54 | $ 64,695.00| $ 65,200.00 | $ 71,00000]$% 7460550|% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:03:14 | $ 6469500 | $ 64,500.00 | $ 71,00000| % 74,60550|% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:04:20|$ 6469500 $ 64,500.00 | $ 6840000|9% 7460550{% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:07:19]|$§ 63,360.00 % 64,500.00 | $ 68,400.00| $ 7460550 )% 81,785.00
2025-07-11 11:07:42| $ 63,360.00 | $ 64,25000 | $ 68,400.00 | $ 74605650 % 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:08:06 | $ 63,360.00 | $ 64,250.00 | $ 67,0000 | $ 74,60550|% 81,785.00
2025-07-11 11:08:23|$ 63,360.00 | $ 63,775.00 | $ 67,10000| % 7460550[% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:08.42 | $ 63,360.00 | $ 63,500.00 | § 67,10000(% 7460550|% 81,785.00
2025-07-1111:0855| $ 63,360.00 | $ 63,250.00 | 3 67,10000]|% 7460550|% 81,785.00
125kW Standby Generator System (Per Unit Price) (QTY:1)
Qualification Bids $ 46,400.00 | $ 5580000 3% 53,300.00]|% 61,805.00
Auction Start $ 4640000 |$ 5580000 % 53,300.00|% 61,805.00
2025-07-1111:00:47 | $ 41,313.00 | $ 46,400.00 | $ 55,800.00| % 53,300.00|% 61,805.00
2025-07-1111:0346 | $ 41,313.00 | $ 46,400.00 | $ 55,300.00| $ 53,300.00(% 61,805.00
2025-07-1111:04:32|$ 41,313.00 | $ 46,400.00 | $ 53,200.00 | $ 53,300.00|9% 61,805.00
2025-07-1111:08:281$ 41,313.00| $ 46,400.00 | $ 52,200.00 | $ 53,300.00]|% 61,805.00
(Alternate) Integrated Light Towers for 456 kW Mobile Prime Duty Generators (Per Unit Price) (QTY: 2)

Qualification Bids I I [$  13,615.50 |
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