Invoice #47498 9/25/2024
Prepared For: Prepared By:
Deadwood, City of Kelsie Darling
100 Sherman Street Quik Signs
Deadwood, SD 57732 2925 E. Colorado Blvd.
Spearfish, SD 57783
Phone: 641-2874 Fax: 578-3101 Phone: 605-717-SIGN (7446) Fax: 605-717-7447
Alt. Phone: Alt. Phone:
Email: rmcgrath@cityofdeadwood.com Email: kelsie@quiksigns.com

Description: Mike Runge - Utility Boxes

Quantity  Description Each Total Taxable

60 Mileage 0.75 $45.00
1 34.00in x 34.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 128.0056 $128.01

Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

4  34.00in x 36.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 101.0419 $404.17
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

1 49.00 in x 35.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 137.3548 $137.35
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 35.00in x 35.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 112.5667 $225.13
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 35.00in x 39.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 114.3581 $228.72
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

1 33.00in x 19.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 63.50 $63.50
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 34.00in x 43.00in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 113.3458 $226.69
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 19.00in x 43.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 71.5235 $143.05
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

1 29.00in x 29.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 112.7946 $112.79
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 25.00in x 43.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 80.4116 $160.82
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 27.00in x 43.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 93.8312 $187.66
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>
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1  33.00inx 19.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 63.50 $63.50
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 33.00in x 37.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 108.0352 $216.07
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 19.00 in x 37.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 68.9530 $137.91
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

3 23.00inx 14.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 33.6444 $100.93
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 14.00 in x 14.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 36.7290 $73.46
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

1 31.00in x 28.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 110.8972 $110.90
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 19.00in x 47.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 72.4934 $144.99
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 31.00in x 47.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 106.5618 $213.12
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

1 24.00inx 12.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 67.6492 $67.65
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 24.00in x 36.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 69.8805 $139.76
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

2 12.00in x 36.00 in Oracal - 3551 Proslide 50.9383 $101.88
Top laminated with Oracal - 210 (use w/ oracal)
Mounted on <Customer Supplied>

Subtotal $3,433.06
Total $3,433.06 =

Terms: All sales are final. Payment due on receipt of invoice. Any account 15 days past due will be billed interest at 18% per annum in
addition to a late fee.
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Bonny Anfinson

From: Michael Runge

Sent: Wednesday, October 16, 2024 11:01 AM
To: Bonny Anfinson

Subject: FW: Utility Box Wraps

Michael Runge

City Archivist / Collections Manager
108 Sherman Street

Deadwood, SD 57732

P: (605) 578-2082
F: (605) 578-2084

From: Michael Runge

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 9:42 AM

To: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>

Cc: Kevin Kuchenbecker <kevin@cityofdeadwood.com>; Bonny Anfinson <Bonny@cityofdeadwood.com>
Subject: RE: Utility Box Wraps

Yes, please proceed
Thanks,
Mike

Michael Runge

City Archivist / Collections Manager
108 Sherman Street

Deadwood, SD 57732

P: (605) 578-2082
F: (605) 578-2084

From: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 9:05 AM




To: Michael Runge <Michael@cityofdeadwood.com>
Subject: Re: Utility Box Wraps

We are good to send these to production?

CARTER NELSON | Graphic Designer
605.717.7446 | quiksigns.com | facebook.com/quiksigns
2925 E Colorado Blvd | Spearfish SD, 57783

BOLD, COLORFUL, CREATIVE: GET NOTICED!

IMPORTANT:

Please review your proof carefully and be sure to double-check spelling, grammar, punctuation,
graphics, fonts, colors, layout and content. Once approved, this proof will be printed exactly as

is and Quik Signs will not be responsible for the errors and oversights made by the customer. If a
proof containing errors is approved by the customer, customer is responsible for payment of all
original costs of printing, including corrections and reprints.

Please also note that colors vary between monitors and printers —the color you see on your
monitor or printer may not be the same as the color that is printed on our press. If precise color-
matching is critical to your job, then we highly recommend a printed proof. Otherwise, we
cannot guarantee colors will be accurate. For more information, contact one of our team
members!

From: Michael Runge <Michael@cityofdeadwood.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 9:03 AM

To: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>; Kevin Kuchenbecker <kevin@cityofdeadwood.com>
Cc: Bonny Anfinson <Bonny@cityofdeadwood.com>

Subject: RE: Utility Box Wraps

Thanks all looks good.

Michael Runge

City Archivist / Collections Manager
108 Sherman Street

Deadwood, SD 57732

P: (605) 578-2082
F: (605) 578-2084



From: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2024 8:57 AM

To: Kevin Kuchenbecker <kevin@cityofdeadwood.com>

Cc: Bonny Anfinson <Bonny@cityofdeadwood.com>; Michael Runge <Michael@cityofdeadwood.com>
Subject: Re: Utility Box Wraps

Hey Kevin, | apologize for the late response on these. Here is the final proof for the last box as well as the others.
Let me know your thoughts.




CARTER NELSON | Graphic Designer
605.717.7446 | quiksigns.com | facebook.com/quiksigns
2925 E Colorado Blvd | Spearfish SD, 57783

BOLD, COLORFUL, CREATIVE: GET NOTICED!

IMPORTANT:

Please review your proof carefully and be sure to double-check spelling, grammar, punctuation,
graphics, fonts, colors, layout and content. Once approved, this proof will be printed exactly as

is and Quik Signs will not be responsible for the errors and oversights made by the customer. Ifa
proof containing errors is approved by the customer, customer is responsible for payment of all
original costs of printing, including corrections and reprints.

Please also note that colors vary between monitors and printers — the color you see on your
monitor or printer may not be the same as the color that is printed on our press. If precise color-
matching is critical to your job, then we highly recommend a printed proof. Otherwise, we
cannot guarantee colors will be accurate. For more information, contact one of our team
members!

From: Kevin Kuchenbecker <kevin@cityofdeadwood.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2024 8:41 AM

To: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>

Cc: Bonny Anfinson <Bonny@cityofdeadwood.com>; Michael Runge <Michael@cityofdeadwood.com>
Subject: Re: Utility Box Wraps

Thanks Carter. | have copied Mike and Bonny to review as well.

Let us know when the last one is done.

Kevin Kuchenbecker
Planning, Zoning and
Historic Preservation Officer

605-578-2082

From: Quik Signs Design <design@QuikSigns.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2024 12:23 PM

To: Kevin Kuchenbecker <kevin@cityofdeadwood.com>
Subject: Utility Box Wraps




You don't often get email from design@quiksigns.com. Learn why this is important

Hey Kevin, | wanted to share some proofs with you for the utility boxes. We are waiting on one of them as the
measurements are off and it needs to be re measured.
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CARTER NELSON | Graphic Designer
605.717.7446 | quiksigns.com | facebook.com/quiksigns
2925 E Colorado Blvd | Spearfish SD, 57783

BOLD, COLORFUL, CREATIVE: GET NOTICED!

IMPORTANT:

Please review your proof carefully and be sure to double-check spelling, grammar, punctuation,
graphics, fonts, colors, layout and content. Once approved, this proof will be printed exactly as
is and Quik Signs will not be responsible for the errors and oversights made by the customer. If a
proof containing errors is approved by the customer, customer is responsible for payment of all
original costs of printing, including corrections and reprints.
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Please also note that colors vary between monitors and printers —the color you see on your
monitor or printer may not be the same as the color that is printed on our press. If precise color-
matching is critical to your job, then we highly recommend a printed proof. Otherwise, we
cannot guarantee colors will be accurate. For more information, contact one of our team
members!
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