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pitney bowes 4@

Purchase Quote/Equipment and Software Maintenance Quote Ty ‘ | ] |

Agreement Number

Your Business Information =T

Full Legal Name of Client / DBA Name of Clignt Tax ID # (FEIN/TIN)

CITY OF DALTON

Sold-To: Address
300 W WAUGH ST, DALTON, GA, 30720-3143, US

Sold-To: Confact Name Sold-To: Contact Phone # Sold-To: Account#
Mechelle Champion 7065292462 0012098462

Bill-Te: Address
PO BOX 1205, DALTON, GA, 30722-1205, US

Bill-To: Contact Name Bill-To: Contact Phone # Bill-To: Account # Bill-To: Email
Misty Wimpey (706) 278-1913 0015528184 mwest@daltonga.gov

Ship-To: Address

300 W WALIGH ST, DALTON, GA, 30720-3143, US

Ship-To: Contact Namme Ship-To: Contact Phone # Ship-To: Account #
Mechelle Champicn 65292462 0012098462
PO# Quote Expiration Date
0000 2019-11-14
Your Business Needs e e r———— ——
Oty ltem Business Solution Description Sales Type Price
1 SENDPROPSERIES PURCHASE $0.00
SendPro P Series
1 TFWYWY PURCHASE $0.00
10Ib Interfaced Weighing Feature
1 400 RENT $ 66.99
Connect+ /SendPro P Series Meter
1 APAZ PURCHASE $410.31
100 Dept Analytics
t APKE PURCHASE $0.00

SendPro P Receiving Feature

i APKF PURCHASE $0.00
SendPro P Shipping Feaiure Access

1 AZBE PURCGHASE $0.00
SendPro P Series Moo Print Module

1 AZCG PURCHASE $7,024.75
SendPro P2000 Basic (145/70LPM)

1 M9535 RENT $0.00
Mailstream Intellilink Services

1 MSD1 PURCHASE $0.00
10" Color Touch Display

1 MWOC007 PURGHASE $0.00
SendPro P Series Drop Stacker

1 MWBE6000 PURCHASE $0.00
Weighing Platform
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1 SJME RENT $0.00
Softgaurd for Sendpro P2000 Baslc/500W
1 STDSLA SLA $798.60
Standard SLA-Equipment Service Agreament (for SendPra P Series)
1 T6CS RENT $0.00
Receiving - Standard
Purchase Total** $7,435.06
Monthly Total** $ 66.99
Annual Totar** $ 798.60

**Plus applicable taxes which will be applied at the time of bifling.

Your Payment Plan s

e e
Quarterly Billing Total** Annual Billing Total™
Type Fess Type Fees Tax Exempt
Meter Services $200.97 Equipment Maintenance $798.60 { )Tax Exempt Certificate Attached
{ ) Tax Exempt Certificate Not Required
(X) Purchase Power® transaction fees indluded
{ } Purchase Power® transaction fees extra
Shipping and Handling $0.00

Irittal Term : 12 Months
**Plus applicable taxes which will be applied at the time of billing.

Sales Information Eessre————

Alim Kamat alim.kamat@pb.com

Account Rep Name Email Address

This Quotation is for budgeting and planning purposes only and s not legally binding. The supply of any goods or services is subject to a separate written order which will be
issuwed by Pitney Bowes and will be subject to the terms and conditions incorporated therein.
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Mechelle Champion

From: Alim Kamat <Alim.Kamat@pb.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2019 4:42 PM
To: Mechelle Champion

Subject: RE:

Hi Mechelle,
The contract number ig/G245483401 {Let me know if you have any further questions. Thank you.

Best regards,

Alim Kamat

Major Account Manager

Pithey Bowes, Inc. Sending Technology Solutions
m 404-576-9716

alim.kamat@pb.com

www.pitneybowes.com
https:/iwww.linkedin.com/infalim-kamat-94415697

From: Mechelle Champion <MChampion@daltonga.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2019 4:39 PM

To: Alim Kamat <Alim.Kamat@pb.com>

Subject:

Importance: High

CAUTION: THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE. Internet links, office documents or other attachments may
contain viruses. Do not click on a fink, open or enable any file unless you trust the sender.

Does Pitney Bowes still have the state contract for this machine? If so can you give me the contract number.

Macholle . Champion, CEFO

Assistant Finance Director
City of Dalton

PO Box 1205

Dalton, GA 30722

300 West Waugh Street
Dalton, GA 30720

706-529-2462 direct line
706-277-4640 fax

** Please note: The City of Dalton has adopted a new Domain and my email address has changed. My Primary address is
mchampion@daltonga.gov. | can still be reached at mchampion@cityofdalton-ga.zov: however all outgoing email will use the new
demain.




