Transformer Total Ownership Cost Evaluation
Emergency Inventory Stock

DV/(12470Y/7200 x 24940Y/14400) 300kVA, 208Y/120 Apr-25
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1 |Anix./Wesco |Hitachi 14-16 | S 26,810.00 S 26,810.00 New DV
2 |Cape S - S - *
3 |Gresco Ermco 1 S 19,845.00 S 19,845.00 New DV
4 |lrby NO BID n/a S - S - NO BID
5 |IcL NO BID nfa |$ - $ - NO BID
6 [UTB ? 19-20 |$ 19,794.00 S 19,794.00 Plus Freight
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Transformer Total Ownership Cost Evaluation

Emergency Inventory Stock
DV (12470Y/7200 x 24940Y/14400) 500kVA, 208Y/120, (2X) Apr-25
LEADTIME |  UNIT PRICE TOTAL
VENDOR BRAND IN WEEKS {per unit) Nt L | owNEersHIP cosT COND

1 |Anix./Wesco [Hitachi 14-16 | S 41,956.00 S 41,956.00 New DV
2 |Cape S . $ - *
3 |Gresco Ermco instock | S 26,845.00 S 26,845.00 New DV
4 |Irby NO BID S - S - NO BID
5 [JCL NO BID n/a S - S - NO BID
6 |UTB ? 19-20 | $ 25,710.00 S 25,710.00 plus freight
7 $ . $ -
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Irby - No GE production slots availabe until next year




Transformer Total Ownership Cost Evaluation

Emergen ventory Stoc

750kVA, 208Y/120 Apr-25

DV/(12470v/7200 x 24940Y/14400)

P e e e

LEAD TIME UNIT PRICE
IN WEEKS (per unit) OWNERSHIP COST

Anix./Wesco Hitachi 18-22 53,505.00 S 53,505.00
2 |Cape - $ -

nd Ermco 1 40,018.00 S 40,018.00
NO BID n/a -

VENDOR

NO BID n/a -
? 19-20 33,660.00
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Transformer Total Ownership Cost Evaluation
Church/inventory backup

LEAD TIME UNIT PRICE
IN WEEKS (per unit)

53,450.00

34,582.00
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