Russell R. McMurry, P.E., Commissioner

One Georgia Center
600 West Peachtree Street, NW
‘ Atlanta, GA 30308

(404) 631-1000 Main Office

Georgia Department of Transportation

March 9, 2023

Matt Santini, Mayor
City of Cartersville

1 N. Erwin Street

P.O. Box 1390
Cartersville, GA 30120

RE: City of Cartersville Project Funding Request
GDOT Project P.l. No. 0007494, Bartow County
Project Description: CS 1054/Douthit Ferry Rd Fm Old Alabama Rd to SR 61/SR 113

Dear Mayor Santini:

Thank you for the City’s funding request to assist with preliminary engineering (PE) activities for Project
Identification Number (P.l. No.) 0007494 CS 1054/Douthit Ferry Road from Old Alabama Rd to State
Route (SR) 61/SR 113 — Roadway Widening Project. The next critical milestone for the project is right
of way (ROW) acquisition. The Georgia Department of Transportation (GDOT) estimates that an
additional $750,000 will be needed to complete critical project deliverables such as preliminary design
plans, approved right of way plans and an approved National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA)
environmental document. Completion of these activities would allow for the project to advance to the
right of way acquisition phase while maintain federal funding eligibility.

GDOT has thoroughly reviewed the City’s additional PE funding request and is willing to commit
$375,000 in additional PE funding which is half of the proposed cost estimate for PE activities needed
to advance the project to ROW acquisition. The additional funding would be provided through
reimbursement to the City upon submission of processing of project invoices for eligible activities.
Please note that the $375,000 PE funding commitment by GDOT would be capped, therefore the City
would being responsible for any additional PE charges above the $375,000 to complete the project as
well as fully funding the project’'s ROW acquisition and reimbursable utility costs which are currently
estimated at $11.4 million and $605,000 respectively. It should be noted that GDOT is still committed
to funding the project construction costs which are currently estimated at approximately $33 million.

GDOT truly values the City’s continued cooperation and partnership on this project. GDOT will begin
with developing a supplemental project framework agreement for the project to reflect the additional
reimbursable PE funding once written notification is received of the City’s desire to continue with
advancing the project towards ROW acquisition as this time. If you have any questions, please contact
the GDOT Project Manager, Helen Hawkins, at (678) 898-8852.

Sincerely,

Digitally signed by Albert Shelby
DN: C=US, E=ashelby@dot.ga.gov,

Albert Shelby gz ueeod o
Date: 2023.03.08 13:18:46-05'00"
Albert V. Shelby, Il
Director of Program Delivery
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Attachment: City’s email request for funding assistance

Cc: The Honorable Jeff Lewis, State Transportation Board, Congressional District 11
Russell R. McMurry, P.E., Commissioner
Meg Pirkle, P.E., Chief Engineer
Matt Markham, Deputy Director of Planning/State Transportation Planning Administrator
Kimberly W. Nesbitt, State Program Delivery Administrator
Grant Waldrop, P.E., District 6 Engineer
Tom Sills, Cartersville-Bartow MPO Transportation Planner
Dan Porta, Cartersville City Manager
Wade Wilson, Cartersville City Engineer
Project Files



From: Shelby. Albert

To: Hawkins, Helen

Cc: Lott, Justin

Subject: FW: Douthit Ferry Road Project

Date: Friday, June 10, 2022 12:05:02 PM

Attachments: Southland Engineering Addl Services for Douthit Ferry Rd. $524,435.90.pdf
imaae001.png

Hey Helen,

Can you call me on this today sometime?

Have a great day!

Albert V. Shelby, 11
Director of Program Delivery

Georgia
i Department
of Transportation

600 West Peachtree Street, 25th Floor
Atlanta, GA 30308

(404) 631-1758 office

(404) 354-0513 cell

ashelby@dot.ga.gov email

From: James, Crystal <crjames@dot.ga.gov>
Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 4:50 PM

To: Shelby, Albert <ashelby@dot.ga.gov>
Subject: FW: Douthit Ferry Road Project

Commissioner asked that you review the below request from Board Member Jeff Lewis on behalf of
Cartersville. Please let us know what you come up with.
Thank you.

CRYSTAL

From: Jeff lewis <repjefflewis@bellsouth.net>
Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 10:28 AM

To: McMurry, Russell <rmcmurry@dot.ga.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Douthit Ferry Road Project

Russell,

I am behind in forwarding the below email to you.
Please see and let me know how GDOT can help.
Thanks
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May 9, 2022

Mr. Tommy Sanders
Director of Public Works
City of Cartersville

Dear Mr. Sanders,

We thank you for taking time to discuss the GDOT Project 0007494 Bartow — Douthit Ferry
Road Widening with Southland Engineering.

The project is designed by the City through a Project Framework Agreement through GDOT
using Local funds for Preliminary Engineering and Federal and State funds for construction. The
project has policies, directive and scheduling that come directly from GDOT. We have
encountered, over the course of design, some decisions by GDOT and FHWA and directives
from them have caused additional work not covered in our original scope, in addition to rising
cost and the time from the initial contract execution our subcontracts have requested a change
in fees for final plans and right of way plans. The changes are environmental, final design of
the bridge, and an updated traffic analysis and study. Below are the changes required and the
reason for the changes.

A. Project Change of Scope Southland Engineering Inc

1. Redesign of the centerline due a decision by the GDOT Bridge Design Office. This includes
rerunning the cross sections and tie-ins to meet the new centerline as well as other changes
such as stations. This also includes coordination with GDOT and administrative Cost.

180 Hours @ $90.00 / hr. ($16,200.00)
2. Redo of the Life Cycle Cost Analysis and Pavement Type Selection Report. Coordination with
GDOT is included.

90 Hours @ $195 / hr. ($17,550.00)

3. Coordinate with the additional environmental changes, bridge changes and traffic study.

10% of all Sub Consultants
TOTAL $45,516.90

Total Southland Engineering - $79,266.90

1 Consulting Engineers:
Civil - Structural - Land Surveying - Environmental - Transportation - Land Planning - Landscape Architecture
114 01d Mill Road- Cartersville, Georgia 30120
Telephone (770) 387-0440 -+ Fax (770) 607-5151
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B. Change of Project Scope — New Traffic Counts and Study - Kimley Horn

A Traffic Study was completed by Kimley Horn by updating a previous traffic study at the
direction of GDOT. FHWA determined that the study was not acceptable. GDOT had to redo
several traffic studies on several projects due to this determination. We now are required to
prepare new traffic counts and study to meet the requirements of GDOT and FHWA.

LUMP SUM - $209,515.44

C. Project Change of Scope — Environmental — Edwards Pitman Environmental

Because the Traffic Study must be redone, this causes the Air and Noise study to be redone as
well as Ecology, History, Archeology will be required to be updated due to the time required to
complete the traffic study. The NEPA document must be updated due to the new traffic.

LUMP SUM - $149,777.36

D. Change of Project Scope — Revise Bridge Plans — Haines-Gipson

This change order is due to a rise in cost and time between initial contract and actual work in
addition to minor bridge design change due to centerline realignment.

LUMP SUM - $79,060.20

E. Change of Project Scope — Additional Borings - GEOHYDRO

GDOT Required GEOHYDRO to drill deeper than expected on the bridge and walls. This led to
the additional Cost on the project.

LUMP SUM - $6,816.00
F. CHANGE ORDER REQUEST FEES

Southland Engineering is proposing a change order fee adjustment to cover the additional
scope of work required by GDOT and FHWA directives. The changes are due to the reasons
mentioned above. Our proposal is to provide the city with the lowest court possible without
incurring loss on the project. This would be to cover the employees cost in hours incurred and
hard costs from the consultants.

Total Change Order Items A thru E = $524,435.90

2 Consulting Engineers:
Civil - Structural - Land Surveying - Environmental - Transportation - Land Planning - Landscape Architecture
114 01d Mill Road- Cartersville, Georgia 30120
Telephone (770) 387-0440 -+ Fax (770) 607-5151
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H. Proposal Acceptance

We are pleased to be working with the City on this project and look forward to a
long continued relationship in providing excellent service for your engineering
and planning needs.

Please review our proposal for the Change Order and if there are any questions
please do not hesitate to contact me

Sincerely,

Had. 3. Lutjens May 9, 2022

Karl Lutjens, P.E. Date

ACCEPTED BY:

The Honorable Matthew J. Santini, Mayor Date
City of Cartersville

Attest: (Seal)
Julia Drake, City Clerk

3 Consulting Engineers:
Civil - Structural - Land Surveying - Environmental - Transportation - Land Planning - Landscape Architecture
114 01d Mill Road- Cartersville, Georgia 30120
Telephone (770) 387-0440 -+ Fax (770) 607-5151
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2022 Hourly Billing Rates

Engineering Services

Principal $195.00/ hr
Senior Engineer / Project Manager / Structural (5-6) $ 125.00/hr
Staff Engineer (3-4) $ 105.00/ hr
Engineering Technician (1-2) $ 90.00/hr
CADD Tech $ 70.00/hr
Landscape Architect $ 80.00/ hr
Construction Manager $ 80.00/ hr
Construction Inspector $ 75.00/hr
Administrative $ 48.00/ hr
Surveying Services
Registered Land Surveyor $ 130.00/ hr
Survey Technician $ 65.00/hr
2-Man Crew $ 130.00/ hr
3-Man Crew $160.00/ hr

4 Consulting Engineers:
Civil - Structural - Land Surveying - Environmental - Transportation - Land Planning - Landscape Architecture
114 01d Mill Road- Cartersville, Georgia 30120
Telephone (770) 387-0440 -+ Fax (770) 607-5151
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Jeff

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Dan Porta <dporta@cityofcartersville.org>
Date: May 20, 2022 at 2:55:39 PM EDT

To: Jeff lewis <repjefflewis@bellsouth.net>
Subject: Douthit Ferry Road Project

Jeff,

As a follow up to our conversation, the City of Cartersville has received the attached
request for additional services from Southland Engineering regarding the Douthit Ferry
Road Project in the amount of $524,435.90. In reviewing the change order, 75% of the
additional work is due to an updated traffic study to meet the requirements of GDOT
and FHWA, and new environmental work. At the present time, the GDOT Project
Framework Agreement Grant ($609,497.21) is almost exhausted and with the
additional required traffic study and environmental work, the city will have to find the
funds for this work in order for us to get the plans approved and begin right-of-way
acquisition.

| am hopeful that you can help us with some additional GDOT funds to help cover the
cost of this additional work.

Please feel free to call me with any questions regarding this request. | look forward to
your response.

Thanks,

Dan Porta

City Manager

City of Cartersville

770-387-5684

gt
R v
Cartersville

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended
solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient,


mailto:dporta@cityofcartersville.org
mailto:repjefflewis@bellsouth.net

you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of
the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

This email has been scanned for viruses and malware, and may have been automatically
archived by Mimecast Ltd, an innovator in Software as a Service (SaaS) for business.
Providing a safer and more useful place for your human generated data. Specializing in;
Security, archiving and compliance. To find out more Click Here.

Georgia is a state of natural beauty. And it's a state that spends millions each year cleaning up litter that
not only mars that beauty, but also affects road safety, the environment and the economy. Do your part to
KEEP IT CLEAN GEORGIA - don't litter. How can you play an active role in protecting the splendor of
the Peach State? Find out at http://keepgaclean.com/.


http://www.mimecast.com/products/
http://keepgaclean.com/

