
































































































































































BEST-AND-FINAL OFFER
Annual costs will be calculated by [Monthly costs x total units x 12 months]

NOTE ON BULK PICKUP SERVICE: PROPOSERS SHOULD REVIEW SECTION 1.9.1 OF THE RFP DOCUMENT

Service Provided Unit Count

Year 1 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 2 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 3 Unit 

Price (Per 

Month)

Year 4 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 5 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 6 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 7 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

FIRST 

TERM

TOTAL

Residential Garbage 

(Price Per Unit, Per 

Month) 10919 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE!

Residential Recycling 

(Price Per Unit, Per 

Month) 10919 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE!

Service Provided Unit Count

Year 1 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 2 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 3 Unit 

Price (Per 

Month)

Year 4 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 5 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 6 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

Year 7 

Unit Price 

(Per 

Month)

FIRST 

TERM

TOTAL

Bulk Serviced 1x Month 

up to 6cy (Price Per 

Unit, Per Month) 10919 3.56$        3.74$       3.93$        4.13$       4.33$      4.55$        4.78$        3802433

OPTION A

Bulk Serviced 1x Month 

up to 6cy- MONDAY 

SERVICE ONLY (Price Per 

Unit, Per Month) 10919 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



OPTION B

Bulk Serviced Every 

Other Month up to 10cy 

(Price Per Unit, Per 

Month) 10919 3.33$        3.49$       3.67$        3.85$       4.05$      4.25$        4.46$        3550859

OPTION C

Bulk Serviced Quarterly 

(4x Annually) up to 15cy 

(Price Per Unit, Per 

Month) 10919 3.15$        3.30$       3.47$        3.64$       3.82$      4.02$        4.22$        3356937

Additional Bulk Service 

at Customer's Expense 

(Price Per cubic yard) 1000 15.00$     15.75$    16.54$      17.36$    18.23$    19.14$      20.10$     1465440

Emergency Bulk Service 

(Hourly Rate includes 

Truck and Driver) 1 150.00$   157.50$  165.38$    173.64$  182.33$  191.44$   201.01$   14655.6



























EASTERNWASTE
SYSTEMS, INC.

Presentation to the City of Cooper 
City

for RFP # 2023-2-PW “Solid Waste 
Removal Services”

December 4, 2023

4:00 p.m. EST



COMPANY OVERVIEW

Founded in 2003, EWS provides waste collection services 
specializing in residential bulk, yard waste and storm/disaster 
generated debris.

EWS is a preferred vendor for hauling companies and 
municipalities throughout southeast Florida, regularly serving 
over 100,000 residential homes in Palm Beach, Broward and 
Miami-Dade Counties including the City of Cooper City.

EWS is headquartered at 1660 NW 19th Ave. in Pompano Beach. 
This location is centrally located within Broward County and will 
conveniently serve as the base for operations under this contract.

Locally owned and operated, EWS owns a fleet of over 90 
collection and supervisory vehicles, debris management 
equipment, and operational supplies all stored and maintained 
on-site at its corporate headquarters at 1660 NW 19th Ave. in 
Pompano Beach, Florida.



OUR TEAM
LEADERSHIP

Angelo Marzano, President 

Michael Marzano, Treasurer

Cary Salero, Controller

OPERATIONS

Gerald Walker, Operations Manager

Daniel Sementilli, Route Supervisor

ADMINISTRATION

Hannah Truong, Customer Service

Damon Stinson, Contract Administrator



VALIDATION OF

LOCAL OFFICE







COMPANY UNDERSTANDING OF

THE CITY OF COOPER CITY
Since 2015, EWS has performed bulk and yard waste collection as a 
subcontractor of Waste Management in the City of Cooper City, 
successfully working in tandem with the solid waste and recycling 
routes.

Gerald and Daniel have significant experience in both collecting and 
managing the bulk and yard waste collection routes within the City of 
Cooper City.

EWS will supply the City with all the assets and employees needed to 
perform under the terms and conditions of RFP # 2023-2-PW. In the 
event of an emergency, all EWS assets dedicated to the City for 
regular bulk collection will be available for disaster debris collection.

Every month EWS operates within the City performing residential 
bulk collection, and has vast experience in managing fluctuations in 
volumes, maneuvering challenging residential areas of the City, and 
much needed preparation required in advance of an emergency 
declaration.



SAMSARA

- MONITORING AND RECORDING EQUIPMENT FOR SAFETY AND SERVICE 
VERIFICATION

- LIVE GPS LOCATION AND TRACKING, VIDEO DOWNLOAD ON DEMAND

- DEMONSTRATION



CUSTOMER SERVICE

EWS makes an administrative staff available 6 days per week with live, local 
customer service representatives available from 8 am to 5 pm daily and on 
Saturday from 8 am to 2 pm.

Our staff is fully equipped to handle any residents needs. Our local phone 
number is 954-543-9800, and electronic requests are handled by our email 
and TracEz customer service software all available at 
www.easternwaste.com.

We will design a specific page for Cooper City and make links available for 
the City to incorporate on its own website.

Demonstration

http://www.easternwaste.com/


MANAGING EXTRA
SERVICES

EWS will scout the service area in advance of the routes to identify and tag piles 
out of compliance. Pictures are also taken. The residents are informed via the 
tag how to resolve the compliance issue. Collectors also carry tags in case of 
issues along the route.

All tags and pictures are transmitted to the City and our Administrative Staff.

Residents can elect to resolve the issue themselves or contact us for assistance, 
including paying to remove oversized piles.

Residents requesting to pay to have additional material removed are managed 
by either creating a request online, or we create the request for them 
(communicated via email) with their estimated costs and pictures for approval.

Once written approval from the resident is received, the material is serviced.

EWS records and submits to the City the name, address, date and time of 
request and service along with the amount for billing. EWS then bills the 
resident, deducts the franchise fees from the payment received and remits 
them to the City in accordance with the terms and conditions of the RFP. 



ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION
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