Columbus Consolidated Government

EMERGENCY MEDICAL SUPPLIES (Annual

Contract)

RFB No. 21-0013

BID TABULATION

Bid Date: Wed, Oct 28, 2020

Aviationy, LLC dba

Ever Ready First

CATEGORY A: AIRWAY SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 20,730.30 no bid no bid no bid 19,041.20 no bid 21,249.40 no bid 19,130.90 30,103.60 23,484.90 37,959.20 no bid 153,890.60 61,190.00 no bid
CATEGORY B: INTRAVENOUS SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 79,647.00 no bid no bid no bid 99,339.00 no bid 76,543.50 no bid 101,753.00 291,787.70 no bid 142,608.80 no bid 34,928.40 55,327.50 no bid
CATEGORY C: OXYGEN DELIVERY SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 25,362.50 no bid no bid no bid 45,987.00 no bid 39,063.50 no bid 41,599.00 97,165.50 39,213.20 68,819.00 no bid 51,595.00 135,000.00 no bid
CATEGORY D: BANDAGES no bid no bid no bid 11,794.00 no bid no bid no bid 15,615.60 no bid 11,090.72 no bid 16,444.88 20,967.44 19,350.80 18,233.68 no bid 8,233.68 26,442.40 no bid
CATEGORY E: EXPOSURE CONTROL SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 3,059.60 no bid no bid no bid 4,252.40 4,000.00 4,064.20 4,958.00 2,264.00 4,492.60 no bid 3,540.80 no bid 7,774.60 5,281.50 5,840.00
CATEGORY F: OB SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 930.00 no bid no bid no bid 608.00 no bid 671.00 no bid 1,020.00 1,954.00 1,282.00 1,887.00 no bid no bid 2,750.00 no bid
CATEGORY G: FIRST AID SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 40,075.70 no bid no bid no bid 56,230.40 no bid 43,220.00 no bid 45,136.70 71,099.70 68,705.20 59,333.40 33,751.40 18,763.60 no bid no bid
CATEGORY H: CARDIAC SUPPLIES no bid no bid no bid 25,126.00 no bid no bid no bid 46,180.00 no bid 26,225.00 no bid 38,115.00 112,864.00 58,883.00 42,124.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
CATEGORY I: EXAM GLOVES no bid no bid no bid 134,252.00 no bid no bid no bid 177,004.00 213,000.00 no bid 90,200.00 no bid 223,904.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 113,994.00
CATEGORY J: WAREHOUSE STOCK 23,500.00 1,500.00 3,180.00 75,452.94 8,500.00 33,550.00 17,900.00 114,892.30 101,200.00 59,348.65 49,300.00 11,266.55 228,238.33 2,664.00 100,699.82 57,700.00 no bid no bid 42,000.00
Total Bid $416,430.04 $579,149.90 $281,475.97 $276,730.03 | $1,082,576.87 $475,205.70
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NOTES:

1. "No Bid" Statement submitted by Interboro Packaging Corp

2. "No Bid" Statement submitted by AED Brands

3. "No Bid" Statement submitted by Cano Group Inc
4. Three Vendors with no documents uploaded in DemandStar. 1. Americare, LLC (Norcross, GA). 2. MVS Enterprises (Riverside, CA). 3. ProcureNet America (Sheridan, WY).
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