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Columbus Consolidated Government 

Council Meeting Agenda Item 

 

TO: 

 

Mayor and Councilors 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 

Bucket Truck with Aerial Device – RFB No. 20-0044 

 

INITIATED BY: Finance Department 

 

It is requested that Council authorize the purchase of one (1) bucket truck cab and chassis (2020 FCA/RAM/4500 

DP4L63) from Alan Jay Automotive Management (Sebring, FL) in the amount of $41,078.00; and one (1) bucket 

truck with aerial device (Versalift SST-37EIH) from Versalift Southeast (Knoxville, TN) in the amount of 

$58,594.00, for a grand total price of $99,672.00. 

 

The vehicle was approved in the FY20 Budget and will be used by Engineering Department staff to install and 

maintain traffic signals, school flashers, and intersection flashers.  It is a replacement vehicle. 

 

Bid specifications were posted on the web pages of the Purchasing Division and Georgia Procurement Registry.  

Five bids were received on January 29, 2020.  This bid has been advertised, opened and reviewed.  The bidders 

were: 

 

Vendors 

Alan Jay 
Automotive 

Management 
(Sebring FL) 

Versalift Southeast 
(Knoxville, TN) 

Equipment 
Technology, LLC 

(Oklahoma City, OK) 

Terex Utilities Inc. 
(Watertown, SD) 

ALTEC 
(Elizabethtown, KY) 

OPTION 1: CAB & CHASSIS ONLY 

Manufacturer/Model 
FCA / RAM /  
4500 DP4L63 

FORD F550 
FORD F550 

SUPER DUTY 
FORD F550 4X2 FORD F550 

UNIT PRICE $41,078.00 $47,166.00 NO BID NO BID 
$44,544.00 

 
OPTION 2: BUCKET TRUCK  AERIAL DEVICE ONLY 

Manufacturer/Model 
DURALIFT & 
KNAPHEIDE / 

DTAX-39 & 6108D58 

VERSALIFT 
SST-37EIH 

ETI / ETC37IH / 
SB108DD96 

TEREX UTILITIES 
LT40 

ALTEC AT 37-G 

UNIT PRICE $77,013.00 $58,594.00 NO BID NO BID $68,638.00 
OPTION 3: COMPLETE UNIT 

UNIT PRICE $118,091.00 $105,760.00 $102,688.03 $112,198.00 $113,182.00 

 

Funds are budgeted in the FY20 Budget: Paving Fund – Engineering – Highways and Roads – Light Trucks; 

0203-250-2200-ROAD-7722.  
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A RESOLUTION 

 

NO.______ 

 

 

 A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF ONE (1) BUCKET TRUCK CAB AND 

CHASSIS (2020 FCA/RAM/4500 DP4L63) FROM ALAN JAY AUTOMOTIVE MANAGEMENT 

(SEBRING, FL) IN THE AMOUNT OF $41,078.00; AND ONE (1) BUCKET TRUCK AERIAL DEVICE 

(VERSALIFT SST-37EIH) FROM VERSALIFT SOUTHEAST (KNOXVILLE, TN) IN THE AMOUNT 

OF $58,594.00, FOR A GRAND TOTAL PRICE OF $99,672.00. 

 

 WHEREAS, the vehicle was approved in the FY20 Budget and will be used by Engineering Department 

staff to install and maintain traffic signals, school flashers, and intersection flashers.  It is a replacement vehicle. 
 

 NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF COLUMBUS, GEORGIA, HEREBY RESOLVES AS 

FOLLOWS: 

 

 That the City Manager is hereby authorized to purchase one (1) bucket truck cab and chassis (2020 

FCA/RAM/4500 DP4L63) from Alan Jay Automotive Management (Sebring, FL) in the amount of $41,078.00; 

and one (1) bucket truck aerial device (Versalift SST-37EIH) from Versalift Southeast (Knoxville, TN) in the 

amount of $58,594.00, for a grand total price of $99,672.00.  Funds are budgeted in the FY20 Budget: Paving 

Fund – Engineering – Highways and Roads – Light Trucks; 0203-250-2200-ROAD-7722.  

___________________________ 

 Introduced at a regular meeting of the Council of Columbus, Georgia, held the _________ day of 

____________, 2020 and adopted at said meeting by the affirmative vote of _________ members of said Council. 

 

Councilor Allen voting __________. 

Councilor Barnes voting __________. 

Councilor Crabb voting  __________. 

Councilor Davis voting __________. 

Councilor Garrett voting __________. 

Councilor House voting __________. 

Councilor Huff voting __________. 

Councilor Thomas voting __________. 

Councilor Thompson voting __________. 

Councilor Woodson voting __________. 

 

 

_____________________________ _____________________________ 

Sandra T. Davis, Clerk of Council   B.H. “Skip” Henderson III, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

 


