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Columbus Consolidated Government 

Council Meeting Agenda Item 

 

TO: 

 

Mayor and Councilors 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 

Transmissions & Transmission Services for Public Works (Annual 

Contract) – RFB No. 20-0011 

 

INITIATED BY: Finance Department 

 

It is requested that Council approve the annual service contract for various types of transmissions with AAMCO 

of Columbus (Columbus, GA).  The Public Works Department anticipates an annual contract value of 

$127,000.00, based on prior years’ usage and inflation.  

 
Transmission repair and rebuild services are required for Public Works Department – Fleet Maintenance and will 

be procured on an “as needed” basis.  The contract period shall be for two (2) years with the option to renew for 

three (3) additional twelve-month periods.  Contract renewal is contingent upon the mutual agreement of the 

Contractor and the City. 

 

Bid specifications were posted on the web pages of the Purchasing Division and Georgia Procurement Registry.  

Two bids were received on October 9, 2019.  This bid has been advertised, opened and reviewed.  The bidders 

were: 

Description/Vendor 
AAMCO of Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

Jasper Engines & Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

I. TRANSMISSION REPAIR 

A. FIELD SERVICE 
Initial Period - 3 Year Cost 

TRANSMISSION 

1. 4R70W Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

2. 4R75EW Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

3. 5R110W Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

4. 5R55W Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  
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5. 5R55S Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

6. Torque Shift Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

7. A618 Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

8. 42RE Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

9. 48RE Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

10. 5-45FE Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

11. A606 Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

12. 4L80E Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

13. 4T60E Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

14. 4T65E Transmission     

Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00  

NO BID Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00  

Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00  

II. TRANSMISSION PRICING 

  COMPLY: YES / NO COMPLY: YES / NO 

1. 4R70W Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $720.00 

2. 4R75E Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $720.00 
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3. 5R110W Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $1,500.00 

4. 5R55W Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $600.00 

5. 5R55S Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $600.00 

6. Torque Shift Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $2,000.00 

7. A618 Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $600.00 

8. 42RE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $480.00 

9. 48RE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $2,000.00 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $500.00 

11. A606 Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / NO BID 

12. 4L60E Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $400.00 

13. 4L80E Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $800.00 

14. 4T65E Transmission Yes / $550.00 Yes / $1,200.00 

  

*Core charge only applied if 

transmission is damaged 

beyond repair.   

B. EXCHANGE PRICES Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit 

1. 4R70W Transmission $2,000.00  $2,133.00  

2. 4R75E Transmission $2,000.00  $2,133.00  

3. 5R110W Transmission $2,500.00  $3,224.00  

4. 5R55W Transmission $2,300.00  $2,452.00  

5. 5R55S Transmission $2,300.00  $2,452.00  

6. Torque Shift Transmission $2,400.00  $3,863.00  

7. A618 Transmission $2,500.00  $2,612.00  

8. 42RE Transmission $2,000.00  $1,790.00  

9. 48RE Transmission $2,000.00  $2,943.00  

10. 5-45RFE Transmission $2,000.00  $2,505.00  

11. A606 Transmission $2,100.00  NO BID 

12. 4L60E Transmission $2,200.00  $1,915.00  

13. 4L80E Transmission $2,500.00  $2,454.00  

14. 4T65E Transmission $2,350.00  $3,434.00  

C. LABOR CHARGES 
Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit 

Flat Rate Hour / Rebuild Time / Valve Body & Governor Test / Dyno Test 

1. 4R70W Transmission $99.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

2. 4R75E Transmission $99.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

3. 5R110W Transmission $99.00 / 8.7 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

4. 5R55W Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

Description/Vendor 
AAMCO of Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

Jasper Engines & Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

C. LABOR CHARGES (cont.) 
Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit 

Flat Rate Hour / Rebuild Time / Valve Body & Governor Test / Dyno Test 
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5. 5R55S Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

6. Torque Shift Transmission $99.00 / 7.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

7. A618 Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

8. 42RE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

9. 48RE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

11. A606 Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

12. 4L60E Transmission $99.00 / 8.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

13. 4L80E Transmission $99.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

14. 4T65E Transmission $99.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

Type of Transmission Option Year One Cost 

1. 4R70W Transmission $104.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

2. 4R75E Transmission $104.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

3. 5R110W Transmission $104.00 / 8.7 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

4. 5R55W Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

5. 5R55S Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

6. Torque Shift Transmission $104.00 / 7.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

7. A618 Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

8. 42RE Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

9. 48RE Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

11. A606 Transmission $104.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

12. 4L60E Transmission $104.00 / 8.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

13. 4L80E Transmission $104.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

14. 4T65E Transmission $104.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

Type of Transmission Option Year Two Cost 

1. 4R70W Transmission $109.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

2. 4R75E Transmission $109.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

3. 5R110W Transmission $109.00 / 8.7 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

4. 5R55W Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

5. 5R55S Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

6. Torque Shift Transmission $109.00 / 7.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

7. A618 Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

8. 42RE Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

9. 48RE Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

11. A606 Transmission $109.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

12. 4L60E Transmission $109.00 / 8.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

13. 4L80E Transmission $109.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

14. 4T65E Transmission $109.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID 

D. PARTS 
% REDUCED FROM LIST PRICE 

20% NO BID 
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E. WARRANTY     

1. 4R70W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

Vendor provided copy 

of warranty, but did not 

provide pricing for this section. 

2. 4R75E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

3. 5R110W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

4. 5R55W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

5. 5R55S Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

6. Torque Shift Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

7. A618 Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

8. 42RE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

9. 48RE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

11. A606 Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

12. 4L60E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

13. 4L80E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

14. 4T65E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months 

DENSITY LIST OF TRANSMISSIONS 

ESTIMATED NUMBER OF UNITS PER YEAR 

1. 4R70W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

2. 4R75E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

3. 5R110W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

4. 5R55W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

5. 5R55S Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

6. Torque Shift Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

7. A618 Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

8. 42RE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

9. 48RE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

10. 5-45RFE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

11. A606 Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

12. 4L60E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

13. 4L80E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

14. 4T65E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units 

Delivery will be made within __ days 

after receipt of  notice to proceed. 
3 Days 2 Days 

 

Funds are budgeted each fiscal year for this on-going expense: Various Departments – Auto Parts and Supplies; 

6721.  
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A RESOLUTION  

NO. _________ 

 A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN ANNUAL SERVICE CONTRACT FOR VARIOUS 

TYPES OF TRANSMISSIONS WITH AAMCO OF COLUMBUS (COLUMBUS, GA).  THE PUBLIC 

WORKS DEPARTMENT ANTICIPATES AN ANNUAL CONTRACT VALUE OF $127,000.00 

BASED ON PRIOR YEARS’ USAGE AND INFLATION. 

 

WHEREAS, transmission repair and rebuild services are required for Public Works – Fleet 

Maintenance and will be procured on an “as needed” basis; and, 

 
 WHEREAS, the contract period shall be for two (2) years with the option to renew for three (3) additional 

twelve-month periods.  Contract renewal is contingent upon the mutual agreement of the Contractor and the City. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF COLUMBUS, GEORGIA, HEREBY RESOLVES AS 

FOLLOWS: 

 
 That the City Manager is hereby authorized to enter into an annual service contract for various types of 

transmissions with AAMCO of Columbus (Columbus, GA), for the estimated annual contract value of 

$127,000.00.  Funds are budgeted each fiscal year for this ongoing expense: Funds are budgeted each fiscal year 

for this on-going expense: Various Departments – Auto Parts and Supplies; 6721. 

______________________________ 

 

Introduced at a regular meeting of the Council of Columbus, Georgia, held the _________ day of ____________, 

2020 and adopted at said meeting by the affirmative vote of _________ members of said Council. 

 

Councilor Allen voting __________. 

Councilor Barnes voting __________. 

Councilor Crabb voting  __________. 

Councilor Davis voting __________. 

Councilor Garrett voting __________. 

Councilor House voting __________. 

Councilor Huff voting __________. 

Councilor Thomas voting __________. 

Councilor Thompson voting __________. 

Councilor Woodson voting __________. 

 

 

_____________________________ _____________________________ 

Sandra T. Davis, Clerk of Council   B.H. “Skip” Henderson III, Mayor 
 

 

 

 

 


