BID TABULATION
Transmission Services Contract for Metra (Annual Contract)

RFB No. 26-0031
March 11, 2026

Associated Fuel Beliat_)le . - .

Requirements Systems, Inc. Transm!ssmn W.W. Williams Cummins, Inc

(Conley, GA) Service (Atlanta, GA) | (Albany, GA) **

' (Brandon, FI)

. TRANSMISSIONS
B400R Transmission Field Service
Hourly Labor Charge Year 1 160.00 230.00 220.00 233.00
Hourly Labor Charge Year 2 160.00 241.00 240.00 240.00
Hourly Labor Charge Year 3 160.00 253.00 264.00 247.00
Mileage Rate Year 1 0.95 3.50 3.00 2.00
Mileage Rate Year 2 0.95 3.68 3.25 2.06
Mileage Rate Year 3 0.95 3.85 3.50 2.12
Hourly Labor Charge (Driver) Year 1 0.00 230.00 220.00 233.00
Hourly Labor Charge (Driver) Year 2 0.00 241.00 240.00 240.00
Hourly Labor Charge (Driver) Year 3 0.00 253.00 264.00 240.00
II. TRANSMISSION PRICING
A Core Costs B400R CORE B400R Core B400R Core $0| B400R Core

$6,700.00 $4,000 * $6000.00
B. Exchange Prices
B400R Transmission Year 1 6,400.00 6,049.55 6,875.00 6,167.00
B400R Transmission Year 2 6,592.00 6,345.35 7,562.50 6,413.00
B400R Transmission Year 3 6,789.76 6,658.88 8,250.00 6,670.00

Page 1 of 2




BID TABULATION
Transmission Services Contract for Metra (Annual Contract)

RFB No. 26-0031
March 11, 2026

. Reliable
Associated Fuel . - .
Reguirements Svstems. Inc Transmission JW.W. Williams Cummins, Inc
a (é/:onle ’GA). Service (Atlanta, GA) | (Albany, GA) **
Y, (Brandon, Fl)
C. Labor Charges
B400R Hourly Flat Rate Year 1 No Bid 230.00 N/A No Bid
B400R Hourly Flat Rate Year 2 No Bid 241.50 N/A No Bid
B40OR Hourly Flat Rate Year 3 No Bid 253.56 N/A No Bid
B400R Rebuild Time Year 1 No Bid 11.20 N/A No Bid
B400OR Rebuild Time Year 2 No Bid 11.20 N/A No Bid
B400R Rebuild Time Year 3 No Bid 11.20 N/A No Bid
B400R Valve Body & Governor Test Year 1 No Bid N/A N/A No Bid
B400R Valve Body & Governor Test Year 2 No Bid N/A N/A No Bid
B400R Valve Body & Governor Test Year 3 No Bid N/A N/A No Bid
B400OR Dyno Test Year 1 No Bid 345.00 0.00 No Bid
B400R Dyno Test Year 2 No Bid 362.25 0.00 No Bid
B400R Dyno Test Year 3 No Bid 380.36 0.00 No Bid
D. Parts Replaced (list price minus percentage) 10% 5% 7% No Bid
E. Warranty
Will units installed by the City be warranted a minimum of 6 months from the date installed into a vehicle?
B400R | YES | YES | YES YES
Will units be picked up, repaired and delivered, at no cost to the City, if the units fail while under warranty?
B400R YES YES YES YES
Number of days for delivery 2-3 days 4 Days 14 Days 6 Days

** Vendor Response did not include a properly completed Form 2 E-Verify Affidavit; a mandatory bid submission requirement.R
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