TO:
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SUBJECT:
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Columbus Consolidated Government
Council Meeting Agenda Item

Mayor and Councilors

Flatbed Dump Trucks — RFB No. 20-0019

Finance Department

It is requested that Council authorize the purchase of four (4) flatbed dump truck cab & chassis
from Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) for a unit price of $42,553.00, and a total price of $170,212.00;
and four (4) flatbed dump truck bodies from Transport Equipment Co. (Albany, GA) at a unit
price of $9,364.00, and a total price of $37,456.00; for a grand total price of $207,668.00.

These vehicles were approved in the FY20 Budget and will be used by staff to transport supplies
from one location to another along City right-of-ways. Three vehicles are new and one is a
replacement vehicle.

Bid specifications were posted on the web pages of the Purchasing Division and Georgia
Procurement Registry. Five bids were received on October 30, 2019. This bid has been

advertised, opened and reviewed. The bidders were:

Wade Ford Park-Built Transport Truck Equipment Interstate Truck
Vendors s GA) Body Co. Equipment Co. Sales Equipment
S (Sylvester, GA) |  (Albany, GA) (Mobile, AL) (Atlanta, GA)
OPTION 1: CAB & CHASSIS
Ford F-450
Manufacturer/Model | 2020 FOrd F-550 | o sis Cab
UNIT PRICE $42,553.00 | $48,096.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID
TOTAL PRICE (4 UNITS) $170’21200 $1 92’38400
OPTION 2: BODY
Truck Equipment
Park-Built Transport Model ITE Model
Custom Dump | EquiPment Co. TEC | 1615635475 venco | 1296FED
Manufacturer/Model NO BID eelFat bump Hoist VC520ED
UNIT PRICE $12,449.00 $9,364.00 $14,111.00 $13,625.00
TOTAL PRICE (4 UNITS) $49,796.00 $37,456.00 $56,444.00 $54,500.00
OPTION 3: COMPLETE UNIT
$60,545.00
UNTPREE | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL PRICE (4 UNITS) $242’1 80.00
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Funds are budgeted in the FY20 Budget as follows: Paving Fund — Public Works — Right-of-
Way Maintenance — Light Trucks; 0203-260-3120-ROWM-7722.
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A RESOLUTION

NO.

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF FOUR (4) FLATBED
DUMP TRUCK CAB & CHASSIS FROM WADE FORD (SMYRNA, GA) FOR A UNIT
PRICE OF $42,553.00, AND A TOTAL PRICE OF $170,212.00; AND FOUR (4)
FLATBED DUMP TRUCK BODIES FROM TRANSPORT EQUIPMENT CO.
(ALBANY, GA) AT A UNIT PRICE OF $9,364.00, AND A TOTAL PRICE OF $37,456.00;
FOR A GRAND TOTAL PRICE OF $207,668.00.

WHEREAS, the vehicles were approved in the FY20 Budget and will be used by staff to
transport supplies from one location to another along City right-of-ways. Three vehicles are new
and one is a replacement vehicle.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF COLUMBUS, GEORGIA, HEREBY
RESOLVES AS FOLLOWS:

That the City Manager is hereby authorized to purchase four (4) flatbed dump truck cab
& chassis from Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) for a unit price of $42,553.00, and a total price of
$170,212.00; and four (4) flatbed dump truck bodies from Transport Equipment Co. (Albany,
GA\) at a unit price of $9,364.00, and a total price of $37,456.00; for a grand total price of
$207,668.00. Funds are budgeted in the FY20 Budget as follows: Paving Fund — Public Works
— Right-of-Way Maintenance — Light Trucks; 0203-260-3120-ROWM-7722.

Introduced at a regular meeting of the Council of Columbus, Georgia, held the
day of , 2019 and adopted at said meeting by the affirmative vote of
members of said Council.

Councilor Allen voting
Councilor Barnes voting
Councilor Crabb voting
Councilor Davis voting
Councilor Garrett voting
Councilor House voting
Councilor Huff voting
Councilor Thomas voting
Councilor Thompson voting
Councilor Woodson voting

Sandra T. Davis, Clerk of Council B.H. “Skip” Henderson III, Mayor
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