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Columbus Consolidated Government 

Council Meeting Agenda Item 

 

TO: 

 

Mayor and Councilors 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 

Asphalt Rubber & Sealant (Annual Contract) 

INITIATED BY: Finance Department 

 

It is requested that Council approve the purchase of asphalt rubber and sealant from Sealmaster 

(Atlanta, GA), and Crafco, Inc (Chandler, AZ) for the estimated annual contract value of 

$66,530.00.   

 

The material will be used, on an “as needed” basis by the Public Works Department for sealing 

cracks when repairing streets, parking lots and highways.   The contract period will be for two 

years with the option to renew for three additional twelve-month periods.  Contract renewal is 

contingent upon the mutual agreement of the City and the vendor(s). 

 

Bid specifications were posted on DemandStar and the web pages of the Purchasing Division and 

the Georgia Procurement Registry.  Three bids were received on October 21, 2020.  This bid has 

been advertised, opened and reviewed.  The bidders were: 

 

 

 

Funds are budgeted each fiscal year for this ongoing expense: Paving Fund - Public Services - 

Repairs & Maintenance – Street Repairs and Maintenance - Road Maintenance Materials, 0203-

260-3110-STRT-6726. 

    

 

 

 

Description/Vendor 

 

EST Usage 

Sealmaster/Atlanta 

(Atlanta, GA) 

Reynolds-Warren 

Equipment Co., Inc. 

(Lake City, GA) 

Crafco, Inc 

(Chandler, AZ) 

Modified Asphalt Rubber 

Plus Sealant 
5,000 lbs 

$0.63 Per Pound 

$3,150.00 Total Price 
No Bid No Bid 

Parking Lot Sealant 10,000 lbs 
$0.63 Per Pound 

$6,300.00 Total Price 

$0.78 Per Pound 

$7,800.00 Total Price 
$0.5980 Per Pound 

$5,980.00 Total Price 

Asphalt Rubber Type 4 50,000 lbs 
$0.59 Per Pound 

$29,500.00 Total Price 
No Bid No Bid 

PolyFlex Type 2 50,000 lbs 
$0.59 Per Pound 

$29,500.00 Total Price 

$0.75 Per Pound 

$37,500.00 Total Price 
$0.5580 Per Pound 

$27,900.00 Total Price 
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A RESOLUTION 

 

NO.______ 

 

 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF ASPHALT RUBBER & 

SEALANT FROM SEALMASTER (ATLANTA, GA) AND CRAFCO, INC (CHANDLER, 

AZ) FOR THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL CONTRACT VALUE OF $66,530.00. 

 

WHEREAS, the material will be used on an "as needed” basis by the Public Works 

Department for sealing cracks when repairing streets, parking lots and highways, and; 

 

WHEREAS, the contract period will be for two years with the option to renew for three 

additional twelve-month periods.  Contract renewal is contingent upon the mutual agreement of 

the City and the vendor.   

 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF COLUMBUS, GEORGIA, HEREBY, 

RESOLVES AS FOLLOWS: 

 

That the City Manager is hereby authorized to purchase asphalt rubber and sealant from 

Sealmaster (Atlanta, GA) and Crafco, Inc (Chandler, AZ) for the estimated annual contract value 

of $66,530.00.  Funds are budgeted each fiscal year for this ongoing expense: Paving Fund - 

Public Services - Repairs & Maintenance – Street Repairs and Maintenance - Road Maintenance 

Materials, 0203-260-3110-STRT-6726.     

___________________________ 

 

    Introduced at a regular meeting of the Council of Columbus, Georgia, held the 

_________ day of _________________, 2020 and adopted at said meeting by the affirmative 

vote of _________ members of said Council. 

 
Councilor Allen voting  __________. 

Councilor Barnes voting  __________. 

Councilor Crabb voting  __________. 

Councilor Davis voting  __________.                    

Councilor Garrett voting  __________. 

Councilor House voting  __________. 

Councilor Huff voting   __________. 

Councilor Thomas voting  __________. 

Councilor Tucker voting  __________. 

Councilor Woodson voting  __________. 

 

______________________________  _____________________________ 

Sandra T. Davis, Clerk of Council   B.H. “Skip” Henderson III, Mayor 

 

 


