
Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $13.86 $13,860.00 $12.89 $12,890.00 $13.43 $13,430.00 $11.91 $11,910.00 $2.12 $2,120.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.05 $4,050.00 $3.25 $3,250.00 $5.67 $5,670.00 $5.03 $5,030.00 $7.29 $7,290.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.05 $4,050.00 $3.98 $3,980.00 $7.02 $7,020.00 $5.12 $5,120.00 $6.27 $6,270.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $9.60 $38,400.00 $9.49 $37,960.00 $9.15 $36,600.00 $10.60 $42,400.00 $11.00 $44,000.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $11.40 $45,600.00 $15.49 $61,960.00 $20.42 $81,680.00 $24.50 $98,000.00 $24.85 $99,400.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $2.20 $7,260.00 $1.69 $5,577.00 $1.99 $6,567.00 $2.41 $7,953.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $3.33 $3,330.00 $2.95 $2,950.00 $3.07 $3,070.00 $3.45 $3,450.00 $4.00 $4,000.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $8.68 $17,360.00 $8.50 $17,000.00 $11.66 $23,320.00 $7.97 $15,940.00 $11.43 $22,860.00

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $14.55 $14,550.00 $13.09 $13,090.00 $14.09 $14,090.00 $12.16 $12,160.00 $2.27 $2,270.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.25 $4,250.00 $3.45 $3,450.00 $5.95 $5,950.00 $5.28 $5,280.00 $10.65 $10,650.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.25 $4,250.00 $4.18 $4,180.00 $7.37 $7,370.00 $5.37 $5,370.00 $7.97 $7,970.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $10.08 $40,320.00 $9.69 $38,760.00 $9.61 $38,440.00 $10.85 $43,400.00 $11.50 $46,000.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $11.97 $47,880.00 $15.69 $62,760.00 $21.44 $85,760.00 $24.75 $99,000.00 $25.35 $101,400.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $2.31 $7,623.00 $1.89 $6,237.00 $2.24 $7,392.00 $2.56 $8,448.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $3.50 $3,500.00 $3.10 $3,100.00 $3.22 $3,220.00 $3.70 $3,700.00 $4.20 $4,200.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $9.11 $18,220.00 $8.70 $17,400.00 $12.24 $24,480.00 $8.22 $16,440.00 $11.93 $23,860.00

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $15.28 $15,280.00 $13.09 $13,090.00 $14.80 $14,800.00 $12.41 $12,410.00 $2.37 $2,370.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.47 $4,470.00 $3.45 $3,450.00 $6.25 $6,250.00 $5.53 $5,530.00 $11.15 $11,150.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.47 $4,470.00 $4.18 $4,180.00 $7.74 $7,740.00 $5.62 $5,620.00 $8.47 $8,470.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $10.58 $42,320.00 $9.69 $38,760.00 $10.09 $40,360.00 $11.10 $44,400.00 $12.00 $48,000.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $12.57 $50,280.00 $15.69 $62,760.00 $22.51 $90,040.00 $25.00 $100,000.00 $25.60 $102,400.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $2.43 $8,019.00 $1.89 $6,237.00 $2.49 $8,217.00 $2.81 $9,273.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $3.67 $3,670.00 $3.10 $3,100.00 $3.38 $3,380.00 $3.95 $3,950.00 $4.35 $4,350.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $9.57 $19,140.00 $8.70 $17,400.00 $12.85 $25,700.00 $8.47 $16,940.00 $12.43 $24,860.00

Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.

(Macon, GA)

NO BID

The McPherson Companies, Inc.

(Trussville, AL)

$197,067.00 $210,873.00

$193,893.00

NO BID

GRAND TOTAL COST $133,910.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $140,593.00

$188,417.00$170,790.00

$188,270.00

$148,977.00 $179,310.00 $192,742.00 $204,798.00

UNIT QUANTITY

Atlanta Fuel Company

(Atlanta, GA)

Taylor Enterprises, Inc.

(Spartanburg, SC)

Cadence Petroleum

(Asheboro, NC)

$147,649.00

$145,567.00

GRAND TOTAL COST

Description/Vendors

$148,977.00

OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR METRA (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

RFB No. 20-0026

Y   E   A   R        O   N   E

Y   E   A   R        T   W   O

Y   E   A   R        T   H   R   E   E

48-72 hours

 Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump  Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump  Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump  Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump  Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump

Delivery will be made within __ hours after receipt of order. Bi-weekly 24 hours 48 hours 48 hours

NO BID

Method of Delivery



Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $22.33 $22,330.00 $18.05 $18,050.00 $15.70 $15,700.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $7.24 $7,240.00 $7.29 $7,290.00 $8.74 $8,740.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $7.95 $7,950.00 $8.39 $8,390.00 $9.67 $9,670.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $11.99 $47,960.00 $12.29 $49,160.00 $10.79 $43,160.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $27.02 $108,080.00 $28.46 $113,840.00 $33.00 $132,000.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $1.45 $4,785.00 $2.50 $8,250.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $3.79 $3,790.00 $4.871 $4,871.00 $3.71 $3,710.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $15.05 $30,100.00 $13.12 $26,240.00 $11.36 $22,720.00

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $24.11 $24,110.00 $18.26 $18,260.00 $16.70 $16,700.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $7.82 $7,820.00 $7.39 $7,390.00 $9.74 $9,740.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $8.58 $8,580.00 $8.49 $8,490.00 $10.25 $10,250.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $12.95 $51,800.00 $12.39 $49,560.00 $11.79 $47,160.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $29.18 $116,720.00 $28.56 $114,240.00 $34.00 $136,000.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $1.46 $4,818.00 $3.25 $10,725.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $4.10 $4,100.00 $4.899 $4,899.00 $3.95 $3,950.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $16.26 $32,520.00 $13.22 $26,440.00 $11.50 $23,000.00

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $26.04 $26,040.00 $18.26 $18,260.00

Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $8.44 $8,440.00 $7.49 $7,490.00

Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $9.27 $9,270.00 $8.59 $8,590.00

15W40 Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $13.98 $55,920.00 $12.49 $49,960.00

Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $31.52 $126,080.00 $28.66 $114,640.00

Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon 3,300 Gallons $1.47 $4,851.00

Chassis Grease: NL GI #2 Grease Per Pound 1,000 Pounds $4.42 $4,420.00 $4.927 $4,927.00

SAE 5W20 Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $17.56 $35,120.00 $13.32 $26,640.00

$243,950.00

$234,097.00

QUANTITY

Sprague's Supply/NAPA

(Columbus, GA)

Whatley Oil Company

(Columbus, GA)

Boswell Oil Company

(Athens, GA)

Y   E   A   R        T   W   O

UNIT

$265,290.00

$245,650.00

Y   E   A   R        O   N   E

Description/Vendors

$235,358.00

Y   E   A   R        T   H   R   E   E

GRAND TOTAL COST $227,450.00 $232,626.00

GRAND TOTAL COST

GRAND TOTAL COST

Method of Delivery

Delivery will be made within __ hours after receipt of order.

x Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump

24-48 hours except bulk items.

 Bulk Tank  Drums Truck w/Pump

24 hours

x Bulk Tank x Drums Truck w/Pump

36 hours

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$257,525.00

OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR METRA (ANNUAL CONTRACT) (continued)

RFB No. 20-0026


