
RESOLUTION NO. R2025-34  
 

RESOLUTION AND ORDER BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BURNET, TEXAS, CANVASSING THE RETURNS AND DECLARING 
THE RESULTS OF THE CITY OF BURNET, MAY 3, 2025, GENERAL 
ELECTION  
  

WHEREAS, in accordance with State Law and the Home Rule Charter of the City of 
Burnet, an election was held on May 3, 2025 for the purpose of electing one (1) Mayor 
and three (3) City Council Members; and  
 
WHEREAS, the City Secretary has certified that Anthony Francisco, Gary Wideman, and 
Cliff Hirneisen applied to be on the ballot for the office of Mayor; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Secretary has certified that Ricky Langley, Joyce Laudenschlager, 
Tres Clinton, and Dennis Langley applied to be on the ballot for the office of City Council 
Member; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed and investigated all matters pertaining to this 
election, to include the ordering, notices, election officers, holding and returns thereof; 
and 
 
WHEREAS, appearing from said returns, votes duly and legally made, that there were 
cast at said election 312 valid and legal votes in the mayoral election and 645 valid and 
legal votes in the council election; and 
 
WHEREAS, the returns of said election having been duly canvassed by the City Council, 
and there being cast at said election of a total of 312 votes in the mayoral election and 
645 votes in the council election, and each of the candidates in said election having 
received the following votes, to wit: 
 

POSITION OF Mayor (1 for Full Term) 
 

CANDIDATE ABSENTEE EARLY MAY 3rd  TOTAL 

Anthony Francisco 2 60 63 125 

Gary Wideman 5 122 47 174 

Cliff Hirneisen 0 8 5 13 

  
    POSITION OF COUNCIL MEMBER (3 for Full Term) 
 

CANDIDATE ABSENTEE EARLY MAY 3rd  TOTAL 

Ricky Langley 2 109 45 156 

Joyce Laudenschlager 5 107 67 179 

Tres Clinton 3 112 81 196 

Dennis Langley 2 74 38 114 



         
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
BURNET, TEXAS: 
 
Section One.  The City Council officially finds, determines, and declares that the election 
was duly and properly ordered, that proper legal notice of such election was duly given in 
the English language and the Spanish language, that proper election officers were duly 
appointed prior to the election, that the election was duly and legally held, that all resident 
qualified electors of the City were permitted to vote at the election and due returns of the 
results of the election had been made and delivered, and that the City of Burnet has duly 
canvassed such returns, all in accordance with the laws of the State of Texas and of the 
United States of America and the Resolution R2025-02 calling the election. 
 
Section Two. The election was duly called; that notice of said election was given in 
accordance with law; and Gary Wideman was duly elected Mayor for a term of two years; 
and Ricky Langley, Joyce Laudenschlager, and Tres Clinton were duly elected Council 
Members for a term of two years. Each of the said above named parties are hereby 
declared duly elected to said office, subject to the taking of their oaths of office as provided 
by the laws of the State of Texas and the City of Burnet, Texas. 

 

Section Three. It is hereby officially found and determined that the meeting at which this 
resolution is passed was open to the public as required and that public notice of the time, 
place, and purpose of said meeting was given as required by the Open Meetings Act, 
Chapter §551, Tex. Gov't. Code, having been posted and remaining posted continuously 
for at least 72 hours preceding the date of this meeting. 

 
 
Passed and approved on this the 13th day of May 2025. 
 
        City of Burnet 
 
 
        _________________________ 
        Gary Wideman, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
________________________________ 
Maria Gonzales, City Secretary 
 


