














































PIPE AND APPURTENANCE 

BRASS LOW LEAD NON COMPRESSION

COB ID Description Specification OR Specification OR Specification
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL Alternate Brand

A001 3/4" SOFT COPPER Type K Soft Copper (LF) DOMESTIC ONLY 1.00  $        7.00  $        7.00 

A002 1" SOFT COPPER Type K Soft Copper (LF) DOMESTIC ONLY 625.00  $        8.89  $ 5,553.16 

A003 1 1/2" HARD COPPER Type L Hard Copper (LF) 1.25  $      14.48  $      18.10 

A004 2" HARD COPPER Type L Hard Copper (LF) 50.00  $      22.20  $ 1,109.77 

A005 3” Hard Copper Type L Hard Copper (LF) 1.25  $      36.30  $      45.37 

A006 3/4" I.P. INLINE CURB STOP (LONG) FORD BL11-233W-NL OR MUELLER B20245RN 50.00  $      42.92  $ 2,145.98 AY MCDONALD

A007 3/4" I.P. INLINE CURB STOP (REGULAR) FORD BH11-233W-NL OR MUELLER B20200RN 6.25  $      44.20  $    276.22 AY MCDONALD

A008 3/4" I.P. ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV13-332W-NL OR MUELLER H14265N 56.25  $      37.39  $ 2,103.23 AY MCDONALD

A009 3/4" BRASS I.P. STREET 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      16.09  $      20.11 Merit

A010 3/4" BRASS I.P. FEMALE X FEMALE 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      11.69  $      14.61 Merit

A011 3/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE DOMESTIC 6.25  $        2.18  $      13.65 Merit

A012 3/4" BRASS I.P. COUPLING DOMESTIC 6.25  $      10.26  $      64.15 Merit

A013 1" I.P. INLINE CURB STOP FORD B11-444W-NL OR MUELLER B20200N 1.25  $      98.66  $    123.32 AY MCDONALD

A014 1" I.P. ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV13-444W-NL OR MUELLER H14265N 1.25  $      57.32  $      71.65 AY MCDONALD

A015 1" X 3/4" I.P. ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV13-342W-NL OR MUELLER H14265N 1.25  $      39.92  $      49.90 AY MCDONALD

A016 1" BRASS I.P. STREET 90 DOMESTIC 22.50  $      26.32  $    592.24 Merit

A017 1" BRASS I.P. FEMALE X FEMALE 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      19.01  $      23.76 Merit

A018 1" BRASS CLOSE NIPPLE DOMESTIC 6.25  $        3.22  $      20.11 Merit

A019 1" BRASS I.P. COUPLING DOMESTIC 1.25  $      17.51  $      21.88 Merit

A020 2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE DOMESTIC 2.50  $      21.22  $      53.05 Merit

A021 1" X 3/4" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-34-NL OR MUELLER 47165N OR DOMESTIC 6.25  $        6.39  $      39.94 

A022 1" CC X 3/4" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD BBAA-43-NL OR MUELLER H10036N OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $      18.94  $      23.68 AY MCDONALD

A023 1 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-36-NL OR MUELLER 47168N OR DOMESTIC 6.25  $      25.89  $    161.78 

A024 2" X 3/4" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-37-NL OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $      26.98  $      33.72 

A025 1 1/4" X 1" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-54-NL OR DOMESTIC 6.25  $      23.56  $    147.27 

A026 1 1/2" X 1" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-46-NL OR MUELLER 47169N OR DOMESTIC 6.25  $      25.89  $    161.78 

A027 2" X 1" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-47-NL OR MUELLER 47164N OR DOMESTIC 6.25  $      24.99  $    156.18 

A028 2" X 1 1/2" BRASS HEX BUSHING FORD C18-67-NL OR MUELLER 47172N OR DOMESTIC 16.25  $      24.92  $    404.94 

A029 1 1/2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE DOMESTIC 5.00  $        6.21  $      31.03 Merit

A030 1 1/2" BRASS I.P. COUPLING DOMESTIC 1.25  $      38.01  $      47.51 Merit

A031 2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE DOMESTIC 12.50  $        9.45  $    118.10 Merit

A032 2" BRASS I.P. COUPLING DOMESTIC 2.50  $      62.85  $    157.13 Merit

A033 1 1/2" BRASS STREET 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      52.61  $      65.76 Merit

A034 1 1/2" BRASS FEMALE X FEMALE 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      44.85  $      56.06 Merit

A035 2" BRASS STREET 90 DOMESTIC 2.50  $      89.16  $    222.90 Merit

A036 2" BRASS FEMALE X FEMALE 90 DOMESTIC 1.25  $      66.80  $      83.51 Merit

A037 2" I.P. X FLANGE ANGLE CURB STOP FORD FV13-777W-NL OR MUELLER H14286N 1.25  $    208.49  $    260.62 AY MCDONALD

A038 3/4" METER SPUD FORD C38-23-2.5-NL OR EQUAL WITH HEXAGON OUTSIDE 375.00  $      11.70  $ 4,387.93 AY MCDONALD

A039 1" METER SPUD FORD C38-44-2.625-NL OR EQUAL WITH HEXAGON OUTSIDE 125.00  $      18.02  $ 2,252.87 AY MCDONALD

A040 1” X ¾” METER ADAPTER (LONG) – (SOLD IN PAIRS) A24-NL 1.25  $      29.94  $      37.43 AY MCDONALD

A041 1" X 3/4" METER COUPLING BUSHING FORD BBIM-34-NL OR MUELLER H10889-99000N OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $      16.68  $      20.85 

A042 1 1/2" METER FLANGE FORD CF31-66-NL OR MUELLER OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $      52.09  $      65.11 AY MCDONALD

A043 2" METER FLANGE SLOTTED FOR 2" & 1 1/2" FORD CF31-77-NL OR MUELLER OR DOMESTIC 12.50  $      68.01  $    850.14 AY MCDONALD

A044 7" METER RISER for 5/8" x 3/4" FORD V42-7W-NL OR MUELLER H14118N OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    110.59  $    138.23 AY MCDONALD

A045 12" METER RISER for 5/8" x 3/4" FORD V42-12W-NL OR MUELLER H14118N OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    115.91  $    144.89 AY MCDONALD

A046 18" METER RISER for 5/8" x 3/4" FORD V42-18W-NL OR MUELLER EQUIVALENT OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    137.62  $    172.03 AY MCDONALD

A047 24" METER RISER for 5/8" x 3/4" FORD V42-24W-NL OR MUELLER EQUIVALENT OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    147.39  $    184.24 AY MCDONALD

A048 12" METER RISER for 1" FORD V44-12W-NL OR MUELLER EQUIVALENT OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    216.23  $    270.29 AY MCDONALD

A049 18" METER RISER for 1" FORD V44-18W-NL OR MUELLER EQUIVALENT OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    258.11  $    322.64 AY MCDONALD

A050 24" METER RISER for 1" FORD V44-24W-NL OR MUELLER EQUIVALENT OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $    280.69  $    350.86 AY MCDONALD

A051 3/4" BRASS PLUG DOMESTIC 1.25  $        7.31  $        9.14 Merit

A052 3/4" BRASS CAP DOMESTIC 1.25  $        7.31  $        9.14 Merit

A053 1" BRASS PLUG DOMESTIC 12.50  $      11.69  $    146.12 Merit

A054 1" BRASS CAP DOMESTIC 1.25  $      14.07  $      17.59 Merit

A055 1 1/2" BRASS PLUG DOMESTIC 1.25  $      20.47  $      25.59 Merit

A056 1 1/2" BRASS CAP DOMESTIC 1.25  $      20.47  $      25.59 Merit

A057 2" BRASS PLUG DOMESTIC 1.25  $      52.61  $      65.76 Merit

A058 2" BRASS CAP DOMESTIC 1.25  $      52.61  $      65.76 Merit

A059 3/4" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLY PIPE FORD INSERT-51 OR MUELLER 504281 OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $        2.14  $        2.67 AY MCDONALD

A060 1" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLY PIPE FORD INSERT-52 OR MUELLER 504385 OR DOMESTIC 125.00  $        2.28  $    284.48 AY MCDONALD

A061 1 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLY PIPE FORD INSERT-54 OR MUELLER 506139 OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $        3.13  $        3.91 AY MCDONALD

A062 2" STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLY PIPE FORD INSERT-55 OR MUELLER 506141 OR DOMESTIC 1.25  $        3.13  $        3.91 AY MCDONALD

BRASS LOW LEAD COMPRESSION

COB ID Description Specification OR Specification OR Specification
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

B001 3/4" GJ(CTS) INLINE BULLHEAD FORD U48-33-6.5-G-NL OR MUELLER G15363N 1.25  $      49.49  $      61.87 

B002 3/4" GJ(CTS) ANGLE BULLHEAD UA48-43-6.5-G-NL 12.50  $      52.05  $    650.57 AY MCDONALD

B003 3/4" CORPORATION STOP FORD F1000-3-G-NL OR MUELLER G15008N 1.25  $      39.30  $      49.12 AY MCDONALD

B004 3/4" GJ(CTS) IN-LINE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD B43-332W-G-NL OR MUELLER G24350N 1.25  $      82.89  $    103.61 AY MCDONALD

B005 3/4" GJ(CTS) IN-LINE CURB STOP FORD B41-333W-G-NL OR MUELLER G25170N 1.25  $      72.38  $      90.47 AY MCDONALD

B006 3/4" GJ(CTS) ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV43-332W-G-NL OR MUELLER G14258N 18.75  $      47.83  $    896.77 AY MCDONALD

B007 3/4" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. FORD C84-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15428N 1.25  $      18.02  $      22.53 AY MCDONALD

B008 3/4" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C14-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15451N 1.25  $      18.95  $      23.69 AY MCDONALD

B009 3/4" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L84-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15531N 12.50  $      19.71  $    246.41 AY MCDONALD

B010 3/4" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. 90 FORD L14-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15533N 6.25  $      25.57  $    159.84 AY MCDONALD

B011 3/4" GJ(CTS) COUPLING FORD C44-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15403N 1.25  $      21.93  $      27.41 AY MCDONALD

B012 3/4" GJ(CTS) 90 FORD L44-33-G-NL OR MUELLER G15526N 6.25  $      28.33  $    177.08 AY MCDONALD

B013 3/4" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. FORD C87-33-NL OR MUELLER E15429N 1.25  $      23.89  $      29.86 AY MCDONALD

B014 3/4" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C17-33-NL OR MUELLER E15454N 1.25  $      23.70  $      29.63 AY MCDONALD

B015 3/4" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L87-33-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      26.34  $    329.31 AY MCDONALD

B016 3/4" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. 90 FORD L17-33-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      37.53  $    469.11 AY MCDONALD

B017 3/4" PJ(PVC) COUPLING FORD C77-33-NL OR MUELLER E15443N 1.25  $      32.03  $      40.04 AY MCDONALD

B018 3/4" PJ(PVC) 90 FORD L77-33-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      37.90  $    473.71 AY MCDONALD

B019 1" GJ(CTS) INLINE BULLHEAD FORD U48-43-6.5-G-NL OR MUELLER G15363N 2.50  $      52.05  $    130.11 AY MCDONALD

B020 1" GJ(CTS) ANGLE BULLHEAD FORD UA41-43-65-NL OR MUELLER 2.50  $      61.17  $    152.93 AY MCDONALD

B021 1" CORPORATION STOP FORD F1000-4-G-NL OR MUELLER G15008N 15.00  $      59.45  $    891.72 AY MCDONALD

B022 1" GJ(CTS) INLINE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD B43-444W-G-NL OR MUELLER G24350N 1.25  $    122.47  $    153.09 AY MCDONALD

B023 1" GJ(CTS) INLINE CURB STOP FORD B41-444W-G-NL OR MUELLER G25170N 5.00  $    109.83  $    549.14 AY MCDONALD

B024 1" GJ(CTS) ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV43-444W-G-NL OR MUELLER G14258N 25.00  $      65.44  $ 1,635.92 AY MCDONALD

B025 1" X 3/4" GJ(CTS) ANGLE CURB STOP W/ SWIVEL NUT FORD KV43-342W-G-NL OR MUELLER G14258N 2.50  $      52.89  $    132.21 AY MCDONALD

B026 1" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. FORD C84-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15428N 1.25  $      21.34  $      26.68 AY MCDONALD

B027 1" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C14-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15451N 6.25  $      25.70  $    160.63 AY MCDONALD

B028 1" X 3/4" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. FORD C84-34-G-NL OR MUELLER G15428N 1.25  $      19.94  $      24.93 AY MCDONALD

B029 1" X 3/4" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C14-34-G-NL OR MUELLER G15451N 1.25  $      22.32  $      27.90 AY MCDONALD

B030 1" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L84-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15531N 1.25  $      32.83  $      41.03 AY MCDONALD

B031 1" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. 90 FORD L14-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15533N 1.25  $      41.68  $      52.10 AY MCDONALD

B032 1" X 3/4" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L84-34-G-NL OR MUELLER G15531N 1.25  $      26.75  $      33.43 AY MCDONALD

B033 1" GJ(CTS) COUPLING FORD C44-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15403N 18.75  $      25.09  $    470.47 AY MCDONALD

B034 1" GJ(CTS) 90 FORD L44-44-G-NL OR MUELLER G15526N 5.00  $      36.46  $    182.30 AY MCDONALD

B035 1" X 3/4" GJ(CTS) COUPLING FORD C44-34-G-NL OR MUELLER G15403N 1.25  $      25.48  $      31.85 AY MCDONALD

B036 1" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. FORD C87-44-NL OR MUELLER V15440N 12.50  $      37.22  $    465.23 AY MCDONALD

B037 1" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C17-44-NL OR MUELLER V15442N 12.50  $      36.54  $    456.75 AY MCDONALD

B038 1" X 3/4" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. FORD C87-34-NL OR MUELLER V15440N 1.25  $      35.62  $      44.53 AY MCDONALD

B039 1" X 3/4" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C17-34-NL OR MUELLER V15442N 6.25  $      37.33  $    233.33 AY MCDONALD

B040 1" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L87-44-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      43.06  $    538.22 AY MCDONALD

B041 1" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. 90 FORD L17-44-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      37.05  $    463.07 AY MCDONALD

B042 1" X 3/4" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. 90 FORD L87-34-NL OR MUELLER 6.25  $      43.68  $    272.99 

B043 1" PJ(PVC) COUPLING FORD C77-44-NL OR MUELLER V15441N 6.25  $      54.40  $    340.01 AY MCDONALD

B044 1" PJ(PVC) 90 FORD L77-44-NL OR MUELLER 12.50  $      66.95  $    836.93 AY MCDONALD

B045 1" X 3/4" PJ(PVC) COUPLING FORD C77-34-NL OR MUELLER V15441N 6.25  $      43.71  $    273.20 AY MCDONALD

B046 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) 90 FORD L44-66-G-NL OR MUELLER G15526N 1.25  $    116.97  $    146.21 AY MCDONALD

B047 1 1/2" PJ(PVC) 90 FORD L77-66-NL OR MUELLER 1.25  $    153.01  $    191.26 AY MCDONALD

B048 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) COUPLING FORD C44-66-G-NL OR MUELLER G15403N 1.25  $      83.97  $    104.96 AY MCDONALD

B049 1 1/2" PJ(PVC) COUPLING FORD C77-66-NL OR MUELLER V15441N 1.25  $    106.17  $    132.72 AY MCDONALD

B050 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. FORD C84-66-G-NL OR MUELLER G15428N 1.25  $      58.45  $      73.06 AY MCDONALD

B051 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C14-66-G-NL OR MUELLER G15451N 1.25  $      74.78  $      93.48 AY MCDONALD

B052 1 1/2" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. FORD C87-66-NL OR MUELLER V15440N 1.25  $      73.23  $      91.54 AY MCDONALD

B053 1 1/2" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C17-66-NL OR MUELLER V15442N 1.25  $      83.09  $    103.86 AY MCDONALD

B054 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) X FLANGE ANGLE CURB STOP FORD FV43-666W-G-NL OR MUELLER G14277N 1.25  $    222.87  $    278.59 AY MCDONALD

B055 1 1/2" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE INLINE CURB STOP FORD B41-666W-G-NL OR MUELLER G25170N 1.25  $    236.52  $    295.65 AY MCDONALD

B056 2" GJ(CTS) COUPLING FORD C44-77-G-NL OR MUELLER 1.25  $    113.39  $    141.74 AY MCDONALD

B057 2" GJ(CTS) 90 FORD L44-77-G-NL OR MUELLER G15526N 3.75  $    236.64  $    887.41 AY MCDONALD

B058 2" PJ(PVC) 90 FORD L77-77-NL OR MUELLER 1.25  $    256.45  $    320.56 AY MCDONALD

B059 2" GJ(CTS) X MALE I.P. FORD C84-77-G-NL OR MUELLER G15428N 3.75  $      85.16  $    319.35 AY MCDONALD

B060 2" GJ(CTS) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C14-77-G-NL OR MUELLER G15451N 3.75  $      89.01  $    333.79 AY MCDONALD

B061 2" PJ(PVC) X FLANGE ANGLE CURB STOP FORD FV73-777W-NL OR MUELLER 1.25  $    480.30  $    600.37 AY MCDONALD



B062 2" PJ(PVC) COUPLING FORD C77-77-NL OR MUELLER 2.50  $    160.59  $    401.47 AY MCDONALD

B063 2" PJ(PVC) X MALE I.P. FORD C87-77-NL OR MUELLER V15440N 3.75  $    106.38  $    398.92 AY MCDONALD

B064 2" PJ(PVC) X FEMALE I.P. FORD C17-77-NL OR MUELLER V15442N 2.50  $    122.26  $    305.66 AY MCDONALD

B065 2" GJ(CTS) X FLANGE ANGLE CURB STOP FORD FV43-777W-G-NL OR MUELLER G14277N 2.50  $    286.10  $    715.26 AY MCDONALD

B066 2” PJ(PVC) X FLANGE ANGLE CURB STOP FORD FV73-777W-NL OR MUELLER 1.25  $    480.30  $    600.37 AY MCDONALD

DRESSER COUPLINGS

COB ID Description Specifications Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

C001 3/4" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $            -   No-Bid (Not made)

C002 1" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSING COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $            -   No-Bid (Not made)

C003 2" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSING COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    142.14  $    177.67 

C004 2" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 8.75  $    142.14  $ 1,243.71 

C005 3" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    187.51  $    234.38 

C006 4" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    240.28  $    300.34 

C007 6" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 2.50  $    318.21  $    795.52 

C008 8" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    359.26  $    449.08 

C009 8" FOUR BOLT CAST IRON COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $            -    $            -   No-Bid (Not made)

C010 10" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    462.17  $    577.72 

C011 10" SIX BOLT CAST IRON DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    488.67  $    610.83 

C012 12" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    200.68  $    250.85 

C013 12" SIX BOLT CAST IRON DRESSER COUPLING HYMAX 1.25  $    652.62  $    815.78 

C014 4" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      26.11  $      32.64 

C015 4" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 1.25  $      47.22  $      59.02 

C016 6" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      30.71  $      38.39 

C017 6" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 2.50  $      59.11  $    147.79 

C018 8" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      46.15  $      57.69 

C019 8" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 2.50  $      79.75  $    199.37 

C020 10" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      68.39  $      85.49 

C021 10" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 1.25  $    138.85  $    173.56 

C022 12" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      99.66  $    124.57 

C023 12" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 2.50  $    145.72  $    364.31 

C024 16" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $    188.78  $    235.98 

C025 16" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 1.25  $    300.24  $    375.30 

C026 3” MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      24.64  $      30.80 

C027 3” MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PVC MEGA LUGS AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET 1.25  $      43.86  $      54.83 

C028 4” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      31.62  $      39.53 

C029 6” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      38.43  $      48.03 

C030 8” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $      56.82  $      71.02 

C031 10” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $    107.38  $    134.22 

C032 12” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $    113.08  $    141.35 

C033 16” MEGA LUGS FOR PVC MEGA LUGS 1.25  $    250.80  $    313.51 

LEAK CLAMPS

COB ID Description Specifications Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

D001 2" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 1.25  $    144.75  $    180.93 

D002 4" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 7.50  $    170.17  $ 1,276.29 

D003 6" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 10.00  $    234.76  $ 2,347.59 

D004 6" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP Smith Blair 3.75  $    280.63  $ 1,052.37 

D005 6" X 18" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 2.50  $    371.72  $    929.31 

D006 6" X 24" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 2.50  $    465.76  $ 1,164.40 

D007 8" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 8.75  $    244.83  $ 2,142.24 

D008 8" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP Smith Blair 1.25  $    312.95  $    391.19 

D009 8" X 16" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 1.25  $    281.40  $    351.75 

D010 8" X 24" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 1.25  $    512.77  $    640.96 

D011 10" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 1.25  $    311.79  $    389.74 

D012 10" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP Smith Blair 1.25  $    470.63  $    588.29 

D013 12" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP Smith Blair 1.25  $    377.14  $    471.42 

D014 12" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP Smith Blair 1.25  $    466.94  $    583.68 

TAPPING SADDLES

COB ID Description Specifications Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

E001 2" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      23.41  $      29.27 

E002 4" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      27.05  $      33.81 

E003 6" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      33.53  $      41.91 

E004 8" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      40.23  $      50.29 

E005 10" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      46.86  $      58.58 

E006 12" X 3/4" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      50.39  $      62.99 

E007 2" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 7.50  $      23.41  $    175.60 

E008 4" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      27.05  $      33.81 

E009 6" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      34.14  $      42.67 

E010 8" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      40.23  $      50.29 

E011 10" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      46.86  $      58.58 

E012 12" X 1" CC THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      50.39  $      62.99 

E013 4" X 2" I.P. THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      37.84  $      47.30 

E014 6" X 2" I.P. THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      47.22  $      59.02 

E015 8" X 2" I.P. THREAD Smith Blair 6.25  $      59.63  $    372.70 

E016 10" X 2" I.P. THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      72.01  $      90.01 

E017 12" X 2" I.P. THREAD Smith Blair 1.25  $      73.33  $      91.67 

SEWER FITTINGS & COUPLINGS

COB ID Description Specifications Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

F001 3” GEM CAP NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $        2.09  $        2.61 

F002 3" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 12.50  $        4.17  $      52.16 

F003 4” GEM CAP NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $        2.57  $        3.22 

F004 4" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $        5.15  $        6.44 

F005 4" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $        5.15  $      12.87 

F006 4" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 25.00  $        4.78  $    119.54 

F007 6" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      11.03  $      27.59 

F008 6" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 6.25  $      11.03  $      68.97 

F009 6" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 12.50  $      11.03  $    137.93 

F010 8" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      16.92  $      21.15 

F011 8" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      16.92  $      42.30 

F012 8" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      16.92  $      42.30 

F013 10" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      22.90  $      28.62 

F014 10" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      22.90  $      28.62 

F015 10" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      22.90  $      28.62 

F016 12" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      27.37  $      34.21 

F017 12" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      27.37  $      34.21 

F018 12" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      27.37  $      34.21 

F019 15" PVC/CAST IRON X CLAY NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      42.20  $      52.74 

F020 15" PVC/CAST IRON X CONCRETE NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      42.20  $      52.74 

F021 15" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      42.20  $      52.74 

F022 4" SEWER SADDLE FERNCO TST-4 OR EQUIVALENT 22.50  $      41.46  $    932.84 PIPECONX

F023 6" WYE SEWER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      43.84  $      54.80 

F024 6" 45 GASKETED ELBOW SEWER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      22.49  $      28.11 

F025 8" 90 GASKETED ELBOW SEWER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      25.63  $      32.04 

F026 3" x 4" PVC/CAST IRON X PVC/CAST IRON 32.00  $        5.56  $    178.02 

YARD

COB ID Description Specifications Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

G001 PVC PIPE 2" X 20’ BELLED SCH-40 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 75.00  $        1.78  $    133.50 Vulcan Block 440

G002 PVC PIPE 3" SCH-40 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 50.00  $        3.69  $    184.50 Vulcan Block 440

G003 4" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS C900 DR18 275.00  $        6.26  $ 1,721.50 Block 460

G004 6" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS C900 DR18 150.00  $      12.80  $ 1,920.00 Block 460

G005 8" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS C900 DR18 150.00  $      21.94  $ 3,291.00 Block 460

G006 10" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS C900 DR18 1.25  $      32.92  $      41.15 Block 460

G007 12" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS C900 DR18 1.25  $      46.35  $      57.94 Block 460

G008 16" X 20' PVC PIPE C-900 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $            -   

G009 4" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 245.00  $        2.47  $    605.15 Block 460

G010 6" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 245.00  $        5.72  $ 1,401.40 Block 460

G011 8" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 35.00  $      10.41  $    364.35 Block 460

G012 10" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      16.17  $      20.21 Block 460

G013 12" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      30.83  $      38.54 Block 460

G014 15" X 14' SDR-35 (LF) NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      46.28  $      57.85 Block 460

G015 24” MANHOLE RING AND LID w/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO
W/ CITY OF BURLESON 

LOGO AND "DIPPED"
AND BASS & HAYS OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC 6.25  $    344.00  $ 2,150.00 

G016 24” MANHOLE LID ONLY w/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO
W/ CITY OF BURLESON 

LOGO AND "DIPPED"
AND BASS & HAYS OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC 6.25  $    314.34  $ 1,964.66 

G017 30” MANHOLE RING AND LID w/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO
W/ CITY OF BURLESON 

LOGO AND "DIPPED"
AND BASS & HAYS OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC 1.25  $    572.94  $    716.18 



G018 30” MANHOLE LID ONLY w/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO
W/ CITY OF BURLESON 

LOGO AND "DIPPED"
AND BASS & HAYS OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC 1.25  $    307.61  $    384.51 

G019 24” MANHOLE LID ONLY STAR OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT IMPORT 6.25  $            -   No-Bid

G020 30” MANHOLE LID ONLY IMPORT 6.25  $            -   No-Bid

G021 2 1/2" Metal MANHOLE RISER Ring NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $            -   No-Bid

G022 24" X 2" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      24.14  $      60.34 

G023 24” x 3” CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      31.03  $      77.59 

G024 24" X 4" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      33.33  $      83.33 

G025 30" X 2" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      31.03  $      77.59 

G026 30” X 3” CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      37.93  $      94.83 

G027 30" X 4" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $      44.83  $    112.07 

G028 36" OD X 24" ID X 3/4" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  SP-C3624F075 2.50  $      42.24  $    105.60 

G029 36" OD X 24" ID X 1" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  C3624F100 2.50  $      46.82  $    117.04 

G030 36" OD X 24" ID X 1.25" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  C3624F125 2.50  $      53.67  $    134.17 

G031 36" OD X 24" ID X 1.50" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  C3624F150 2.50  $      60.52  $    151.29 

G032 36" OD X 24" ID X 1.75" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  C3624F175 2.50  $      65.08  $    162.70 

G033 36" OD X 24" ID X 2" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  C3624F200 2.50  $      74.22  $    185.55 

G034 36" OD X 24" ID X 2.25 CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  SP-C3624F225 2.50  $      86.77  $    216.93 

G035 36" OD X 24" ID X 2.50 CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  SP-C3624F250 2.50  $      86.77  $    216.93 

G036 36" OD X 24" ID X 4" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  SP-C3624G400F 7.50  $    127.89  $    959.14 

G037 36" OD X 24" ID X 6" CRETEX PRO RING RISER CRETEX PRO RING  SP-C3624G600F 10.00  $    176.98  $ 1,769.77 

G038 M-1 ADHESIVE 28OZ CARTRIDGE SP-CM1ADHESIVE 1.25  $      30.00  $      37.50 

G039 255 CAULK DISPENSER GUN SP-C22CAULKGUN 1.25  $      20.00  $      25.00 

G040 SHORTY STACK AND LID NO SPECIFICATIONS 12.50  $      67.01  $    837.64 

G041 SHORTY STACK (LID ONLY) NO SPECIFICATIONS 7.50  $      15.17  $    113.79 

G042 VALVE BOX LID ONLY NO SPECIFICATIONS 6.25  $      14.79  $      92.46 

G043 1" VALVE BOX LID RISER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      18.91  $      23.64 

G044 2" VALVE BOX LID RISER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      24.66  $      30.82 

G045 4" VALVE BOX LID RISER NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      36.16  $      45.20 

G046 VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID SHORT (18"-24") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      76.44  $    286.64 

G047 VALVE BOX TOP SECTION ONLY (18"-24") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      20.55  $      77.07 

G048 VALVE BOX BOTTOM SECTION ONLY (18"-24") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      38.63  $    144.87 

G049 VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID LONG (24"-36") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      96.98  $    363.66 

G050 VALVE BOX TOP SECTION ONLY (24"-36") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      28.11  $    105.43 

G051 VALVE BOX BOTTOM SECTION ONLY (24"-36") NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      38.63  $    144.87 

G052 6" X 12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE/COUPLING NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $      99.13  $    371.72 

G053 8" X 12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE/COUPLING NO SPECIFICATIONS 3.75  $    159.31  $    597.41 

G054 10" X 12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE/COUPLING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $    190.67  $    476.67 

G055 12" X 12" MJ CAST IRON SLEEVE/COUPLING NO SPECIFICATIONS 2.50  $    256.41  $    641.03 

G056 6" MJ CAST IRON TEE NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $    156.78  $    195.98 

G057 8" MJ CAST IRON TEE NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $    234.67  $    293.33 

G058 6" MJ CAST IRON CAPS NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      44.51  $      55.63 

G059 8" MJ CAST IRON CAPS NO SPECIFICATIONS 1.25  $      72.83  $      91.03 

VALVE & HYDRANT

MUELLER OR APPROVED EQUAL WITH R.W. GATE VALVE, EPOXY COATED

COB ID Description Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

H001 2" I.P. X I.P. HANDWHEEL VALVE  ( DOMESTIC) 2.50  $    434.97  $ 1,087.41 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H002 2" I.P. X I.P. SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 2.50  $    434.97  $ 1,087.41 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H003 2" I.P. X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $            -   No-Bid

H004 2" FLANGE X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    445.93  $    557.41 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H005 4" MJ X MJ SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    712.76  $    890.95 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H006 4" MJ X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    712.76  $    890.95 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H007 4" FLANGE X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    706.67  $    883.33 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H008 6" MJ X MJ SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    909.53  $ 1,136.91 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H009 6" MJ X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    909.53  $ 1,136.91 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H010 6" FLANGE X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $    944.25  $ 1,180.32 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H011 8" MJ X MJ SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $ 1,448.67  $ 1,810.83 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H012 8" MJ X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 2.50  $ 1,421.25  $ 3,553.13 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H013 8" FLANGE X FLANGE SQUARE NUT VALVE  (DOMESTIC) 1.25  $ 1,476.08  $ 1,845.10 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H014 4' BURIED HYDRANT - SILVER IN COLOR CLOW MEDALLION OR MUELLER SUPER CENTURION OR EJ WaterMaster 5CD250 2.50  $ 2,977.80  $ 7,444.51 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H015 5' BURIED HYDRANT - SILVER IN COLOR CLOW MEDALLION OR MUELLER SUPER CENTURION OR EJ WaterMaster 5CD250 2.50  $ 3,116.15  $ 7,790.37 KENNEDY AIS STANDARD

H016 2” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $        7.61  $        9.51 

H017 3” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $        9.21  $      11.51 

H018 4” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $      13.24  $      16.55 

H019 6” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $      20.37  $      25.46 

H020 8” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $      23.21  $      29.01 

H021 10” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $      49.68  $      62.10 

H022 12” FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT 1.25  $      55.14  $      68.92 

METER BOXES

COB ID Description Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

I001 DOUBLE METER BOX ALLIANCE D16-AMR-DU-SB 137.50  $      44.69  $ 6,144.83 DFW16AMRX-12-1 

I002 DOUBLE METER BOX LID ONLY ALLIANCE D16-AMR-DU-SB (LID ONLY) 100.00  $        9.92  $    991.95 DFW1200-1-LID 

I003 BOLTDOWN MINI VAULT ROTEC: D1730-18-BDSM 1.25  $    414.83  $    518.53 DFW1730F-18-1DA

I004 DOUBLE CONCRET METER BOX (BOX ONLY) BHFI CMB18DUAL 2.50  $    103.84  $    259.60 

I005
DOUBLE CONCRETE METER BOX CAST IRON LID (LID 

ONLY)
BHFI CMBB18C 2.50  $      94.46  $    236.15 

I006
DOUBLE CONCRETE METER BOX CAST IRON LID WITH 

PREDRILLED HOLE FOR ONE EXTERNAL ANTENNA (LID 

ONLY)

1.25  $    103.20  $    128.99 

I007 65H CONCRETE VAULT METER BOX (BOX ONLY) BHFI CMB65B65 1.25  $    103.84  $    129.80 

I008
65T CONCRETE VAULT METER BOX CASTI IRON LID (LID 

ONLY)
BHFI B65C 1.25  $    189.14  $    236.42 

I009
65T CONCRETE VAULT METER BOX CAST IRON LID WITH 

PREDRILLED HOLES FOR TWO  EXTERNAL ANTENNAS (LID 

ONLY)

1.25  $    210.01  $    262.51 

I010 38C COMPLETE DOUBLE PLASTIC METER BOX AND LID DFW38C-14-1A 2.50  $    220.99  $    552.47 

I011 38C PLASTIC (LID ONLY) DFW38C-1A-LID 1.25  $      75.60  $      94.50 

ROW CLEANOUT MISC

COB ID Description Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

J001 4" THREADED METAL PLUG MUST BE ABLE TO BE FOUND WITH METAL DETECTOR 12.50  $      40.00  $    500.00 

J002 NDS 6" ROUND BOX 208B 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

J003 NDS 6" ROUND OVERLAPPING COVER - SEWER 107CS 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

J004 NDS 6' ROUND BOX W/ OVERLAPPING COVER -SEWER 208BCS 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

J005 4" 45 DEGREE THIN WALL LONG SWEEP TEE WYE THIN WALL 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

J006 4" GLUE ON HUB X FEMALE THREAD THIN WALL THIN WALL 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

FLUSH VALVE MISC

COB ID Description Specifications
Historical quantity / potential 

estimate for life of contract
COST TOTAL

K001 1" BACK FLOW PREVENTER USC FCCCHR approved 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

K002 1 1/2" HUNTER GLOBE VALVE HUNTER ICV151G, 1-1/2" NPT, 200 PSI 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

K003 HUNTER CONTROLLER HUNTER SVC-100 w/ SOLENOID 12.50  $            -   No-Bid

K004 3" X 2" BRASS TEE Domestic 2.50  $            -   No-Bid

K005 3" PVC THREADED PLUG 6.25 3.30$           $      20.63 

K006 3" SDR35 PVC MALE X GLUE 1.25 16.22$         $      20.28 

K007 3" SDR35 PVC PIPE 1.25  $            -   No-Bid (Not made)

K008 3" SDR35 COUPLING 1.25 2.47$           $        3.09 

K009 4" NDS BOTTOM OUTLET 6.25  $            -   No-Bid

K010 NDS END CAP FOR BOTTOM OUTLET 18.75  $            -   No-Bid

END OF LIST










