

PIPE AND APPURTENANCE

BRASS LOW LEAD NON COMPRESSION				Ferguson				Core and Main				Fortliffe			
COB	Description	Specification	OR	Specification	OR	Specification	Historical quantity / potential estimate for this project	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL		
A001	1/4" SLOTT COPPER	YSP 1 SRR COPPER (PT) DOMESTIC ONLY					5	5.95	5.95	7.53	7.53	No Bids	No Bids		
A002	1/4" SLOTT COPPER	YSP 1 SRR COPPER (PT) DOMESTIC ONLY				625	7.88	4,931.25	6.97	6,231.25	No Bids	No Bids			
A003	1/2" HARD COPPER	YSP 1 THT COPPER (PT)				1	3.77	3.77	2.02	2.02	No Bids	No Bids			
A004	2" HARD COPPER	YSP 1 THT COPPER (PT)				50	15.29	764.50	18.34	917.00	No Bids	No Bids			
A005	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.93	30.93	48.00	48.00	No Bids	No Bids		
A006	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A007	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A008	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A009	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A010	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A011	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A012	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A013	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A014	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A015	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A016	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A017	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A018	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A019	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A020	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A021	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A022	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A023	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18	46.18	No Bids	237.23		
A024	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	27.71	27.71	34.40	34.40	No Bids	1,686.00		
A025	1/4" IN. ANGLE CURB STOP (REGULAR)	FORD B1.1 237V-NL	OR	MULLER B0246RN	OR	DOMESTIC	0	29.43	29.43	46.18					

CRASH LOW LEAD COMPRESSION														
COD #	Part	Description	Specification	OR	Specification	OR	Specification	Historical quantity / potential estimate (see Attachment)	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL
0001	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	60.76	40.76	46.85	57.21	76.80
0002	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	53.52	76.82	65.60	86.00	86.00
0003	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	54.81	46.81	46.81	33.14	41.43
0004	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	73.00	73.00	81.53	102.66	68.89
0005	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	63.78	63.78	73.73	88.69	61.06
0006	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	42.12	860.56	47.36	886.56	46.35
0007	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	51.87	51.87	51.87	51.87	48.85
0008	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	14.68	14.68	14.68	14.68	13.98
0009	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	17.38	225.51	18.54	244.38	16.64
0010	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	136.12	23.58	23.58	23.58	26.11
0011	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	18.32	18.32	21.50	27.18	18.50
0012	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	24.88	149.07	25.40	275.01	23.15
0013	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	20.51	20.51	20.51	20.51	24.60
0014	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	20.87	20.87	25.30	23.35	19.98
0015	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	22.80	22.80	26.30	32.59	22.21
0016	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	27.33	26.63	26.63	26.63	26.63
0017	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	38.22	38.22	36.78	39.70	27.03
0018	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	22.87	22.87	22.87	22.87	33.79
0019	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	46.68	146.03	62.55	151.28	44.69
0020	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	54.81	144.03	62.55	151.28	44.69
0021	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	54.81	144.03	62.55	151.28	44.69
0022	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	54.81	144.03	62.55	151.28	44.69
0023	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	107.91	107.91	118.85	151.71	103.32
0024	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	66.78	40.78	46.85	64.25	82.66
0025	3/4" QUANTITY INLINE CURB STOP	FOR LHM 43.5 G-4	OR	MULLER G2320N				1	8	97.67	1,444.08	94.48	1,322.06	95.21
00														

DRESSER COUPLINGS										
COD E	Description	Specifications	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for 30-yr project	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL
C001	3/4" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 20.18	35.18	\$ 34.49	43.11	No Bid	No Bid
C001	1" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 22.73	31.23	\$ 30.49	44.61	No Bid	No Bid
C002	3" TWO BOLT BLUE DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 41.58	43.58	\$ 43.58	43.58	No Bid	No Bid
C004	2" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 139.73	1,176.57	\$ 146.74	1,275.23	No Bid	No Bid
C005	4" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 230.38	230.38	\$ 230.38	230.38	No Bid	No Bid
C006	4" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 230.38	230.38	\$ 230.38	230.38	No Bid	No Bid
C007	8" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 222.65	877.05	\$ 326.39	815.70	No Bid	No Bid
C008	8" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 222.65	222.65	\$ 222.65	222.65	No Bid	No Bid
C009	8" FOUR BOLT CAST IRON COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 213.93	267.93	\$ 213.45	266.81	No Bid	No Bid
C010	10" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 426.48	426.48	\$ 502.38	526.38	No Bid	No Bid
C011	10" 8X BOLT CAST IRON DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 413.83	413.83	\$ 477.82	477.82	No Bid	No Bid
C012	12" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 502.23	502.23	\$ 569.38	586.45	No Bid	No Bid
C013	12" 8X BOLT CAST IRON DRESSER COUPLING	HYMAX			\$ 502.23	502.23	\$ 569.38	586.45	No Bid	No Bid
C014	4" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 25.34	25.34	\$ 43.31	51.64	No Bid	No Bid
C015	4" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR DAW	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 45.64	45.64	\$ 86.39	100.36	No Bid	No Bid
C016	6" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 29.68	29.68	\$ 48.30	60.73	No Bid	No Bid
C017	6" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR DAW	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 61.64	61.64	\$ 95.36	108.96	No Bid	No Bid
C018	6" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 44.61	44.61	\$ 73.80	91.80	No Bid	No Bid
C019	6" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 77.88	231.24	\$ 128.98	324.83	No Bid	No Bid
C020	10" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 66.12	66.12	\$ 108.18	136.23	No Bid	No Bid
C021	10" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR DAW	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 134.22	134.22	\$ 236.38	287.98	No Bid	No Bid
C022	12" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 96.33	96.33	\$ 157.64	187.05	No Bid	No Bid
C023	12" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR DAW	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 204.48	204.48	\$ 344.94	404.94	No Bid	No Bid
C024	12" MEGA LUGS FOR D1 - PIPE	MEGA LUGS			\$ 152.48	152.48	\$ 250.92	312.24	No Bid	No Bid
C025	16" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR	MEGA LUGS	AND INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		\$ 290.23	290.23	\$ 475.13	593.91	No Bid	No Bid

C026	3" MEGA LUGS FOR D.I. PIPE	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	23.82	\$	23.82	\$	38.98	\$	48.73	No Bid	No Bid
C027	3" MEGA LUGS WITH BOLT & GASKET SET FOR PIPE	MEGA LUGS	AND	INCLUDES BOLT AND GASKET SET		1	\$	42.40	\$	42.40	\$	71.35	\$	89.55	No Bid	No Bid
C028	3" MEGA LUGS FOR PVC	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	38.57	\$	38.57	\$	62.50	\$	78.30	No Bid	No Bid
C029	3" MEGA LUGS FOR HDPE	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	37.55	\$	37.55	\$	61.35	\$	76.55	No Bid	No Bid
C030	3" MEGA LUGS FOR PP	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	54.92	\$	54.92	\$	90.95	\$	117.44	No Bid	No Bid
C031	3" MEGA LUGS FOR POLY	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	100.95	\$	100.95	\$	167.00	\$	212.95	No Bid	No Bid
C032	3" MEGA LUGS FOR PVC	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	39.35	\$	39.35	\$	63.35	\$	79.55	No Bid	No Bid
C033	3" MEGA LUGS FOR HDPE	MEGA LUGS				1	\$	242.44	\$	242.44	\$	395.73	\$	495.93	No Bid	No Bid

COB ID		Description	Specifications	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for file of contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL
C001	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR			1	\$ 132.89	\$ 132.89	\$ 151.95	\$ 189.94	No Bid	No Bid
C002	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR			1	\$ 148.77	\$ 148.77	\$ 170.47	\$ 202.90	No Bid	No Bid
C003	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR		10	\$ 1,209.20	\$ 1,209.20	\$ 1,381.73	\$ 1,554.26	No Bid	No Bid	
C004	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP	SMITH BLAIR			4	\$ 232.35	\$ 232.35	\$ 268.96	\$ 305.57	No Bid	No Bid
C005	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR			3	\$ 254.54	\$ 254.54	\$ 292.62	\$ 330.15	No Bid	No Bid
C006	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR			3	\$ 254.25	\$ 254.25	\$ 292.33	\$ 329.83	No Bid	No Bid
C007	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR		9	\$ 232.99	\$ 232.99	\$ 269.59	\$ 306.18	No Bid	No Bid	
C008	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP	SMITH BLAIR			1	\$ 238.87	\$ 238.87	\$ 278.73	\$ 318.59	No Bid	No Bid
C009	3" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR			1	\$ 258.38	\$ 258.38	\$ 297.99	\$ 337.60	No Bid	No Bid
C010	3" X 24" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 318.72	\$ 318.72	\$ 341.84	\$ 364.96	No Bid	No Bid	
C011	10" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 257.69	\$ 257.69	\$ 297.55	\$ 337.40	No Bid	No Bid	
C012	10" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 277.32	\$ 277.32	\$ 316.18	\$ 355.00	No Bid	No Bid	
C013	12" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 385.97	\$ 385.97	\$ 427.24	\$ 468.51	No Bid	No Bid	
C014	12" X 12" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP W/ 1" CC TAP	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 395.24	\$ 395.24	\$ 436.96	\$ 478.44	No Bid	No Bid	

TOWERS SADDLES											
COB ID	Description	Specifications	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for file of contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	
E001	3" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 53.56	\$ 53.56	\$ 67.87	\$ 84.84	No Bid	No Bid	
E002	3" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 53.48	\$ 53.48	\$ 57.86	\$ 78.24	No Bid	No Bid	
E003	3" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 53.41	\$ 53.41	\$ 56.84	\$ 119.55	No Bid	No Bid	
E004	3" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 58.88	\$ 58.88	\$ 127.25	\$ 151.88	No Bid	No Bid	
E005	10" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 55.85	\$ 55.85	\$ 124.88	\$ 134.88	No Bid	No Bid	
E006	10" X 3/4" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 56.88	\$ 56.88	\$ 125.44	\$ 136.44	No Bid	No Bid	
E007	3" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		9	\$ 53.59	\$ 482.72	\$ 57.87	\$ 599.03	No Bid	No Bid	
E008	3" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 53.59	\$ 53.59	\$ 78.86	\$ 97.80	No Bid	No Bid	
E009	3" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 55.14	\$ 55.14	\$ 86.14	\$ 111.05	No Bid	No Bid	
E010	3" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 58.88	\$ 58.88	\$ 127.25	\$ 137.25	No Bid	No Bid	
E011	10" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 58.88	\$ 58.88	\$ 127.25	\$ 137.25	No Bid	No Bid	
E012	10" X 1" CC THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 56.88	\$ 56.88	\$ 131.05	\$ 155.95	No Bid	No Bid	
E013	3" X 2" P. THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 62.85	\$ 62.85	\$ 122.40	\$ 135.55	No Bid	No Bid	
E014	3" X 2" P. THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 78.88	\$ 78.88	\$ 136.88	\$ 159.88	No Bid	No Bid	
E015	3" X 2" P. THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		9	\$ 68.90	\$ 68.90	\$ 139.71	\$ 155.55	No Bid	No Bid	
E016	10" X 2" P. THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 78.88	\$ 78.88	\$ 136.88	\$ 156.88	No Bid	No Bid	
E017	10" X 2" P. THREAD	SMITH BLAIR		1	\$ 135.74	\$ 135.74	\$ 175.25	\$ 195.25	No Bid	No Bid	

SEWER FITTINGS & COUPLINGS												
COB ID	Description	Specifications	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for file of contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL
F001	3" GEM CAP	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.27	\$ 5.02	\$ 3.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F002	3" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	13	\$ 4.29	\$ 4.29	\$ 5.84	\$ 5.83	\$ 69.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F003	3" GEM CAP	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 5.88	\$ 5.88	\$ 5.88	\$ 4.85	\$ 4.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F004	3" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 5.38	\$ 5.38	\$ 5.38	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F005	3" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 8.80	\$ 8.80	\$ 17.41	\$ 15.85	\$ 15.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F006	3" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	23	\$ 5.88	\$ 135.05	\$ 135.05	\$ 135.05	\$ 135.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F007	3" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	3	\$ 13.59	\$ 40.76	\$ 40.76	\$ 39.84	\$ 39.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F008	3" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	6	\$ 17.72	\$ 106.32	\$ 106.32	\$ 98.54	\$ 98.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F009	3" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	13	\$ 13.59	\$ 176.67	\$ 176.67	\$ 168.80	\$ 168.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F010	3" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 17.70	\$ 17.70	\$ 22.93	\$ 22.93	\$ 22.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F011	3" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	3	\$ 19.13	\$ 57.39	\$ 57.39	\$ 61.93	\$ 61.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F012	3" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 17.70	\$ 17.70	\$ 21.83	\$ 21.83	\$ 21.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F013	10" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F014	10" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F015	10" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F016	10" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F017	10" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F018	10" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	\$ 34.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F019	10" PVC CAST IRON X CLAY	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 26.58	\$ 26.58	\$ 40.13	\$ 40.13	\$ 40.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F020	10" PVC CAST IRON X CONCRETE	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 48.73	\$ 48.73	\$ 62.88	\$ 62.88	\$ 62.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F021	10" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 48.73	\$ 48.73	\$ 62.88	\$ 62.88	\$ 62.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F022	3" SENDER SADDLE	MINIMUM 3/4" OR EQUIVALENT	23	\$ 45.33	\$ 1,042.59	\$ 1,111.51	\$ 51.48	\$ 1,099.03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F023	3" WYE SENDER	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 56.93	\$ 56.93	\$ 56.93	\$ 56.93	\$ 56.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F024	3" GAS GATED ELBOW SENDER	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 23.85	\$ 23.85	\$ 23.85	\$ 38.38	\$ 38.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F025	3" GAS GATED ELBOW SENDER	NO SPECIFICATIONS	1	\$ 75.23	\$ 75.23	\$ 75.23	\$ 112.87	\$ 112.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F026	3" X 4" PVC CAST IRON X PVC CAST IRON	NO SPECIFICATIONS	32	\$ 5.79	\$ 185.58	\$ 185.58	\$ 248.32	\$ 248.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

COB ID	Description	Specifications	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for life of contract	COST	Total	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	
G001	3" PVC PIPE 3" X 30' BELLED SCH 40 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		25	\$ 1.50	\$ 148.32	\$ 2.50	\$ 261.00	No Bid	No Bid	
G002	3" PVC PIPE 3" X 30' BELLED SCH 40 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		50	\$ 1.80	\$ 155.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 354.50	No Bid	No Bid	
G003	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		275	\$ 6.88	\$ 1,879.75	\$ 9.00	\$ 2,741.75	No Bid	No Bid	
G004	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		150	\$ 13.70	\$ 2,055.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 2,825.00	No Bid	No Bid	
G005	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		150	\$ 21.47	\$ 3,241.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 3,624.00	No Bid	No Bid	
G006	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 28.22	\$ 35.22	\$ 52.40	\$ 65.53	No Bid	No Bid	
G007	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 48.50	\$ 71.50	\$ 79.18	\$ 99.23	No Bid	No Bid	
G008	3" X 30' PVC PIPE C 800 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 51.85	\$ 51.85	\$ 148.10	\$ 182.89	No Bid	No Bid	
G009	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		245	\$ 2.44	\$ 599.40	\$ 3.50	\$ 840.40	No Bid	No Bid	
G010	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		245	\$ 1,495.80	\$ 3,637.10	\$ 3,131.93	\$ 4,132.93	No Bid	No Bid	
G011	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		35	\$ 11.34	\$ 389.90	\$ 15.57	\$ 579.95	No Bid	No Bid	
G012	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 17.59	\$ 17.59	\$ 25.21	\$ 32.18	No Bid	No Bid	
G013	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 24.95	\$ 24.95	\$ 37.80	\$ 48.11	No Bid	No Bid	
G014	3" X 14' SDR 35 (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 38.73	\$ 38.73	\$ 56.80	\$ 68.33	No Bid	No Bid	
G015	3" MANHOLE RING AND LID W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC LOGO AND "OPENED"	6	\$ 588.27	\$ 3,935.60	\$ 629.18	\$ 5,832.38	No Bid	No Bid
G016	3" MANHOLE LID ONLY W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC LOGO AND "OPENED"	6	\$ 285.83	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 298.50	\$ 3,669.13	No Bid	No Bid
G017	3" MANHOLE RING AND LID W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC LOGO AND "OPENED"	1	\$ 645.83	\$ 645.83	\$ 726.58	\$ 908.20	No Bid	No Bid
G018	3" MANHOLE LID ONLY W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT DOMESTIC LOGO AND "OPENED"	1	\$ 309.94	\$ 309.94	\$ 348.89	\$ 435.86	No Bid	No Bid
G019	3" MANHOLE LID ONLY	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT IMPORT	6	\$ 151.95	\$ 969.27	\$ 1,584.00	\$ 3,602.83	No Bid	No Bid
G020	3" MANHOLE LID ONLY	W/ CITY OF BURLESON LOGO AND "OPENED"	AND BAGS & HAYS	OR EXACT SIZE EQUIVALENT IMPORT	6	\$ 207.96	\$ 1,607.73	\$ 4,222.00	\$ 5,797.50	No Bid	No Bid
G021	3" X 3" MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 15.35	\$ 45.75	\$ 58.71	\$ 85.73	No Bid	No Bid	
G022	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 15.35	\$ 45.75	\$ 49.17	\$ 67.38	No Bid	No Bid	
G023	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 29.78	\$ 43.17	\$ 34.73	\$ 49.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G024	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 16.47	\$ 48.23	\$ 21.28	\$ 38.93	No Bid	No Bid	
G025	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 28.78	\$ 43.17	\$ 62.33	\$ 85.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G026	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 25.20	\$ 43.17	\$ 75.48	\$ 103.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G027	3" X 3" CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER RING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 28.93	\$ 43.17	\$ 65.83	\$ 85.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G028	3" OD X 24" ID X 3" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P1075		3	\$ 44.61	\$ 133.81	\$ 48.73	\$ 137.13	No Bid	No Bid	
G029	3" OD X 24" ID X 1.5" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P106		3	\$ 68.44	\$ 181.77	\$ 61.77	\$ 154.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G030	3" OD X 24" ID X 1.25" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P125		3	\$ 68.67	\$ 170.06	\$ 68.40	\$ 171.15	No Bid	No Bid	
G031	3" OD X 24" ID X 1.5" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P150		3	\$ 63.89	\$ 151.67	\$ 78.40	\$ 185.15	No Bid	No Bid	
G032	3" OD X 24" ID X 1.75" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P175		3	\$ 68.74	\$ 155.14	\$ 85.14	\$ 221.15	No Bid	No Bid	
G033	3" OD X 24" ID X 1.75" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P190		3	\$ 78.36	\$ 208.13	\$ 90.40	\$ 237.85	No Bid	No Bid	
G034	3" OD X 24" ID X 2.25" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P225		3	\$ 88.60	\$ 258.60	\$ 118.50	\$ 318.50	No Bid	No Bid	
G035	3" OD X 24" ID X 2.50" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P250		3	\$ 94.61	\$ 274.68	\$ 126.80	\$ 312.20	No Bid	No Bid	
G036	3" OD X 24" ID X 4" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P400P		3	\$ 155.02	\$ 1,089.10	\$ 159.95	\$ 1,492.13	No Bid	No Bid	
G037	3" OD X 24" ID X 4" CRETEX PRO RING RISER	CRETEX PRO RING 3P-C324P400P		10	\$ 188.98	\$ 1,888.58	\$ 258.70	\$ 2,587.25	No Bid	No Bid	
G038	3" MANHOLE 2602 CASTIRON	3P-C324P1075		1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 58.00	No Bid	No Bid	
G039	3" GASKET DISPENSER GUN	3P-C324P1075		1	\$ 95.58	\$ 95.58	\$ 423.00	\$ 528.85	No Bid	No Bid	
G040	SHOOTS STICK AND LID	NO SPECIFICATIONS		13	\$ 54.67	\$ 710.87	\$ 57.40	\$ 456.50	No Bid	No Bid	
G041	SHOOTS STICK AND LID (L)	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 26.68	\$ 26.68	\$ 48.43	\$ 65.58	No Bid	No Bid	
G042	3" VALVE BOX LID ONLY	NO SPECIFICATIONS		6	\$ 13.87	\$ 83.22	\$ 113.31	\$ 708.38	No Bid	No Bid	
G043	3" VALVE BOX LID RISER	NO SPECIFICATIONS (LESS LID)		1	\$ 25.93	\$ 25.93	\$ 26.80	\$ 44.85	No Bid	No Bid	
G044	3" VALVE BOX LID RISER	NO SPECIFICATIONS (LESS LID)		1	\$ 46.98	\$ 46.98	\$ 50.88	\$ 88.58	No Bid	No Bid	
G045	3" VALVE BOX LID RISER	NO SPECIFICATIONS (LESS LID)		1	\$ 38.13	\$ 38.13	\$ 51.84	\$ 85.80	No Bid	No Bid	
G046	3" VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID SHORT (18" 24")	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 56.94	\$ 227.84	\$ 117.00	\$ 437.75	No Bid	No Bid	
G047	3" VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID (24" 36")	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 25.67	\$ 102.67	\$ 54.00	\$ 191.67	No Bid	No Bid	
G048	3" VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID (36" 48")	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 47.40	\$ 177.40	\$ 254.00	\$ 885.00	No Bid	No Bid	
G049	3" VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID (48" 60")	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 57.23	\$ 209.23	\$ 322.00	\$ 1,133.43	No Bid	No Bid	
G050	3" VALVE BOX EXTENSION W/ LID (60" 72")	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 69.73	\$ 278.93	\$ 374.00	\$ 1,293.93	No Bid	No Bid	
G051	3" X 12" CAST IRON BULKHEAD COUPLING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 95.62	\$ 382.58	\$ 172.40	\$ 648.80	No Bid	No Bid	
G052	3" X 12" CAST IRON BULKHEAD COUPLING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		4	\$ 124.63	\$ 498.53	\$ 272.00	\$ 1,070.53	No Bid	No Bid	
G053	3" X 12" CAST IRON BULKHEAD COUPLING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		3	\$ 184.31	\$ 552.93	\$ 386.00	\$ 1,242.40	No Bid	No Bid	
G054	3" X 12" CAST IRON BULKHEAD COUPLING	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 247.87	\$ 743.81	\$ 459.10	\$ 1,133.40	No Bid	No Bid	
G055	3" CAST IRON TIE	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 172.58	\$ 172.58	\$ 341.50	\$ 514.08	No Bid	No Bid	
G056	3" CAST IRON TIE	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 228.84	\$ 228.84	\$ 468.20	\$ 610.40	No Bid	No Bid	
G057	3" CAST IRON TIE	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 77.43	\$ 77.43	\$ 154.80	\$ 202.63	No Bid	No Bid	
G058	3" CAST IRON TIE	NO SPECIFICATIONS		1	\$ 51.40	\$ 51.40	\$ 126.70	\$ 158.40	No Bid	No Bid	

14021	10" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT				1	\$	35.88	\$	35.88	\$	47.20	\$	59.00	No Bid	No Bid
14022	10" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT				1	\$	35.73	\$	35.73	\$	46.40	\$	55.50	No Bid	No Bid

METER BOXES													
CDB #	Description	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for this contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL		
1001	DOUBLE METER BOX	ALLIANCE GSE-MBP-00108	120	\$	43.22	\$	5,184.60	\$	48.53	\$	6,084.63	No Bid	No Bid
1002	DOUBLE METER BOX LID ONLY	ALLIANCE DSG-AMP-DU-SB (LID ONLY)	100	\$	8.41	\$	841.10	\$	9.48	\$	948.00	No Bid	No Bid
1003	BOX DOWNHILL VALVE	PROPEC 30750-18-ROSE	1	\$	303.40	\$	303.40	\$	344.13	\$	456.40	No Bid	No Bid
1004	DOUBLE CONCRETE METER BOX (BOX ONLY)	BPTT CMBE100AL	3	\$	160.800	\$	160.800	\$	64.88	\$	193.20	No Bid	No Bid
1005	DOUBLE CONCRETE METER BOX CAST IRON LID (LID ONLY)	BPTT CMBE100C	3	\$	81.31	\$	273.93	\$	252.73	\$	256.83	No Bid	No Bid
1006	DOUBLE CONCRETE METER BOX CAST IRON LID WITH PREDRILLED HOLE FOR ONE EXTERNAL ANTENNA (LID ONLY)		1	\$	99.74	\$	99.74	\$	112.29	\$	140.20	No Bid	No Bid
1007	40T CONCRETE VALVE METER BOX (BOX ONLY)	BPTT CMB400BX	1	\$	160.800	\$	160.800	\$	131.13	\$	131.30	No Bid	No Bid
1008	40T CONCRETE VALVE METER BOX CAST IRON LID (LID ONLY)	BPTT CMB40C	1	\$	214.02	\$	214.02	\$	240.70	\$	300.98	No Bid	No Bid
1009	40T CONCRETE VALVE METER BOX CAST IRON LID WITH PREDRILLED HOLES FOR TWO EXTERNAL ANTENNAS (LID ONLY)		1	\$	251.58	\$	251.58	\$	283.00	\$	353.75	No Bid	No Bid
1010	30C COMPLETE DOUBLE PLASTIC METER BOX AND LID	DPW30C-D4-14"	3	\$	161.83	\$	484.90	\$	181.84	\$	454.40	No Bid	No Bid
1011	30C PLASTIC (LID ONLY)	DPW30C-D4-LID	1	\$	55.29	\$	55.29	\$	62.30	\$	77.75	No Bid	No Bid

CROW CLEANOUT MISC												
CDB #	Description	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for this contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	
1001	4" THREADED METAL PLUG	MUST BE ABLE TO BE FOUND WITH METAL DETECTOR	13	\$ 8.28	107.32	\$ 78.88	983.50	No Bid	No Bid			
1002	NDS 6" ROUND BOX	208B	13	\$ 2.38	30.62	\$ 8.00	106.00	No Bid	No Bid			
1003	NDS 6" ROUND OVERLAPPING COVER - SEWER	107CS	13	\$ 1.89	24.56	\$ 5.42	70.25	No Bid	No Bid			
1004	NDS 6" ROUND BOX W/ OVERLAPPING COVER - SEWER	208BLS	13	\$ 2.38	30.62	\$ 12.90	161.25	No Bid	No Bid			
1005	4" 45 DEGREE THEN WALL LONG SWEEP TEE W/ 90	THIN WALL	13	\$ 9.55	124.13	\$ 28.50	332.25	No Bid	No Bid			
1006	4" GLUE ON HUB X FEMALE THREAD THEN WALL	THIN WALL	13	\$ 5.95	77.36	\$ 18.00	225.00	No Bid	No Bid			

177.23 FLUSH VALVE MISC												
CDB #	Description	Specifications	Historical quantity / potential estimate for this contract	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	COST	TOTAL	
R001	1" BACK FLOW PREVENTER	USC PICOVER approved	13	\$ 177.23	\$ 2,303.95	\$ 222.80	\$ 2,785.00	No Bid		No Bid		
R002	1 1/2" HUNTER GLOBE VALVE	HUNTER TV-150A 1 1/2" NPT, 200 PSI	13	\$ 116.67	\$ 1,516.67	\$ 147.14	\$ 1,861.75	No Bid		No Bid		
R003	HUNTER CONTROLLER	HUNTER SVC-100 w/ SOLENOID	13	\$ 120.00	\$ 1,560.00	\$ 140.23	\$ 1,805.13	No Bid		No Bid		
R004	1" 1/2" BRASS TEE	207BBS	3	\$ 353.82	\$ 1,055.45	\$ 120.45	\$ 851.13	No Bid		No Bid		
R005	1" PVC THREADED PLUG		6	\$ 3.53	\$ 21.18	\$ 10.00	\$ 66.11	No Bid		No Bid		
R006	1" SCH40 PVC MALE X GLOBE		1	\$ 15.16	\$ 15.16	\$ 6.82	\$ 6.83	No Bid		No Bid		
R007	1" SCH40 PVC FEMALE		1	\$ 160.80	\$ 160.80	\$ 9.23	\$ 11.53	No Bid		No Bid		
R008	1" SCH40 COUPLING		1	\$ 2.43	\$ 2.51	\$ 14.60	\$ 18.25	No Bid		No Bid		
R009	1" NDS BOTTOM VALVE		6	\$ 3.14	\$ 18.78	\$ 12.00	\$ 78.13	No Bid		No Bid		
R010	NDS END CAP FOR BOTTOM OUTLET		10	\$ 2.09	\$ 19.75	\$ 12.20	\$ 28.75	No Bid		No Bid		
Total				\$	132,470.59	\$	164,955.52	\$		\$	44,418.62	

END OF LIST