Exhibit H — Ordinance 783-25

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code are hereby
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IFGC. Underlined type is text inserted. Lined-through
type-is-deleted-text from IFGC-

Section 102.2 is amended by adding a paragraph titled “Exception” to read as follows:

Section 102.2 Existing installations. Except as otherwise provided for in this chapter, a provision in this
code shall not require the removal, alteration or abandonment of, nor prevent the continued utilization and
maintenance of, existing installations lawfully in existence at the time of the adoption of this code.

Exception: Existing dwelling units shall comply with Section 621.2.

Section 102.8 is amended to read as follows:

Section 102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall
be those that are listed in Chapter 8 and such codes_and-standards, when specifically adopted, and
standards shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such
reference and-as—furtherregulated-in-Sections—102.8-14-and-102.8.2. Where differences occur between
provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this code shall apply. Whenever
amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and
standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well. Any reference to NFPA 70 or the

National Electr/cal Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted

issuance of permits and performance of mspectlons as required by thls code shaII be as establlshed from
time to time by resolution of the Town Council and set forth in the Town’s Fee Schedule.

Section 109.6-Fee Refunds. The_cede-building official is-autherized-to-shall establish a refund-policy for
authorizing the refunding of fees.

Section 113 is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Section 113 MEANS OF APPEAL

113.1 General—Appllcatlon for appeal In—order-to-hear-and-decide-appeals—of orders,—decisions—or

eepy—te—the—eede—efﬁeneJ—Anv person shaII have the rlqht to appeal a deC|S|on of the bu|Id|nq off|C|aI to the
Board of Adjustment as provided in Section 2.02 of the Denton County Emergency Services District No. 1
Land Development Code.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
Amendments



Exhibit H — Ordinance 783-25

Section 306.3 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:

[M] 306.3 Appliances in attics. Attics containing appliances shall be provided with an opening and
unobstructed passageway large enough to allow removal of the largest appliance. The passageway shall
be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) high and 22 inches (559 mm) wide and not more than 20 feet (6096
mm) in length measured along the centerline of the passageway from the opening to the appliance. The
passageway shall have continuous solid flooring not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide. A level service
space not less than 30 inches (762 mm) deep and 30 inches (762 mm) wide shall be present at the front or
service side of the appliance. The clear access opening dimensions shall be net—less—than a mlnlmum of 20
inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm) ,
larger where such dimensions are not large enouqh to allow removal of the Iarqest appllance A walkwav
to an appliance shall be rated as a floor as approved by the building official, shall have continuous solid
flooring with @ minimum thickness of 1/2” plywood or 5/8” wafer board, and shall be placed over a load
bearing wall or with engineered approval. As a minimum, for access to the attic space, provide one of the

following:

A permanent stair.

A pull-down stair with a minimum 300 Ibs (136 kg) capaTown.

An access door from an upper floor level.

Access panel may be used in lieu of items 1, 2, and 3 with prior approval of the code official due to
building conditions.

PN~

Exceptions:

1. The passageway and level service space are not required where the appliance is capable of being
serviced and removed through the required opening.

2. Where the passageway is not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) high for its entire length, the passageway
shall be not greater than 50 feet (15,250 mm) in length.

A receptacle outlet shall be provided at or near the equipment and appliance location within 25 feet and in
accordance with the Electrical Code.

(Reason: To provide a safe means of accessibility to appliances in attics and to allow for different types of
construction limitations. Consistent with regional amendment to IMC 306.3.)

Section 306.5 is amended to read as follows:

[M] 306.5 Equipment and Appliances on Roofs or Elevated Structures. Where equipment requiring
access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof of a building such that personnel will
have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to access such-eguipment-or-appliances, an
interior or exterior means of access shall be provided. Exterior ladders providing roof access need not
extend closer than 12 feet (2438 mm) to the finish grade or floor level below and shall extend to the
equipment and appliances’ level service space. Such access shall not require climbing over obstructions
greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height or walking on roofs having a slope greater than four (4) units
vertical in twelve (12) units horizontal (33-percent slope). Such access shall not require the use of portable
ladders.

Permanent ladders installed to provide the required access shall comply with the following minimum design
criteria:

1. The side railing shall extend above the parapet or roof edge not less than 30 inches (762 mm).

2. Ladders shall have rung spacing not to exceed 14 inches (356 mm) on center. The upper-most
rung shall be not more than 24 inches (610 mm) below the upper edge of the roof hatch, roof, or
parapet, as applicable.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 2 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
Amendments




Exhibit H — Ordinance 783-25

3. Ladders shall have a toe spacing not less than 6 inches (152 mm) deep.

4. There shall be not less than 18 inches (457 mm) between rails.

5. Rungs shall have a diameter not less than 0.75-inch (19 mm) and be capable of withstanding a
300-pound (1136.1 kg) load.

6. Ladders over 30 feet (9144 mm) in height shall be provided with offset sections and landings
capable of withstanding 100 pounds per square foot (488.2 kg/m?). Landing dimensions shall be
not less than 18 inches (457 mm) and not less than the width of the ladder served. A guard rail
shall be provided on all open sides of the landing.

7. Climbing clearance. The distance from the centerline of the rungs to the nearest permanent object
on the climbing side of the ladder shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) measured
perpendicular to the rungs. This distance shall be maintained from the point of ladder access to the
bottom of the roof hatch. A minimum clear width of 15 inches (381 mm) shall be provided on both
sides of the ladder measured from the midpoint of and parallel with the rungs, except where cages
or wells are installed.

8. Landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed bottom landing area
having a minimum dimension of 30 inches by 30 inches (762 mm by 762 mm) centered in front of
the ladder.

9. Ladders shall be protected against corrosion by approved means.

10. Access to ladders shall be provided at all times.

Catwalks installed to provide the required access shall be not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide and shall
have railings as required for service platforms.

Exception: This section shall not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.
(Reason: To assure safe access to roof appliances. Consistent with IMC amendments.)

Section 306.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

[M] 306.5.1 Sloped roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans, or other components that require service
are installed on a roof having a slope of 3 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) or greater
and havmg an edge more than 30 mches (762 mm) above grade at such edge a—Ievet—ptatfeFm—shaH—be

mamtenanee a catwalk at Ieast 16 |nches in W|dth with substant|al cIeats spaced not more than 16 inches
apart shall be provided from the roof access to a level platform at the appliance. The level platform shall be
provided on each side of the appliance to which access is required for service, repair, or maintenance. The
platform shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) in any dimension and shall be provided with guards.
The guards shall extend not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the platform, shall be constructed so as
to prevent the passage of a 21-inch-diameter (533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading

reqwrements for guards speC|f|ed in the Internat/ona/ Bu1/d/ng Code Aeeess—sha#—net—Feqtﬁe—watkmg—en

(Reason: To assure safe access to roof appliances. Consistent with IMC amendments.)

Section 306 is amended by adding Section 306.7 and Subsection 306.7.1 to read as follows:

Section 306.7 Water heaters above ground floor. \When the attic, roof, mezzanine, or platform in which
a water heater is installed is more than eight (8) feet (2438 mm) above the ground or floor level, it shall be
made accessible by a stairway or permanent ladder fastened to the building.

306.7.1 lllumination and convenience outlet. \Whenever the mezzanine or platform is not
adequately lighted or access to a receptacle outlet is not obtainable from the main level, lighting
and a receptacle outlet shall be provided in accordance with Section 306.3.1.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 3 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
Amendments



Exhibit H — Ordinance 783-25
Section 401.5 is amended to read as follows:

Section 401.5 Identification. For other than steel pipe and CSST, exposed piping shall be identified by a
yellow label marked “Gas” in black letters. The marking shall be spaced at intervals not exceeding 5 feet
(1524 mm). The marking shall be spaced at intervals not exceeding 5 feet (1524 mm). The marking shall
not be required on piping located in the same room as the appliance served. CSST shall be identified as
required by ANSI LC 1/CSA 6.26. Both ends of each section of medium pressure gas piping shall identify
its operating gas pressure with an approved tag. The tags are to be composed of aluminum or stainless
steel and the following wording shall be stamped into the tag: “WARNING 2 TO 5 psi gas pressure Do Not
Remove”

(Reason: To protect homeowners and plumbers.)
Section 404.12 is amended to read as follows:

Section 404.12 Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth

of 42 18 inches (305 458 mm) top of pipe below grade;-exceptasprovided-forin-Section-404-12.1.

(Reason: To provide increased protection to piping systems and address reference number change.)
Section 404.12.1 is deleted:

(Reason: To provide increased protection to piping systems and address reference number change.)
Section 406.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section 406.4 Test pressure measurement. Test pressure shall be measured with a monometer or with
a pressure-measuring device designed and calibrated to read, record, or indicate a pressure loss caused
by leakage during the pressure test period. The source of pressure shall be isolated before the pressure
tests are made. Mechanical gauges used to measure test pressures shall have a range such that the
highest end of the scale is not greater than five times the test pressure. Spring type gauges do not meet
the requirement of a calibrated gauge.

(Reason: To require the use of more accurate diaphragm gauges. Spring gauges do not provide accurate
measurement below approximately 17 psig.)

Section 406.4.1 is amended to read as follows:
Section 406.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 4-34-times-the propesed
maximum-working-pressure-but-notless-than-3 psig (20 kPa gauge),irrespective-of design-pressure or at

the discretion of the Code Official, the piping and values may be tested at a pressure of at least six (6)

mches (1 52 mm) of mercurv, measured W|th a manometer or slope qauqe Wherememst—ppessuﬁeexeeeds

pressure of 3 psig, dlaphraqm gauges shaII utilize a d|aI W|th a minimum dlameter of three- and one-half
inches (3 %2”), a set hand, 1/10-pound incrementation, and a pressure range not to exceed 15 psi for tests
requiring a pressure of 3 psig. For tests requiring a pressure of 10 psig, diaphragm gauges shall utilize a
dial with @ minimum diameter of three and one-half inches (3 %), a set hand, a minimum of 2/10-pound
incrementation, and a pressure range not to exceed 50 psi. For welded piping, and for piping carrying gas
at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches water column pressure (3.48 kPa) (1/2 psi) and less than
200 inches of water column pressure (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall not be less than ten (10)
pounds per square inch (69.6 kPa). For piping carrying gas at a pressure that exceeds 200 inches of water
column (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall be not less than one and one-half times the proposed
maximum working pressure.

Diaphragm gauges used for testing must display a current calibration and be in good working condition.
The appropriate test must be applied to the diaphragm gauge used for testing.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 4 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
Amendments



Exhibit H — Ordinance 783-25
(Reason: To provide for lesser pressures to coordinate with the use of more accurate diaphragm gauges.)

Section 409.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

Section 409.1.3 Access to shut off valves. Shut off valves shall be located in places so as to provide
access for operation and shall be installed so as to be protected from damage. All shut off valves in
commercial kitchen installments shall be located no more than 6’ (feet) from floor level with a ball valve for
emergency shutoff.

Section 409 is amended by adding Section 409.1.4 to read as follows:

Section 409.1.4 Valves in CSST installations. Shutoff valves installed with corrugated stainless steel
(CSST) piping systems shall be supported with an_approved termination fitting, or equivalent support,
suitable for the size of the valves, of adequate strength and quality, and located at intervals so as to prevent
or damp out excessive vibration but in no case greater than 12-inches from the center of the valve. Supports
shall be installed so as not to interfere with the free expansion and contraction of the system’s piping,
fittings, and valves between anchors. All valves and supports shall be designed and installed so they will
not be disengaged by movement of the supporting piping.

(Reason: To provide proper security to CSST valves. These standards were established in this region in
1999 when CSST was an emerging technology.)

Section 410.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 410.1 Pressure regulators. A line pressure regulator shall be installed where the appliance is
designed to operate at a lower pressure than the supply pressure. Line gas pressure regulators shall be
listed as complying with ANSI Z21 .80/CSA 6.22. Access shall be provided to pressure regulators. Pressure
regulators shall be protected from physical damage. Regulators installed on the exterior of the building shall
be approved for outdoor installation. Access to regulators shall comply with the requirements for access to
appliances as specified in Section 306.

Exception: A passageway or level service space is not required when the regulator is capable of being
serviced and removed through the required attic opening.

(Reason: To require adequate access to regulators.)
Section 621.2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 621.2 Prohibited use. One or more unvented room heaters shall not be used as the sole source
of comfort heating in a dwelling unit.

Exception: Existing approved unvented heaters may continue to be used in dwelling units, in accordance
with the code provisions in effect when installed, when approved by the Code Official unless an unsafe
condition is determined to exist as described in Section 108.7.

(Reason: Gives code official discretion.)

END

North Central Texas Council of Governments 5 2021 International Fuel Gas Code
Amendments



