PETITION TO THE TOWN
COUNCIL

To the Honorable Town Council of the Town of
Bristol: The undersigned hereby respectfully
DATE RECEIVED requested of your Honorable Body that:
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Kyle vieno dait IruCk gamagea veniCie 1-£1-£4U40 /IMt plieasant ave. »  moox x

a Kyle Mello
Hi Chris, Thanks for speaking with me. Here are the details of the incident.

Just before lunch a rock salt truck backed up the road with the sander on. My car parked in front of my house suffered damage from the rocksalt causing dents ali alon,

Here is a photo attached.
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Kyle Melio

Good Moming, How do we proceed on this issue? Would you like me to bring the vehicle by so you can see the damage yourself? The gentleman you sent by on Fnda

Chris Parella
Hello Kyle Please bring the vehicle to JRA on Metacom Avenue and secure a quote for the damage. Please let them know that the Town or our insurance company wil



g Kyle Mello

When can | bring the car in for repair?
Thanks

-Kyle

On Fab 4 2025 at 520 PM. Kyle Mellc < wrote:

Chris Parella -
to Jennifer me v

Hello Kyle
I have contacted JRA and advised them that we authorize the repairs as outlined in the quote. Please let me b

Mf. Drweale
Director of Public Works
Town of Bristol, R.I.



JRA Collision Center, INC
360 Metacom Ave
Bristol, Rl 02809

Bill To:

Town of Bristol
Department of Public Works
111 Mt Hope Avenue
Bristol, R102809

Description

Parts
Body Labor

Paint Labor
Mechanical Labor
Paint Material
Shop Supplies
Hazardous Waste
Sales Tax

Phone # Fax:

~ 401-254-0262 401-254-0263 !

E-Mail

jracollision@comcast.net

Invoice

4583

3/19/2025
3/19/2025

Mello

16 Suba Crosstrek

Invoice #:
Invoice Date:
Due Date:
P.0. Number:
Vehicle:

Hours/Qty Rate Amount
34189  341.89T
16.6 52.00 863.20
7.7 52.00 400.40
1 125.00 125.00
Tl 45.00 346.50T
15.00 15.00T
3.00 3.00T
7.00% 49.45
Web Site
www.JRACollision.com
Total $2,144.44
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due

$2,144.44



