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April 25, 2023 
 
 
City of Breckenridge 
105 N. Rose Ave 
Breckenridge, Texas 76424 
Attn: Mr. Bob Sims, Mayor 
 
Re: Recommendation of Award 
 TxDOT FM 3099 Realignment Utility Relocation 
 
Dear Mayor Sims: 
 
Proposals for the referenced project were opened on April 14, 2023.  A total of three (3) bids were received 
and the proposal tabulation is attached for reference.  Based upon evaluation of the submitted proposals, 
the lowest priced proposal was submitted by Leetech Solutions from Aledo, Texas. 
 
The responsiveness of the bidder has been evaluated for conformity with all material conditions of the 
Advertisement for Proposals and the Request for Proposals. 
 
Based upon the evaluation findings, it is recommended that the construction contract for the City of 
Breckenridge TxDOT FM 3099 Realignment Utility Relocation Project be awarded to Leetech Solutions, as 
the lowest, qualified proposer at the Base Proposal B in the amount of $521,775.00. 
 
We look forward to working with the City of Breckenridge as this project moves into the construction phase. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Enprotec / Hibbs & Todd 
 
 
 
Sage Diller, P.E. 
 
SD/jd 
 
Encl: Proposal Tabulation  
 
c: Cynthia Northrop, City Manager 
 Project File 5580-36  
P:\Projects\Breckenridge, City of\5580 General Services Agreement\5580-36 FM 3099 Realignment Utility Relocation\5. Bidding Phase\Bidder Evaluation\042523 Letter of Recommendation.doc 



BASE PROPOSAL A

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount

1A 1 LS Mobilization, Bonds & Insurance NO BID 0.00 30,000.00$     30,000.00$      32,200.00$    32,200.00$        
2A 1 LS Traffic Control Plan NO BID 0.00 20,000.00$     20,000.00$      30,250.00$    30,250.00$        
3A 1 LS Erosion Control Devices NO BID 0.00 10,000.00$     10,000.00$      8,750.00$      8,750.00$         
4A 100 LF Trench and Excavation Safety Plan NO BID 0.00 5.00$  500.00$           10.00$          1,000.00$         
5A 145 LF 4" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Slick Bore NO BID 0.00 70.00$           10,150.00$      78.00$          11,310.00$        
6A 1,710 LF 6" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Slick Bore NO BID 0.00 100.00$          171,000.00$    144.00$         246,240.00$      
7A 1,340 LF 8" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Slick Bore NO BID 0.00 130.00$          174,200.00$    205.00$         274,700.00$      
8A 275 LF 4" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line with 6" HDPE Encasement (Bore) NO BID 0.00 120.00$          33,000.00$      117.00$         32,175.00$        
9A 180 LF 8" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line with 12" HDPE Encasement (Bore NO BID 0.00 185.00$          33,300.00$      338.00$         60,840.00$        
10A 1 EA 2" Tapping Sleeve NO BID 0.00 2,300.00$       2,300.00$        3,385.00$      3,385.00$         
11A 3 EA 6" Tapping Sleeve NO BID 0.00 2,500.00$       7,500.00$        7,645.00$      22,935.00$        
12A 1 EA 8" Tapping Sleeve NO BID 0.00 3,000.00$       3,000.00$        9,600.00$      9,600.00$         
13A 1 EA 2" Gate Valve NO BID 0.00 1,800.00$       1,800.00$        1,415.00$      1,415.00$         
14A 5 EA 6" Gate Valve NO BID 0.00 2,000.00$       10,000.00$      3,135.00$      15,675.00$        
15A 8 EA 8" Gate Valve NO BID 0.00 2,700.00$       21,600.00$      4,425.00$      35,400.00$        
16A 1 EA 4" Flush Valve Assembly with Gate Valve NO BID 0.00 8,600.00$       8,600.00$        12,115.00$    12,115.00$        
17A 3,650 LF Tracer Wire NO BID 0.00 0.50$  1,825.00$        1.00$  3,650.00$         
18A 15 CY Grout Fill Abandoned Water Line NO BID 0.00 3,000.00$       45,000.00$      2,620.00$      39,300.00$        
19A 1,735 LF Cut & Remove Existing PVC Water Line NO BID 0.00 25.00$           43,375.00$      25.00$          43,375.00$        
20A 2 EA Connect 8" HDPE Water Line to Existing 8" PVC Water Line NO BID 0.00 4,100.00$       8,200.00$        6,055.00$      12,110.00$        
21A 7 EA Water Meter Service Reconnection (Short) NO BID 0.00 1,100.00$       7,700.00$        1,990.00$      13,930.00$        
22A 1 EA Water Meter Service Relocation and Reconnection (Short) NO BID 0.00 1,400.00$       1,400.00$        3,385.00$      3,385.00$         
23A 10 EA Cut & Plug Existing PVC Water Line NO BID 0.00 350.00$          3,500.00$        1,500.00$      15,000.00$        
24A 1 EA 6" Fire Hydrant Assembly with Gate Valve NO BID 0.00 7,800.00$       7,800.00$        10,570.00$    10,570.00$        
25A 1 EA Remove Existing Fire Hydrant & Return to Owner NO BID 0.00 2,000.00$       2,000.00$        1,000.00$      1,000.00$         
26A 50 LF Concrete Surface Repair NO BID 0.00 160.00$          8,000.00$        144.00$         7,200.00$         
27A 50 LF Asphalt Surface Repair NO BID 0.00 125.00$          6,250.00$        51.00$          2,550.00$         
28A 50 LF Gravel Surface Repair NO BID 0.00 120.00$          6,000.00$        12.00$          600.00$  

0.00 678,000.00$    950,660.00$      

LEETECH SOLUTIONS BRETT CONSTRUCTION FAMBRO CONSTRUCTION LLC

TOTAL BASE PROPOSAL A PRICE (Items 1A thru 28A)

TABULATION OF PROPOSALS FOR: TXDOT FM 3099 Realignment Utility Relocation, City of Breckenridge, Texas

PE Firm Registration No. 1151
PROPOSALS RECEIVED: 4/14/2023

Enprotec / Hibbs & Todd, Inc., 402 Cedar Street, Abilene, Texas 79601
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BASE PROPOSAL B

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount

1B 1 LS Mobilization, Bonds & Insurance 25,000.00$  25,000.00$     30,000.00$     30,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
2B 1 LS Traffic Control Plan 20,000.00$  20,000.00$     20,000.00$     20,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
3B 1 LS Erosion Control Devices 15,000.00$  15,000.00$     10,000.00$     10,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
4B 900 LF Trench and Excavation Safety Plan 1.00$          900.00$          1.15$  1,035.00$        NO BID 0.00
5B 3,300 LF Pipe Bedding Material 10.00$        33,000.00$     9.50$  31,350.00$      NO BID 0.00
6B 145 LF 4" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Open Cut 50.00$        7,250.00$       40.00$           5,800.00$        NO BID 0.00
7B 1,660 LF 6" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Open Cut 55.00$        91,300.00$     40.00$           66,400.00$      NO BID 0.00
8B 1,300 LF 8" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line by Open Cut 62.00$        80,600.00$     40.00$           52,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
9B 50 LF 6" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line (Bore) 100.00$      5,000.00$       120.00$          6,000.00$        NO BID 0.00
10B 40 LF 8" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line (Bore) 120.00$      4,800.00$       125.00$          5,000.00$        NO BID 0.00
11B 195 LF 4" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line w/6" HDPE Encasement (Open Cu 100.00$      19,500.00$     35.00$           6,825.00$        NO BID 0.00
12B 80 LF 4" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line w/6" HDPE Encasement (Bore) 140.00$      11,200.00$     95.00$           7,600.00$        NO BID 0.00
13B 180 LF 8" DIPS DR-11 HDPE Water Line w/12" HDPE Encasement (Bore) 220.00$      39,600.00$     190.00$          34,200.00$      NO BID 0.00
14B 1 EA 2" Tapping Sleeve 1,500.00$   1,500.00$       2,300.00$       2,300.00$        NO BID 0.00
15B 3 EA 6" Tapping Sleeve 5,000.00$   15,000.00$     2,500.00$       7,500.00$        NO BID 0.00
16B 1 EA 8" Tapping Sleeve 6,000.00$   6,000.00$       3,000.00$       3,000.00$        NO BID 0.00
17B 1 EA 2" Gate Valve 1,200.00$   1,200.00$       1,800.00$       1,800.00$        NO BID 0.00
18B 5 EA 6" Gate Valve 2,500.00$   12,500.00$     2,000.00$       10,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
19B 8 EA 8" Gate Valve 3,500.00$   28,000.00$     2,700.00$       21,600.00$      NO BID 0.00
20B 1 EA 4" Flush Valve Assembly with Gate Valve 9,000.00$   9,000.00$       8,600.00$       8,600.00$        NO BID 0.00
21B 3,650 LF Detectable Tape and Tracer Wire 1.00$          3,650.00$       0.50$  1,825.00$        NO BID 0.00
22B 15 CY Grout Fill Abandoned Water Line 100.00$      1,500.00$       3,000.00$       45,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
23B 1,735 LF Cut & Remove Existing PVC Water Line 15.00$        26,025.00$     25.00$           43,375.00$      NO BID 0.00
24B 2 EA Connect 8" HDPE Water Line to Existing 8" PVC Water Line 2,500.00$   5,000.00$       4,100.00$       8,200.00$        NO BID 0.00
25B 7 EA Water Meter Service Reconnection (Short) 2,000.00$   14,000.00$     1,100.00$       7,700.00$        NO BID 0.00
26B 1 EA Water Meter Service Relocation and Reconnection (Short) 2,000.00$   2,000.00$       1,400.00$       1,400.00$        NO BID 0.00
27B 10 EA Cut & Plug Existing PVC Water Line 1,000.00$   10,000.00$     350.00$          3,500.00$        NO BID 0.00
28B 1 EA 6" Fire Hydrant Assembly with Gate Valve 7,000.00$   7,000.00$       7,800.00$       7,800.00$        NO BID 0.00
29B 1 EA Remove Existing Fire Hydrant & Return to Owner 500.00$      500.00$          2,000.00$       2,000.00$        NO BID 0.00
30B 100 LF Concrete Surface Repair 56.00$        5,600.00$       160.00$          16,000.00$      NO BID 0.00
31B 566 LF Asphalt Surface Repair 35.00$        19,810.00$     125.00$          70,750.00$      NO BID 0.00
32B 17 LF Gravel Surface Repair 20.00$        340.00$          120.00$          2,040.00$        NO BID 0.00

521,775.00$   540,600.00$    0.00

I, SAGE DILLER, P.E., #96645, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE REFERENCED BIDS WERE RECEIVED, IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ADVERTISED PROCEDURES, OPENED, AND READ ALOUD.
THE BID TABULATION HEREIN IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE REPRESENTATION OF THE BIDS READ ALOUD.

SAGE DILLER, P.E., #96645

TOTAL BASE PROPOSAL B PRICE (Items 1B thru 32B)

LEETECH SOLUTIONS BRETT CONSTRUCTION FAMBRO
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