# Central Services Department

2760 Peach Orchard Road, Augusta, GA 30906 (706) 821-7174 Phone

# **MEMORANDUM**

TO:

Geri Sams, Director, Procurement Department

FROM:

Ron Lampkin, Interim Director, Central Services Department

DATE:

SUBJECT: Emergency Memo - Carrie J. Mays Center and Gym Roof Replacement

In accordance with §1-10-57 Emergency Procurements, I respectfully ask you to accept this communication as notification of an emergency at the Carrie J. Mays Community Center and Gym regarding several roof leaks.

The Carrie J Mays Center and Gym are currently experiencing several leaks inside the building. These leaks are persistently causing interior issues and water damage to the walls, ceiling, and flooring. During an assessment conducted by the Central Services Department, it was found that the roof of both facilities will require repairs and replacements in various areas. It is imperative that the maintenance process continues to preserve the integrity of the structure. Crosby Roofing & Seamless Gutters has been deemed qualified to make the necessary replacements.

Please process a purchase order to Crosby Roofing & Seamless Gutters in the amount of \$94,325.80 for the needed roof system replacements.

If you have any questions or concerns, please contact the Central Services Department.

RL/merr

# AUGUSTA-RICHMOND COUNTY GEORGIA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

REQUISITION

DEPARTMENT NAME: Central Services Department DEPARTMENT NUMBER: 272864/10/54.13120
DEPARTMENT HEAD:

PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER; PURCHASE ORDER DATE;

			NAME OF BIDDER	OF BIDDER	NAMEO	NAME OF BIDDER	NAMEO	NAME OF BIDDER
	VENDOR		Gutters	g & Scamless	GS Roofing		Brighterside Roofing	loofing
	PHONE NUMBER		(706) 823-4300		17061 231 2724		7000	
	QUOTED BY		Allen Perry		1,200 1001		(/00) 364-1/12	2
II EM NO	TPO ROOF SECTION BEEN INC. EXCELORING	Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Taial Pring
,,,,,	CONNECTED TO GYM	_	\$ 20.050.00	20 020 00				
2	SHINGLE ROOFING SECTION REPAIRS - BUILDING IN BACK OF PROPERTY	-			TAG DIG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ψ.	TPO ROOF SECTION REPAIRS - FLAT SECTION ABOVE SHINGLES	-  -		200.00				
4	METAL ROOF REPAIR SECTION	-	l <sub>u</sub>					
s		-	\$ /,500.00	\$ 7,500.00				
6								
7								
å0	*Emergency							
9	Proposal 03/22/2024							
10 8	SR #525589 Carrie J Mays Center & Gym							
=								
12								
13								
14								
15								
6								
17								
38								
19								
20								
21		1						
22		1						
TOTAL BID				+				
SHIPPING CHARGES	HARGES	1	6	1 08°575°66	No Bid	Z	No Bid	
DELIVERY T	DELIVERY TIME FROM RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER	1						



Groeby Roofing & Seamless Gutters-Augusta LLG 1955 International Court Grovetown, GA 20813 Phone: 708-823-4300

03/22/2024 Claim information

Fax: 708-425-7858

Company Representative Alien Pany Phone: (678) 315-4918 allencrosbyroofingsugusta@gmail.com

Eric Bell 1014 11th Avenue Augusts, GA 30901

### **TPO Roof Section**

Enclosed section connected to gym

1.00	EA
14.00	
14.00	
- 1100	SQ
17.00	SQ
1.00	EA
176.00	LF
1.00	EA
2.00	EA
1.00	EA
1,00	EA
1.00	EA
1.00	EA
	1,00 176,00 1,00 1,00 1,00 2,00

\$30,250,00

28.00

218.00

80

UF



Crosby Roofing & Seamless Gutters-Augusta LLC 1955 International Court Grovetown, GA 30813 Phone: 706-823-4300 03/22/2024 Claim information

Fast 708-428-7858

Company Representative
Allen Parry
Phone: (878) \$16-4913
ellencrosbyroofingsugusta@gmail.com

Eric Bell 1014 11th Aversie Augusta, GA 30901

# **Shingle Roofing Section**

Install 1/2" recovery board throughout roof

install all new wood blocking at perimeters.

Building in back of property

rosby Roofing will work safety at all times under OSHA and the general contractors rules and	Qty 1.00	Unit
section above the shingles		
O Roof Section	\$16	1,575.8
The manufacturer warranty for the 3 tob shingles is a 25 year warranty with a 5 year workmanship varranty	1.00	EA
The manufacturer warranty for the 3 to abhasta to 19 min men the county/oily if required	1.00	EA
Crosby Roofing will abide by local code and buy a permit from the county/bity if required	1.00	EA
Clean existing gutters and magnetically sweep work area.	1.00	E/
Clean job site delity of all work related debris	4.00	E/
install new 25 year 3 teb shingles install new pipe boots	63.00	80
Item required by Georgia code		
Install aluminum drip metal (This is now a county code that is mendatory. Please be sure all estimate include this line item)	358,00	Ų
Install ice and water shield in all valleys, all wall and chimney flashing, and pipe penetrations	42.00	L
Install synthetic underleyment (free upgrade from 15# felt paper)	55,00	8
Replace any rotten wood at an additional charge. 7/16 OSB at \$75.00/sht-1x6 pine at \$4.50/LF-1x6 pine at \$5.50/LF. First two shoets are free. "This estimate includes and rotten decising or rafters. If there is settling to the actual structure of the house like low or high rafters that is not included in this estimate.  That is more of a structural flora and is not part of the typical roof replacement.	1,00	ŧ
Inspect and clean surface area before installing new roof	1.00	E
Remove, teer off and dispose of existing roof. This includes one layer of roofing. If there are more than one layer it will be an additional \$20 per equare per layer.	<b>55.00</b>	8
Patrone terral and a dispetation in job	1.00	
Crosby Roofing will provide a dumpsier for the job	Qty	U

04.00	
31,00	SQ
216.00	LF
1.00	EA
1.00	EA
1,00	EA
6.00	EA
	EA
1.00	EA
1.00	EA
1.00	EA
	1.00 1.00 1.00 6.00 1.00 1.00

\$38,000,00

Starting at \$565/month with #Acorn • APPLY



Crosby Reofing & Seamless Gutters-Auguste LLC 1955 International Court Grovetown, GA 30813 Phone: 706-823-4300 03/22/2024 Claim Information

Fax: 708-426-7858

Gompany Representative
Allen Perry
Phone: (676) 315-4913
allencrosbyroofingaugusta@gmail.com

Eric Bell 1014 11th Avenue Augusts, GA 30901

# **Metal Roof Repair Section**

Clean cut all debris from existing guitters	Qty	Unit
Replace and reseal all screws around perimeter of gym standing seam metal roof.	1.00	EA
Inspect ridge cap. Repair and reseal any areas that look to be damaged or leaking.	1.00	EA
and the state of t	1.00	EA

\$7,500.00

Starting at \$138/month with SACOTT - APPLY

### Quote

Eric T. Bell < EBell@augustaga.gov>
Thu 3/7/2024 1:19 PM
To:GSroofing GA < GSroofingGA@gmail.com>
Good Afternoon, Mr. Gee

The Augusta Richmond County Central Services is need of a quote of the following materials

Need to get a quote for a roof replacement do to a leak at

Carrie J Mays Community Center and the Gym 1014 11<sup>th</sup> Ave Augusta Ga 30901

Once completed please email me the quote to my attention. In the event the quote is not received by the end of business day on 3-12-24 a no bid will be recorded.

Thanks, Eric 706-564-1712

525539

### Quote

Eric T. Bell <EBell@augustaga.gov>
Thu 3/7/2024 1:23 PM
To:Info Brighterside <info@brightersideroofing.com>
To whom it may Concern

The Augusta Richmond County Central Services is in need of the following services

Need to look at a roof leak and get a quote for repair or replacement of the roof at

Carrie J Mays Community Center and the Gym 1014 11<sup>th</sup> Ave Augusta Ga 30901

Once Completed please email me the quote to my attention. In the event the quote is not received by the end of the business day 3-12-24. A no bid will be recorded

Thanks, Eric 706-564-1712