\ Central Services Department

Ron Lampkin, Interim Director 2760 Peach Orchard Road, Augusta, GA 30906
¢ 70 R G 1 A Maria Rivera-Rivera, Deputy Director  (706) 828-7174 Phone  (706) 796-5077 Fax
MEMORANDUM
TO: Darrell White, Interim Director, Procurement Department

FROM: mpkin, Interim Director, Central Services Department
- .
DATE: January 16, 2

SUBJECT: Emergency Memo — Carrie J Mays Water Lines Replacement

In accordance with §1-10-57 Emergency Procurements, I respectfully ask you to accept this
communication as notification of an emergency at Carrie ] Mays regarding the leaks in the main
water line.

Carrie ] Mays Center was experiencing leaks inside the building due to the burst water lines. It is
of utmost importance that the leaks were addressed to prevent interior issues and water damage.
In order to preserve the integrity of the structure and prevent further leaks from occurring, the
water lines required replacement. Pamelas’s Plumbing, LLC was deemed qualified to make the
necessary replacements to the water lines.

Please process a purchase order to Pamela’s Plumbing in the amount of $51,973.20 for the
needed water line replacements.

If you have any questions or concerns, please contact the Central Services Department.

RL/merr



AUGUSTA-RICHMOND COUNTY GEORGIA

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
DEPARTMENT NAME: Central Services Department REQUISITION REQUISITION:
DEPARTMENT NUMBER: Varies,.see below REQUISITION DATE: 1/14/2025
DEPARTMENT HEAD: = =Z——</ PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER:
’ — 7/ PURCHASE ORDER DATE:
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER
VENDOR Pamela's Plumbing
PHONE NUMBER 706-284-2714
QUOTED BY
ITEM NO DESCRIPTION Quantity | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price Total Price
1 LEAK DETECTION - FOUND LEAK IN LINE NEAR GYM 1 $ 800.00 | $ 800.00
REPLACE BOTH WATER LINE SFOR GYM AND COMMUNITY
2 CENTER 1 $ 45.87535|%  45,875.35
3 ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT RENTAL AND MATERIALS 1 $§ 529785(% 5,297.85
4
5
6 Emergency - Carrie J Mays Community Center
7 Invoice # 12678
8 Funding is available in the following accounts:
9 GL: 330-05-1120/53.19120
10 JL: 224-05-2114/53.19120
il
12
13
14
TOTAL BID $ 51,973.20
SHIPPING CHARGES
DELIVERY TIME FROM RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER




INVOICE

Pamela's Plumbing LLC pamelasplumbing@gmail.com
772 Springbrook Circle +1(706) 284-2714

Evans, GA 30809 www.pamelasplumbing.com
Bill to

Eric Bell - Augusta Maintenance Central
Services

1014 11th Ave

Augusta, GA 30901

Invoice details

Invoice no.: 12678
Terms: Due on receipt
Invoice date: 01/06/2025
Due date: 01/06/2025

Service Date Service

12/27/2024 Lumpsum

01/03/2025 Lumpsum

01/04/2025 Lumpsum

Ways to pay

VISA.* uxw; [EY  BaNk  Pro venmo

View and pay

View invoice online

Description

Leak detection - found leak in line near
gym

Replace both water lines for the gym
and the community ctr.

Additional equipment rental and
materials

Total

Scan code or go to the link below to view the invoice online

View invoice

Ship to

Eric Bell -

Services

Augusta Maintenance Central

Qty Rate Total

1 $800.00 $800.00

1 $45,875.35 $45,875.35

1 $5,297.85 $5,297.85

$51,973.20



Katie Cornelius
“

From: Darrell White

Sent: Friday, December 20, 2024 4:35 PM

To: Katie Cornelius

Cc: Ron Lampkin; Maria Rivera-Rivera; Eric Bing; Scarlet Green; Arlene New; Audrey Sutton;
Nancy M. Williams

Subject: RE: Emergency Request - Carrie J Mays

Please proceed!

From: Katie Cornelius <KCornelius@augustaga.gov>

Sent: Friday, December 20, 2024 4:29 PM

To: Darrell White <DWhite2 @augustaga.gov>

Cc: Ron Lampkin <RLampkin@augustaga.gov>; Maria Rivera-Rivera <MRivera-Rivera@augustaga.gov>; Eric Bing
<EBing@augustaga.gov>; Scarlet Green <SGreen@augustaga.gov>; Arlene New <anew@augustaga.gov>; Audrey Sutton
<ASutton@augustaga.gov>; Nancy M. Williams <NWilliams@augustaga.gov>

Subject: Emergency Request - Carrie ] Mays

Good afternoon,

This communication serves as notification of an emergency at the following location:

-Carrie ) Mays

-A pipe has burst at this location requiring immediate attention. We are requesting approval to proceed
with Pamela’s Plumbing on an emergency basis to assess and correct this urgent situation.

Thanks,

Katie

Get Outlook foriOS

This e-mail contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee, you should not disseminate,
distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.
The City of Augusta accepts no liability for the content of this e-mail or for the consequences of any actions taken on the basis of the information provided, unless
that information is subsequently confirmed in writing. Any views or opinions presented in this e-mail are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent
those of the City of Augusta. E-mail transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed,
arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message which arise as
a result of the e-mail transmission. If verification is required, please request a hard copy version.

AED:104.1




Katie Cornelius

s

From: Timothy Schroer

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2025 8:42 AM

To: Scarlet Green; Rachel McFatridge

Cc: Maria Rivera-Rivera; Ron Lampkin; Arlene New; Katie Cornelius
Subject: RE: Emergency - Carrie J. Mays Plumbing

You can use the same job ledger

Timothy E. Schroer, CPA, CGMA

Interim Finance Director
Augusta Richmond County Georgia

| 535 Telfair St., Suite 800 | Augusta, GA 30901 | www.augustaga.gov
>4 tschroer@augustaga.gov | Office: 706.821.1741 | Mobile: 706.840.6226| Fax: 706.821.2520

From: Scarlet Green <SGreen@augustaga.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2025 8:41 AM

To: Timothy Schroer <tschroer@augustaga.gov>; Rachel McFatridge <RMcFatridge @augustaga.gov>

Cc: Maria Rivera-Rivera <MRivera-Rivera@augustaga.gov>; Ron Lampkin <RLampkin@augustaga.gov>; Arlene New
<anew@augustaga.gov>; Katie Cornelius <KCornelius@augustaga.gov>

Subject: RE: Emergency - Carrie J. Mays Plumbing

Hey Tim,

There was one more that was attached that is for Carrie J Mays HVAC cages. Could you provide me numbers for that?
The object code will be 53.19120.

Thank,
Scarlet

Scarlet Green | Business Analyst
Augusta - Richmond County | Central Services Department
2760 Peach Orchard Rd | Augusta, Georgia 30906
(p) 706-432-5254 | (c) 762-333-4654

sgreen@augustaga.gov 1 www.augustaga.gov

A

G RGIA

From: Timothy Schroer <tschroer@augustaga.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, January 15, 2025 5:41 PM

To: Scarlet Green <SGreen@augustaga.gov>; Lisa Sherrouse <Isherrouse @augustaga.gov>; Rachel McFatridge
<RMcFatridge @augustaga.gov>

Cc: Maria Rivera-Rivera <MRivera-Rivera@augustaga.gov>; Ron Lampkin <RLampkin@augustaga.gov>; Arlene New

]



<anew@augustaga.gov>; Katie Cornelius <KCornelius@augustaga.eov>

Subject: RE: Emergency - Carrie J. Mays Plumbing

The budgets have been set up.

I understand this was an emergency, however you should share with the vendor, that expecting payment the
day after the invoice was submitted is unreasonable. Also please note that | changed the obj code as the one
provided “site improvements” was not appropriate.

Ledger: JL
Report Date: 01/152023

Object  Description
224052114 Carrie J Mays Park

5319120 R & M-Buildings
Revenue & Transfers In:
Expenditure and Transfers Qut:
Net:
Grand Total (RV & TI):
Grand Total (XP & TO):

Net:

JL Budgets and Actuals with Fncumbrances Fiscal Year: 2(
Fiscal Period:

Budget Version: 1Y

Budget Actual Encumbrance Bal;

51,980.00 0.00 0.00 519
0.00 0.00 0.00

51.980.00 0.00 0.00 518

-31.980.00 0.00 0.00 518
0.00 0.00 0.00

51.980.00 0.00 0.00 318

-51,980.00 0.00 0.00 2518




