OFFICIAL

Bid Opening: Bid Iltem #24-203 Taxiway F Reconstruction
for Augusta, GA — Augusta Regional Airport
A Bid Date: Thursday, June 13, 2024 @ 3:00 p.m. via ZOOM

Total Number Specifications Mailed Out: 15
Total Number Specifications Download (Demandstar): 8

Total Electronic Notifications (Demandstar): 97
Georgia Procurement Registry:
Pre-Bid Conference Attendees: 17

Total Packages Submitted: 6

Total Noncompliant: O
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Summers Concrete
Contracting

5538 Coppage Road
Hahira, GA 31632

Yes

297608

Yes

Yes

Yes

$4,252,561.49

$3,197,391.30

No Bid

$1,043,717.50

$1,346,079.90

$6,765,134.94

No Bid

CW Matthews Contracting
1600 Kenview Drive
Marietta, GA 30060

Yes

32751

Yes

Yes

Yes

$4,148,812.75

$2,806,172.14

No Bid

$1,173,433.30

$1,182,890.60

$6,805,744.67

No Bid

Reeves Construction
1 APAC Industrial Way
Augusta, GA 30907

Yes

667047

Yes

Yes

Yes

$3,517,629.00

No Bid

$2,657,645.00

$876,200.00

No Bid

No Bid

$5,657,289.00

ER Snell Contractor
1785 Oak Drive
Snellville, GA 30078

Yes

22114

Yes

Yes

Yes

$4,728,389.80

$3,671,064.00

$2,376,552.00

$1,001,120.00

$1,551,444.50

$8,230,963.30

$5,371,684.30

Independence Excavating
5720 E. Schaaf Road
Independence, OH 44131

Yes

653545

Yes

Yes

Yes

$3,724,065.00

$4,688,822.50

No Bid

$854,810.00

$1,827,980.00

$6,559,570.00

No Bid

Precision 2000
2215 Lawson Way
Atlanta, GA 30341

Yes

144102

Yes

Yes

Yes

$5,125,012.00

$4,949,855.00

No Bid

No Bid

$2,214,625.00

$10,053,213.00

No Bid
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