

**AUGUSTA
UTILITIES
DEPARTMENT**

UTILITIES DEPARTMENT



Wes Byne, P.E.
Director

MEMORANDUM

TO: Andy Penick, Director – Procurement
Nancy Williams – Contract Compliance Administrator
Tywana Scott – Procurement Assurance Analyst
Audrey Sutton – Bid and Contract Specialist
April Payne – Bid Management Assistant

FROM: Wes Byne, Director – Utilities Department
Michael Bryant, Project Manager

SUBJECT: Warehouse Supplies (Bid Item #26-066) Recommendation of Award

Date: December 10, 2025

Attached is the bid tabulation result for the Warehouse Supplies Bid Item #26-066. It is our recommendation that the bid items be awarded to the compliant vendors as noted (highlighted) on the referenced spreadsheet. The decision to award is not solely based on price but also to those that best serve the department.

Thank you for your assistance with this request.

for Wes Byne 12/10/2025

Jess Thompson

12/10/2025

Wes Byne, P.E. – Director, Utilities Department

Date

Invitation To Bid

Sealed bids will be received at this office until Thursday, November 6, 2025 @ 11:00 a.m. **ZOOM Meeting ID: 966 517 3229; Passcode: 620177** for furnishing:

BID ITEM AUGUSTA UTILITIES DEPARTMENT - ANNUAL CONTRACT
COMMODITY CODE (Bid Items may have more parent codes)

No.	Bid Item Description	COMMODITY CODE (Bid Items may have more parent codes)
1	26-066 Warehouse Supplies	012-320-00; 012-560-83

Bids will be received by Augusta, GA Commission hereinafter referred to as the OWNER at the offices of:

Andy Penick, Director of Procurement
535 Telfair Street - Room 605
Augusta, Georgia 30901
706-821-2422

Bid documents may be viewed on the Augusta, Georgia web site under the Procurement Department **ARCbids**. Bid documents may be obtained at the office of the Augusta, GA Procurement Department. Documents may be examined during regular business hours at Augusta, GA Procurement Department.

All questions must be submitted in writing by email to procannualbids@augustaga.gov to the office of the Augusta, Georgia Procurement Department by Friday, October 31, 2025 @ 5:00 P.M. No bid will be accepted by fax; all must be received by mail or hand delivered.

To ensure timely deliveries, all submittals must be received during our normal office hours from 8:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday. No deliveries will be accepted prior to 8:30 a.m. or after 5:00 p.m., as the building is closed to the public and delivery services outside of these hours.

The local bidder preference program is applicable to this project. No bids may be withdrawn for a period of sixty (60) days after bids have been opened.

Invitation for bids and specifications. An invitation for bids shall be issued by the Procurement Office and shall include specifications prepared in accordance with Article 4 (Product Specifications), and all contractual terms and conditions applicable to the procurement. **All specific requirements contained in the invitation to bid including, but not limited to, the number of copies needed, the timing of the submission, the required financial data, and any other requirements designated by the Procurement Department are considered material conditions of the bid which are not waiveable or modifiable by the Procurement Director.** All requests to waive or modify any such material condition shall be submitted through the Procurement Director to the appropriate committee of the Augusta, Georgia Commission for approval by the Augusta, Georgia Commission. Please mark BID number on the outside of the envelope.

GEORGIA E-Verify and Public Contracts: The Georgia E-Verify law requires contractors and all sub-contractors on Georgia public contract (contracts with a government agency) for the physical performance of services over \$2,499 in value to enroll in E-Verify, regardless of the number of employees. They may be exempt from this requirement if they have no employees and do not plan to hire employees for the purpose of completing any part of the public contract. Certain professions are also exempt. All requests for proposals issued by a city must include the contractor affidavit as part of the requirement for their bid to be considered.

Bidders are cautioned that acquisition of BID documents through any source other than the office of the Procurement Department is not advisable. Acquisition of BID documents from unauthorized sources placed the bidder at the risk of receiving incomplete or inaccurate information upon which to base his qualifications.

Correspondence must be submitted via mail, or email as follows:

Augusta Procurement Department
Attn: **Andy Penick, Director of Procurement**
535 Telfair Street, Room 605
Augusta, GA 30901
Email: procannualbids@augustaga.gov

No bid will be accepted by email; all must be received by mail or hand delivered.

Andy Penick, Director of Procurement

Publish:

Augusta Chronicle October 9, 16, 23, 30, 2025
Metro Courier October 9, 2025

Attachment "B"		Vendor		Consolidated Pipes Supply		ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc.		Fortline Waterworks		Perguson Water Works	
Original		NO BID		3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906		1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909		4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909			
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description	Est. Qty.	Part Description	Est. Qty.	Part Description	Est. Qty.	Part Description	Est. Qty.	Part Description	
1	100	2" Corporation Stop, CC X MIP									
2	100	2" Corporation Stop, CC X FIP									
3	600	3/4" Curb Stop Female X Female									
4	600	3/4" Curb Stop Female X Compression (ex. AV McDonald 76102WQ Ford B41-233W-Q-NL)									
5	200	3/4" Curb Stop Compression X Compression									
6	600	3/4" Angled Curb Stops									
7	600	1" Curb Stop Female X Female									
8	600	1" Curb Stop Female X Compression (ex. AV McDonald 76102WQ Ford B41-233W-Q-NL)									
9	200	1" Curb Stop Compression X Compression									
10	600	1" Angled Curb Stops									
11	200	3/4" Service Elbow Comp/MIP Thread L84-333/4"									
12	200	1" Service Elbow Comp/MIP Thread L84-44 1" S									
13	200	3/4" Copper to Iron Compression/Compression C84-33 G									
14	200	1" Copper to Iron Compression C84-44 G									
15	200	3/4" Copper to Copper Compression/Compression C44-33 G									
16	200	1" Copper to Copper Compression/Compression C44-44 G.									
17	100	1-1/2" Ball Valve F x F B11-666									
18	100	2" Ball Valve B11-777									
19	500	Adapter, Meter, Brass 1" x 3/4"									
20	500	Bushing, Brass 1" IPS x 3/4" IPS									
21	100	3/4" Corp Stop, CC X Compression									
22	100	1" Corp Stop, CC X Compression									
23	75	3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple									
24	75	3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple									
25	75	1" PVC Female Adapter									
26	75	1" x 4" Brass Nipple									
27	75	1-1/4" x 4" Brass Nipple Pipe									
28	75	1-1/4" x 6" Brass Nipple									
29	75	1-1/2" x 4" Brass Nipple									
30	75	1-1/2" x 6" Brass Nipple									
31	75	2" x 4" Brass Nipple									
32	75	2" x 6" Brass Nipple									
33	75	3/4" Brass Nipple, Close									
34	75	1" Brass Nipple, Close									
35	75	1-1/4" Brass Nipple, Close									
36	75	1-1/2" Brass Nipple, Close									

VENDOR		Consolidated Pipes Supply 10887 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3205-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd Augusta, GA 30909
37	75	2" Brass Nipple, Close	NO BID	\$16.55	\$12.26
38	75	2" Brass Couplings	NO BID	\$26.00	\$22.14
39	75	2" Brass 90-degree elbow	NO BID	\$30.00	\$25.68
SUB-TOTAL				\$2,433.49	\$2,309.02
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$2,433.49	\$2,309.02
PVC Fittings (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description			
40	100	4" PVC Sewer Tee Wye Glue x Glue for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$10.45	\$10.50
41	100	4" PVC Sewer Threaded Clean Out Plug for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$4.00	\$4.00
42	100	4" PVC Sewer Female Adapter for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$6.50	\$6.50
43	150	6" PVC Sewer Threaded Clean Out Plug for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$19.85	\$19.00
44	150	6" PVC Sewer Female Adapter for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$30.70	\$30.00
45	200	6" PVC Elbow 45 for SDR35 Pipe Glue x Glue	NO BID	\$19.50	\$19.00
46	100	4" PVC Elbow 45 Glue x Spigot for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$24.88	\$25.00
47	100	6" PVC Elbow 22-1/2" Glue x Glue for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$71.55	\$69.00
48	100	4" PVC Elbow 45 Glue x Spigot for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$6.75	\$7.00
49	100	6" PVC Elbow 22-1/2" Glue x Glue for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$23.76	\$23.00
50	100	4" PVC Elbow 22-1/2" Glue x Glue for SDR35 Pipe	NO BID	\$5.50	\$6.00
51	50	4" Backwater Valve (Sewer), PVC	NO BID	\$120.00	\$100.00
52	50	6" Backwater Valve (Sewer), PVC	NO BID	\$550.00	\$475.00
53	75	8" x 6" Sewer Tee (glue type)	NO BID	\$79.73	\$76.00
54	50	Flange Kit, Brass, 1-1/2"	NO BID	NO BID	\$80.00
55	50	Flange Kit, Brass, 2"	NO BID	NO BID	\$88.00
56	20	2" C87 -77-NL Cplg MIX x PI PVC	NO BID	\$169.19	\$110.00
57	20	2" C17 -77NL Cplg RP XP (PVC)	NO BID	\$89.73	\$85.00
58	20	2" C77-77NL Cplg PI(PVC)	NO BID	\$169.19	\$110.00
59	100	2" C84-77G- NL CTS GT X MIP	NO BID	\$89.73	\$85.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$1,491.01	\$1,428.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$1,491.01	\$1,428.00
GALVANIZED FITTINGS, NIPPLE (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description			
60	100	3/4" X 2" Galv Nipple	NO BID	\$1.95	\$2.11
61	100	2" Galv All thread Nipple	NO BID	\$4.90	\$10.06
62	200	3/4" Galv Comp Coup (LS) Dresser	NO BID	\$12.50	\$16.33
63	200	1" Galv Comp Coup (LS) Dresser	NO BID	\$16.50	\$19.70
64	100	1-1/4" Galv Dresser Coupling	NO BID	\$20.65	\$27.11
65	100	1-1/2" Galv Dresser Coupling	NO BID	\$23.00	\$31.67
66	200	2" Galv Comp Coup (LS) Dresser	NO BID	\$35.00	\$40.94
SUB-TOTAL				\$114.50	\$147.92
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$114.50	\$147.92
Meter Couplings, Washers					
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description			
67	2000	3/4" Meter Coupling (5680 Hayes or Equal)	NO BID	\$7.25	\$9.00
68	400	1" Meter Coupling (5680 Hayes or Equal)	NO BID	\$11.75	\$12.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$19.00	\$21.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$19.00	\$21.00

VENDOR			Consolidated Pipes Supply 10887 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
Manhole Cover and Rings (NO LEAD)						
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description				
69	20	23-3/4" Locking Ring and Cover (Bolt Down)		NO BID	\$300.00	\$448.83
70	50	23-3/4" Manhole Lids (Cover only) Bolt Down		NO BID	\$160.00	\$165.00
71	20	23-3/4" Manhole ring and cover (Non-locking)		NO BID	\$285.00	\$357.00
72	50	23-3/4" Manhole Lids (Cover only) Non-locking		NO BID	\$160.00	\$140.00
73	60	1" Manhole Ring Riser 24"		NO BID	\$48.00	\$53.00
74	30	6" Cement Grade Ring		NO BID	\$60.00	\$100.00
75	30	4" Cement Grade Ring		NO BID	\$50.00	\$87.20
76	30	2" Cement Grade Ring		NO BID	\$40.00	\$75.00
77	15	1" x 23 3/4" Adjustable Ring		NO BID	\$75.00	\$300.00
78	15	2" x 23 3/4" Adjustable Ring		NO BID	\$85.00	\$300.00
SUB-TOTAL					\$1,263.00	\$2,026.03
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS					\$1,263.00	\$2,026.03
Fernco Coupling & Max Adaptors (NO LEAD)						
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description				
79	100	Fernco Coupling, 4" Clay x 4" PVC		NO BID	\$7.00	\$6.24
80	100	Fernco Coupling, 4" Concrete to 4" PVC		NO BID	\$7.00	\$6.74
81	100	Fernco Coupling, 4" PVC to 4" PVC		NO BID	\$7.00	\$6.24
82	100	Fernco Coupling, 6" Clay x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$15.00	\$13.35
83	100	Fernco Coupling, 6" Concrete x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$15.00	\$14.77
84	100	Fernco Coupling, 6" PVC x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$15.00	\$13.35
85	100	Fernco Coupling, 8" Clay x 8" PVC		NO BID	\$24.00	\$20.54
86	100	Fernco Coupling, 8" Concrete x 8" PVC		NO BID	\$24.00	\$22.18
87	100	Fernco Coupling, 8" PVC x 8" PVC		NO BID	\$24.00	\$20.54
88	100	Fernco Coupling, 10" Clay x 10" PVC		NO BID	\$31.00	\$30.83
89	100	Fernco Coupling, 10" Concrete x 10" PVC		NO BID	\$31.00	\$30.83
90	100	Fernco Coupling, 10" PVC x 10" PVC		NO BID	\$31.00	\$30.83
91	100	Fernco Coupling, 12" Clay x 12" PVC		NO BID	\$36.00	\$35.98
92	100	Fernco Coupling, 12" Concrete x 12" PVC		NO BID	\$36.00	\$35.98
93	100	Fernco Coupling, 12" PVC x 12" PVC		NO BID	\$36.00	\$35.98
94	100	Fernco Coupling, 6" Clay x 4" PVC		NO BID	\$17.00	\$15.68
95	75	Fernco Coupling, 6" PVC x 4" PVC		NO BID	\$17.00	\$15.68
96	200	Fernco Coupling, 8" PVC x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$25.00	\$24.79
97	100	Fernco Coupling, 8" Concrete x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$35.00	\$22.36
98	100	Fernco Coupling, 8" Clay x 6" PVC		NO BID	\$25.00	\$24.79
99	120	4" Max Adaptor		NO BID	\$98.35	\$87.35
100	100	6" Max Adaptor		NO BID	\$147.99	\$130.12
101	100	8" Max Adaptor		NO BID	\$195.00	\$171.45
102	100	10" Max Adaptor		NO BID	\$243.67	\$214.24
103	100	12" Max Adaptor		NO BID	\$292.32	\$257.02
104	100	6" Max Adaptor OS 6.27-8.10 OD		NO BID	\$171.51	\$150.80
SUB-TOTAL					\$1,606.84	\$1,433.51
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS					\$1,606.84	\$1,433.51

VENDOR				Consolidated Pipes Supply 10937 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Nike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
Sewer Saddles							
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description					
105	100	4" Sewer Saddle, Flexible			NO BID	\$60.00	\$52.00
106	150	6" Sewer Saddle, Flexible			NO BID	\$70.00	\$68.00
						\$130.00	\$120.00
						\$130.00	
SUB-TOTAL							
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS							
Join/Restraining Couplings (Hymax/Smith-Blair) (NO LEAD)							
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description					
107	150	2" Hymax Coupling (210/303) HC			NO BID	\$156.22	\$160.00
108	50	3" Hymax Coupling (346/433) HC			NO BID	\$206.07	\$220.00
109	20	4" Hymax Coupling (425/563) HC			NO BID	\$264.05	\$290.00
110	100	6" Hymax Coupling (642/768) HC			NO BID	\$349.70	\$375.00
111	100	8" Hymax Coupling (854/984) HC			NO BID	\$394.82	\$425.00
112	40	10" Hymax Coupling (1096/1226) HC			NO BID	\$537.03	\$540.00
113	40	12" Hymax Coupling (1315/1441) HC			NO BID	\$717.19	\$640.00
114	100	6" Hymax Grip Coupling (650/720) HC			NO BID	\$471.77	\$510.00
115	100	8" Hymax Grip Coupling (850/940) HC			NO BID	\$669.33	\$650.00
116	50	6" x 8" Hymax Restrained (Grip Reducer) Coupling			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
117	50	6" x 8" Smith-Blair Restrained Coupling			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
						\$3,706.18	\$3,810.00
						\$3,706.18	
SUB-TOTAL							
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS							
Valve Boxes and Tops (NO LEAD)							
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description					
118	296	6" Concrete Valve Box Pad			NO BID	\$17.00	\$22.00
119	100	1" Valve Box Riser			NO BID	\$19.00	\$21.00
120	100	1-1/2" Valve Box Riser			NO BID	\$24.00	\$24.00
121	100	2" Valve Box Riser			NO BID	\$25.00	\$27.00
122	50	3" Valve Box Riser			NO BID	\$33.00	\$44.00
123	50	4" Valve Box Riser			NO BID	\$37.00	\$52.00
124	25	Valve Box complete (with top), screw down			NO BID	\$95.00	\$100.00
125	25	Valve Box complete (with top), adjustable, screw down, 48"			NO BID	\$110.00	\$135.00
126	750	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Oval Standard (10x19) with read hole, "Heavy Duty" rated (Nitor - Read Rite)			NO BID	\$35.00	\$42.00
127	250	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Oval Standard (10x19) without read hole, "Heavy Duty" rated (Nitor - Read Rite)			NO BID	\$35.00	\$42.00
128	750	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Rectangle Standard with read hole, "Heavy Duty" rated (Nitor - Read Rite, B9X)			NO BID	\$38.00	\$48.00
129	250	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Rectangle Standard without read hole, "Heavy Duty" rated (Nitor - Read Rite, B9X)			NO BID	\$38.00	\$48.00
130	750	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Rectangle Standard with read hole, "Light Duty" rated with locating disc (Nitor - Read Rite, B9X)			NO BID	\$23.00	\$48.00
131	250	Meter Box, Top, Poly, Rectangle Standard without read hole, "Light Duty" rated with locating disc (Nitor - Read Rite, B9X)			NO BID	\$23.00	\$27.00
132	500	Meter Box, poly, rectangular, standard, Rhino-brand, model MB-16L			NO BID	\$29.00	\$24.50
						\$581.00	\$704.50
						\$581.00	
SUB-TOTAL							
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS							

VENDOR				Consolidated Pipes Supply 10887 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fontline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
Repair Bands (NO LEAD)							
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description					
119	50	Repair Band/Clamp, 1/2" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$22.35	\$22.00
120	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 3/4" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$22.59	\$22.00
121	50	Repair Band/Clamp, 1" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$23.76	\$23.00
122	75	Repair Band/Clamp, 2" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$27.67	\$26.00
123	50	Repair Band/Clamp, 1/2" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$47.91	\$46.00
124	50	Repair Band/Clamp, 3/4" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$48.06	\$47.00
125	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* CTS			NO BID	\$48.31	\$48.00
126	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 2" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$51.40	\$49.00
127	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1/2" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$22.50	\$22.00
128	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1/2" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$47.94	\$47.00
129	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$24.12	\$23.00
130	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$48.55	\$47.00
131	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1-1/2" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$27.17	\$24.00
132	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1-1/2" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$50.10	\$48.00
133	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1-1/4" x 3" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$24.73	\$48.00
134	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 1-1/4" x 6" Handband, Smith-Blair #244 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$49.14	\$48.00
135	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 2" x 15" (235-263) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$108.42	\$105.00
136	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 3" x 15" (346-370) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$124.28	\$122.00
137	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 6" x 15" (684-724) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$157.35	\$155.00
138	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 6" x 15" (656-696) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$150.18	\$145.00
139	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 6" x 15" (705-745) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$159.40	\$155.00
140	100	Repair Band/Clamp, 6" x 15" (684-764) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$226.91	\$225.00
141	75	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" x 15" (898-936) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$193.24	\$190.00
142	75	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" x 15" (970-1010) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$220.32	\$212.00
143	75	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" x 15" (854-894) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$187.68	\$152.00
144	75	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" x 15" (899-979) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$258.02	\$249.00
145	10	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" X 12-1/2" (899-999) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$291.13	\$285.00
146	10	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" X 15" (970-1010) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$287.23	\$278.00
147	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" X 7-1/2" (933-971) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$281.96	\$274.00
148	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" X 15" (899-979) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$577.17	\$560.00
149	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 8" X 12-1/2" (854-894) Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Redi-Clamp or equal* IPS			NO BID	\$157.35	\$155.00

VENDOR		Consolidated Pipes Supply 10887 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Blair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
150	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 10" X 15" (1110-1190), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$395.03	\$322.00
151	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 10" X 15" (1104-1144), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$241.30	\$235.00
152	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 10" X 15" (1134-1174), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$246.56	\$240.00
153	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 12" X 15" (1400-1440), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$291.13	\$285.00
154	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 12" X 15" (1370-1410), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$287.23	\$280.00
155	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 12" X 15" (1340-1380), Smith-Blair 226 Full Circle Repair Clamp or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$281.96	\$275.00
156	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 16"X15" (1715-1790), Smith-Blair 228 Full Circle Repair Clamp DI Lug or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$577.17	\$555.00
157	20	Repair Band/Clamp, 18"X15" (1923-1998), Smith-Blair 228 Full Circle Repair Clamp DI Lug or equal* IPS	NO BID	\$608.99	\$585.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$6,836.31	\$6,629.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$6,836.31	\$6,629.00
M.J. Valves - Open Left (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
158	40	6" M.J. Valve w/acc Open Left	NO BID	\$925.00	\$890.00
159	20	8" M.J. Valve w/acc Open Left	NO BID	\$1,450.00	\$1,418.00
160	40	2" Iron Body Valve w/2" Female Thread	NO BID	\$445.00	\$424.00
161	10	4" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Right)	NO BID	\$750.00	\$698.00
162	40	6" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Right)	NO BID	\$925.00	\$890.00
163	20	8" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Right)	NO BID	\$1,450.00	\$1,420.00
164	20	10" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Left)	NO BID	\$2,235.00	\$2,208.00
165	20	10" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Right)	NO BID	\$2,235.00	\$2,208.00
166	10	12" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Left)	NO BID	\$2,805.00	\$2,794.00
167	10	12" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Right)	NO BID	\$2,805.00	\$2,794.00
168	4	16" M.J. Valve w/acc and gearing (Open Right)	NO BID	\$10,225.00	\$8,650.00
169	4	16" M.J. Valve w/acc (Open Left)	NO BID	\$6,460.00	\$7,900.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$34,710.00	\$32,294.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$34,710.00	\$32,294.00
Tapping Saddles (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
170	30	2" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (235-256) Double Strap 313	NO BID	\$21.82	\$21.00
171	20	4" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (474-563) Double Strap	NO BID	\$40.11	\$39.00
172	50	6" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (684-760) Double Strap	NO BID	\$43.99	\$43.00
173	50	6" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (594-690) Double Strap	NO BID	\$42.80	\$42.00
174	50	6" x 2" CC Tapping Saddle (663-690) Double Strap	NO BID	\$50.84	\$50.00
175	30	6" x 2" CC Tapping Saddle (687-760) Double Strap 313	NO BID	\$52.02	\$50.00
176	24	8" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (796-872) Double Strap 313	NO BID	\$51.73	\$50.00
177	12	8" x 2" CC Tapping Saddle (854-1010) Double Strap	NO BID	\$62.36	\$60.00
178	36	8" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (854-1010) Double Strap	NO BID	\$55.88	\$55.00
179	12	10" x 2" CC Tapping Saddle (1061-1212) Double Strap	NO BID	\$74.20	\$74.00
180	12	10" x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (1064-1212) Double Strap	NO BID	\$63.35	\$63.00
181	12	12 x 1" CC Tapping Saddle (1262-1432) Double Strap	NO BID	\$63.83	\$63.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$622.93	\$610.00

VENDOR				Consolidated Pipes Supply 10837 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3708-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Bolaji Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS						\$672.93	\$610.00
Pipe: Galvanized, PVC and Copper Tubing (NO LEAD)							
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description					
182	1000	4" PVC SDR35 Sewer Pipe SDR35 w/Lub (Gasketed)			NO BID	\$2.75	\$2.01
183	3000	6" PVC SDR35 Sewer Pipe SDR35 w/Lub (Gasketed)			NO BID	\$6.00	\$4.62
184	2000	8" PVC SDR35 Sewer Pipe SDR35 w/Lub (Gasketed)			NO BID	\$10.00	\$8.39
185	2000	10" PVC SDR35 Sewer Pipe SDR35 w/Lub (Gasketed)			NO BID	\$15.00	\$13.05
186	1200	12" PVC SDR35 Sewer Pipe SDR35 w/Lub (Gasketed)			NO BID	\$20.00	\$18.78
187	200	16" DIP - Water			NO BID	\$12.00	\$10.35
188	1000	4" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$19.00	\$17.72
189	2000	6" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$27.90	\$26.59
190	2000	8" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$39.30	\$37.46
191	1000	10" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$51.00	\$49.00
192	1000	12" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$51.00	\$49.00
193	200	16" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$137.06	\$127.00
194	200	20" DIP - Water			NO BID	\$82.00	\$65.00
195	200	20" C900 DR18 Water Pipe			NO BID	\$2.40	\$2.45
196	2000	2" HDPE IPS DR3 Poly pipe roll - 300'				\$514.71	\$711.43
SUB-TOTAL						\$514.71	\$711.43
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS							
Tools & Miscellaneous Parts (NO LEAD)							
Items 172-177 need to be Razor Back Brand or like quality							
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description					
197	50	Square Point Open Back Blade 48" Fiberglass Handle (Razor Back Brand or like quality)			\$44.63	NO BID	\$37.00
198	50	Round Point Open Back Blade 48" Fiberglass Handle (Razor Back Brand or like quality)			\$36.80	NO BID	\$37.00
199	20	Fiberglass Closed Back Drain Spade Long Handle #47-602 (Razor Back Brand or like quality)			\$68.33	NO BID	\$61.00
200	20	Fiberglass Handle Forged Bow Rake #63-184 (Razor Back Brand or like quality)			\$44.00	NO BID	\$41.00
201	40	36" Manhole Hooks (Red)			\$49.80	\$36.50	\$39.00
202	12	Wooden Oak Handle Bush Axe (Razor Back Brand or like quality)			\$55.00	NO BID	\$49.00
203	50	3/4" pressure Reducing Valve (PRV) Watts or equal			NO BID	\$134.00	\$135.00
204	48	1" pressure Reducing Valve (PRV) Watts or equal			NO BID	\$186.00	\$186.00
205	20	3/4" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass			NO BID	\$18.00	\$15.00
206	20	1" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass			NO BID	\$27.00	\$19.00
207	20	2" Gate Valve (Hand) Brass			NO BID	\$65.00	\$52.00
208	25	"Mighty Probe" Probing Rod, 36" handle			NO BID	\$89.00	\$79.50
SUB-TOTAL					\$8,820.00	\$555.50	\$750.50
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS							
M.J. ELBOWS AND TEE'S (FUSION BONDED (AWWA C116) EPOXY COATED FOR WATER PIPE) (NO LEAD)							
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description					
209	4	6" M.J. Elbow 22-1/2 degree			NO BID	\$1200.00	\$1115.00
210	10	6" M.J. Elbows 45 degree			NO BID	\$130.00	\$126.00
211	8	6" M.J. Elbow 90 degree			NO BID	\$160.00	\$155.00

VENDOR			Consolidated Pipes Supply 10037 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Millie Padgett Augusta, GA 30909	Fortline Waterworks 1026 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
212	6	8" M.J. Elbows 22-1/2 degree		NO BID	\$190.00	\$185.00
213	6	8" M.J. Elbows 45 degree		NO BID	\$190.00	\$185.00
214	6	8" M.J. Elbows 90 degree		NO BID	\$235.00	\$230.00
215	6	10" M.J. Elbow 45 degree		NO BID	\$275.00	\$270.00
216	6	10" M.J. Elbow 90 degree		NO BID	\$365.00	\$360.00
217	10	6" x 6" x 6" M.J. Tee		NO BID	\$230.00	\$225.00
218	5	8" x 8" x 8" M.J. Tee		NO BID	\$345.00	\$340.00
SUB-TOTAL					\$2,240.00	\$6,984.62
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS					\$2,240.00	\$6,984.62
Mega Lug for DI and PVC Pipe (Smith-Blair) (NO LEAD)						
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description				
219	25	3" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$53.50	\$53.20
220	25	3" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$45.85	\$45.65
221	25	4" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$57.30	\$57.00
222	25	4" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$49.70	\$49.40
223	25	6" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$71.65	\$71.25
224	25	6" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$61.60	\$61.28
225	25	8" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$96.50	\$95.95
226	25	8" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$84.05	\$83.60
227	25	12" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$176.30	\$175.28
228	25	12" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$160.05	\$159.13
229	5	16" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$363.55	\$365.48
230	5	16" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$287.15	\$285.48
231	5	20" Mega Lug (for Ductile Pipe) Packs w/ acc		NO BID	\$473.45	\$470.00
232	5	20" Mega Lug (for PVC Pipe) Packs w/acc		NO BID	\$539.85	\$536.75
SUB-TOTAL					\$2,520.50	\$2,429.46
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS					\$2,520.50	\$2,429.46
Fire Hydrants (NO LEAD)						
Item #	Ext. Qty.	Part Description				
233	5	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 6" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$447.00	NO BID
234	10	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 6" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$447.00	\$439.80
235	5	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 12" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$510.00	NO BID
236	10	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 12" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$510.00	\$513.57
237	5	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 18" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$584.00	NO BID
238	10	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 18" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$584.00	\$597.78
239	5	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 24" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$648.00	NO BID
240	10	M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 24" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$648.00	\$633.15
241	5	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 6" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$438.00	NO BID
242	10	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 6" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$438.00	\$434.00
243	5	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 12" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$516.00	NO BID
244	10	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 12" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$516.00	\$455.00
245	5	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 18" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$585.00	NO BID
246	10	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 18" 8 Bolts		NO BID	\$585.00	\$548.57
247	5	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 24" 6 Bolts		NO BID	\$660.00	NO BID

VENDOR		Consolidated Pipes Supply 10837 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Peripson Water Works 4188 Belair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
248	10	Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant Ext 24" 8 Bolts	NO BID	\$860.00	\$854.93
249	20	Safety Flange Kit - M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant 6 Bolts	NO BID	\$235.00	NO BID
250	10	Safety Flange Kit - M&H 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant 8 Bolts	NO BID	\$250.00	\$198.94
251	10	Safety Flange Kit - M&H 4-1/2 Fire Hydrant	NO BID	\$250.00	\$175.71
252	10	Safety Flange Kit - Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant 6 Bolts	NO BID	\$240.00	NO BID
253	20	Safety Flange Kit - Mueller 5-1/4 Fire Hydrant 8 Bolts	NO BID	\$240.00	\$163.75
254	10	Safety Flange Kit - Mueller 4-1/2 Fire Hydrant	NO BID	\$230.00	\$160.71
255	10	Safety Flange Kit - American Darling	NO BID	\$120.00	\$377.60
256	5	Mueller 4-1/2 Fire Hydrant Ext 12"	NO BID	\$465.00	\$436.61
257	5	M&H 4-1/2 Fire Hydrant Ext 12"	NO BID	\$484.00	\$462.71
258	10	36" 5-1/4 x 36 Bury Fire Hydrant - Mueller	NO BID	\$2,700.00	\$2,925.00
259	10	36" 5-1/4 x 36 Bury Fire Hydrant - M&H	NO BID	\$2,850.00	\$2,925.00
260	25	48" 5-1/4 x 48 Bury Fire Hydrant - Mueller	NO BID	\$2,800.00	\$3,050.00
261	25	48" 5-1/4 x 48 Bury Fire Hydrant - M&H	NO BID	\$2,950.00	\$3,050.00
262	1	2" - 1/4 Post Fire Hydrant - M&H	NO BID	\$1,420.00	\$1,750.00
263	5	72" 5-1/4 x 72" Bury Fire Hydrant - M&H	NO BID	\$3,250.00	\$3,300.00
264	5	72" 5-1/4 x 72" Bury Fire Hydrant - Mueller	NO BID	\$3,100.00	\$3,300.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$30,460.00	\$26,555.83
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$30,460.00	\$26,555.83
BACKFLOW DEVICES (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
265	5	Watts 1" Double Check Valve Assembly	NO BID	\$240.00	\$210.00
266	5	Watts 1-1/2" Double Check Valve Assembly	NO BID	\$505.00	\$465.00
267	5	Watts 2" Double Check Valve Assembly	NO BID	\$510.00	\$574.00
268	5	Watts 1" Reduce Pressure Zone Assembly	NO BID	\$400.00	\$355.00
269	5	Watts 1-1/2" Reduce Pressure Zone Assy	NO BID	\$720.00	\$655.00
270	5	Watts 2" Reduce Pressure Zone Assembly	NO BID	\$790.00	\$725.00
271	5	Watts 3" Reduce Pressure Zone Assembly	NO BID	\$2,900.00	\$2,750.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$6,165.00	\$5,734.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$6,165.00	\$5,734.00
Additional Items (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
272	1000	Aquaphalt-brand 6.0 asphalt cold patch, 50 lb. pail	NO BID	\$40.00	\$38.00
273	500	Perma-Patch brand limestone-asphalt cold patch mix, 50 lb. pail	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.00
274	100	Fast Plug (Hydraulic Cement) 50 lbs	NO BID	\$37.00	\$38.00
275	120	WSCP Water Filter Can/Seal	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.00
276	30	WG24-PR-Whole-House-Water-Filter-Housing	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,060.00
277	200	16 oz Purple Primer/Cleaner	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.00

VENDOR		Consolidated Pipes Supply 10887 Old Atlanta Hwy. Covington, GA 30014	ET Industrial Supply Co., Inc. 3208-B Mike Padgett Augusta, GA 30906	Fortline Waterworks 1628 Barton Chapel Rd. Augusta, GA 30909	Ferguson Water Works 4188 Blair Frontage Rd. Augusta, GA 30909
278	2000	1 Pint Hot Blue Cement		NO BID	\$16.00
279	200	Rapid Set Mortar Mix, 55lb.		NO BID	\$9.75
280	125	Disposable Coveralls Large (Pack of 25)		NO BID	\$5.00
281	250	Disposable Coveralls X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$7.54	NO BID	\$5.00
282	1000	Disposable Coveralls 2X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$7.54	NO BID	\$5.00
283	1000	Disposable Coveralls 3X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$8.47	NO BID	\$5.00
284	1000	Disposable Coveralls 4X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$8.84	NO BID	NO BID
285	200	Disposable Coveralls 5X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$9.56	NO BID	NO BID
286	200	Disposable Coveralls 6X-Large (Pack of 25)	\$11.85	NO BID	NO BID
SUB-TOTAL			\$61.34	\$77.00	\$1,252.75
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS			\$61.34	\$77.00	\$1,252.75
Romac Couplings (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
287	20	8" ROMAC Macro COUPLING 8.60 - 9.75	NO BID	\$487.00	\$490.00
288	20	6" ROMAC Macro COUPLING 6.60 - 7.60	NO BID	\$432.00	\$432.79
289	20	4" ROMAC Macro COUPLING 4.40 - 5.60	NO BID	\$330.00	\$327.95
290	20	2" ROMAC Macro COUPLING 2.12 - 2.90	NO BID	\$200.00	\$194.11
291	20	8" ROMAC ALPHA Restrained Coupling 8.60-9.10	NO BID	\$749.00	\$730.25
292	20	6" ROMAC ALPHA Restrained Coupling 6.60-7.00	NO BID	\$580.00	\$565.39
293	20	4" ROMAC ALPHA Restrained Coupling 4.50-4.90	NO BID	\$430.00	\$410.50
294	10	8" Cap, Wide Ranged, Romac Alpha End	NO BID	\$536.00	\$476.95
295	10	6" Cap, Wide Ranged, Romac Alpha End	NO BID	\$384.00	\$341.04
296	10	4" Cap, Wide Ranged, Romac Alpha End	NO BID	\$300.00	\$271.09
297	10	6" x 8" ROMAC Restrained Coupling	NO BID	NO BID	\$582.35
SUB-TOTAL				\$4,428.00	\$4,822.42
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$4,428.00	\$4,822.42
Meter Resetters (NO LEAD)					
Item #	Est. Qty.	Part Description			
298	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X10", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$264.00	\$240.00
299	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X12", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$269.00	\$246.00
300	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X15", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$264.00	\$240.00
301	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X18", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$269.00	\$246.00
302	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X21", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$328.00	\$299.00
303	25	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X24", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$338.00	\$299.00
304	20	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X27", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$127.00	\$140.00
305	20	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X30", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$129.00	NO BID
306	20	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X12", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$133.00	\$146.00
307	20	Meter Resetter (NO LEAD), 1"X15", A.Y.McDonald or Ford brand preferred	NO BID	\$138.00	\$150.00
SUB-TOTAL				\$2,259.00	\$2,006.00
TOTAL ALL SECTIONS				\$2,259.00	\$2,006.00