
 
         C IT Y H AL L  

CITY OF ANGELS PO Box 667, 200 Monte Verda St. Suite B, Angels Camp, CA 95222 P: (209) 736-2181 

 
DATE:  February 18, 2025  

TO:  City Council 

FROM:  Steve Williams, Interim City Administrator 

 
RE: Agreement - Approving a Professional Services Agreement Extension of Time 

with Dewberry - Angels Camp Pedestrian & Bicycle Improvements Project. 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Approve a Professional Services Agreement Extension of Time with Dewberry - Angels Camp 
Pedestrian & Bicycle Improvements Project 
 
BACKGROUND: 
The City of Angels executed a professional services agreement with Drake Haglan & 
Associates in January 2017 (assigned to Dewberry Engineers Inc. 10/17/2019) for project 
management, reconnaissance and field surveys, preliminary engineering, environmental, 
community outreach, right-of way planning/engineering, and final design services for the Angels 
Creek Bicycle and Pedestrian Trail Project. The agreement was extended in 2022 anticipating a 
completion date by the end of 2024, assuming funding availability. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
The Angles Creek Bicycle and Pedestrian Trail (ACT) establishes a framework for a bicycle and 
pedestrian trail along Angles Creek within the City of Angels.  The proposed trail is 
approximately 5.1 miles in length starting at the intersection of Murphys Grade Road and 
Highway 4 Bypass and extends south to New Melones Reservoir.  
 
The project is being managed through a professional services agreement with Dewberry 
Engineers, Inc.  The most recent professional services agreement for the ACT Project expired 
at the end of 2024. 
 
During the 2023 and 2024 calendar years, much of the work on this project involved gaining 
clearances and approvals from a variety of state and federal agencies related to environmental 
studies.  Necessary clearances and approvals have been secured.  The project is now ready to 
move forward, however the professional services agreement with Dewberry Engineers, Inc, has 
expired. 
 
A related project is the Booster Way/Vallecito Road/East Angels Sewer Replacement Project.  
This project is also being managed through a separate professional services agreement with 
Dewberry Engineers, Inc.  The Booster Way/Vallecito Road/East Angles Sewer Replacement is 
a critical infrastructure Capital Improvement Project.  The Booster Way portion of the project is 
complete.  Dewberry has completed a preliminary set of plans for the Vallecito Road portion of 
the project. 
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Dewberry recognized that the Vallecito Road Sewer Replacement project and the ACT Project 
require coordination between the two Dewberry Project Managers.  The expiration of the ACT 
Project Professional Services Agreement is preventing the Vallecito Road Project from moving 
forward. 
 
Dewberry Engineers, Inc. has prepared an extension of the ACT Project Professional Services 
Agreement including measurable milestones to be used as a preliminary schedule.  The 
proposed extension will expire on June 30, 2027, which is when Right-of-Way acquisitions are 
expected to be complete. The ACT Project is expected to continue beyond June 30, 2027. 
 
According to Dewberry Engineers, Inc, milestone timeline, construction should begin in 2028. 
 
The Master Agreement for City Engineering Services between the City of Angels and Dewberry 
Engineers, Inc. concludes on June 30, 2025, unless extended by contract amendment.  
 
Article IV, Section C of that master agreement reads as follows: 

“The period of performance for each specific project shall be in accordance with the 
Task Order for that project. If work on a Task Order is in progress on the expiration date 
of this CONTRACT, the terms of the CONTRACT shall be extended by CONTRACT 
amendment prior to the expiration of the contract to cover the time needed to complete 
the task order in progress only. The maximum term shall not exceed five (5) years.” 

 
FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
None 
 
 
ATTACHMENTS: 
1) Dewberry Professional Services Agreement Extension 


